Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 06 November 2024 17:10

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: sminfra piyush; Manmeet Singh Bakshi; Hardeep Singh

Subject: FW: T1 dominos civil & interior invoice

Attachments: dominos civil & interior.xlsx; civil & interior bill dominos @ 85%.pdf; Civil And Interior Work.pdf

Dear Nimisha
Approved 85% for civil interior for DOMINOS

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Navneet Singh <navneet.sminfra@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 1:18 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manmeet Singh Bakshi <manmeet.bakshi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra.krishna@gmail.com; sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>

Subject: T1 dominos civil & interior invoice

Some people who received this message don't often get email from navneet.sminfra@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
please find attached the invoice and its supporting documents for dominos civil & interior work.



