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Trupti Dalvi

From: Sudipto Bose
Sent: 13 June 2024 16:28
To: Trupti Dalvi
Subject: RE: Invoice Approval - DS TECHWORKS SOLUTIONS PVT LTD - Kolkata

Dear Trupti, 
 
Please upload on Safal, will approve it there.. 
 
Regards, 
Sudipto 
 

 
 

From: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 13 June 2024 12:40 
To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Invoice Approval - DS TECHWORKS SOLUTIONS PVT LTD - Kolkata 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Kindly approve attached Invoice to upload on safal -  
 

TFSKPL DS TECHWORKS SOLUTIONS PVT LTD Projects Bought Out 50%TFSKPL/PO/23-24/000025 06-02-24 9,322  

TFSKPL DS TECHWORKS SOLUTIONS PVT LTD Projects Bought Out 50%TFSKPL/PO/23-24/000052 06-02-24 9,322  

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
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Trupti Dalvi 
Project Coordinator 
 


