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Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ashish Nagar
Sent: 23 October 2024 14:38
To: Urmila Jadhav; Nimisha Jadhav
Cc: Akshay Sharma; Ameet.Koomar; Shama Nair; Suraj Kumbhar; Ajit Yadav; Muskan Somani; PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO
Subject: RE: KFC MUM T1_RA01_Invoice_Picture Perfect
Attachments: 045 Semolina Kitchen.pdf; 20241011002418.pdf; RA1- KFC_30.09.24- Pikture Perfect.xlsx; Adobe Scan 23 Oct 2024 (5).pdf

HI Nimisha /Urmila  
 
Please find attached E Invoice signed copy for KFC T1  
Regards 
 
Ashish 
 

From: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 23 October 2024 11:34 
To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet.Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj 
Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Muskan 
Somani <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: KFC MUM T1_RA01_Invoice_Picture Perfect 
 
Dear Nimisha Mam, 
 
Please find attached Invoice (RA-01) for the MUM T1 KFC outlet with supporting documents to proceed further. 
 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Urmila Jadhav. 
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From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>  
Sent: 22 October 2024 20:05 
To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Fwd: Fw: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir/Ma'am,  
 
Please finds attached file for E-invoice and other supporting documents for RA bill 1 KFC. 
 
 
Thanks & regards, 
 
Pavan Sharma  
  

 
M: +918097344059 
M: +919699133757 
 
Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including 
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended 
recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are 
susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you 
are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion. 
Thank you. 
 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> 
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Date: Mon, Oct 21, 2024 at 5:07 PM 
Subject: Fw: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
To: piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com> 
Cc: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>, Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>, Ajit Yadav 
<ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> 
 

Send  e invoice  
 
Sent from Outlook for Android 
 

From: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 2:51:54 pm 
To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikram Kumar 
<vikram.kumar@semolinakitchens.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
 
Dear Ashish, 
  
Attached invoice (RA - 01) checked, please share Tax invoice (E - Invoice) for the same to proceed further. 
  
  
  
Thanks & Regards, 
Urmila Jadhav. 
  

From: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 20 October 2024 16:05 
To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikram Kumar <vikram.kumar@semolinakitchens.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
  
  
REMINDER  vendor is daily calling for payment  
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From: Ashish Nagar  
Sent: 18 October 2024 13:42 
To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
  
HI Urmila /Suraj 
  
Kindly update on the same . 
  
Regards 
  
Ashish 
  

From: Ashish Nagar  
Sent: 15 October 2024 12:03 
To: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
  
Hi Urmila  
  
As per attached measurement sheets please find revised corrected data  
  
Kindly check so that vendor can generate E Invoice for KFC T1  
  
Ok from my end  
  
Regards 
Ashish 
  

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>  
Sent: 15 October 2024 11:59 
To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
  
 
 
  
Thanks & regards, 
  
Pavan Sharma  
  

 
M: +918097344059 
M: +919699133757 
  
Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information including 
trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an intended 
recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails are 
susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If you 
are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail deletion. 
Thank you. 
  
  
On Mon, Oct 14, 2024 at 2:36 PM PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  
  
Please find attached files as requested. 
 
  
Thanks & regards, 
  
Pavan Sharma  
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M: +918097344059 
M: +919699133757 
  
Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information 
including trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an 
intended recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails 
are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If 
you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail 
deletion. Thank you. 
  
  
On Mon, Oct 14, 2024 at 2:29 PM Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Kindly share the attached summary in pdf format along with measurement sheet I had checked  
  

From: PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com>  
Sent: 14 October 2024 14:10 
To: Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Document from Ashish Nagar 
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 
  
Dear Sir,  
  
Please find attached file for tax invoice and working sheet. Please confirm the same, so that we can proceed with generation of E tax invoice. 
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Thanks & regards, 
  
Pavan Sharma  
  

 
M: +918097344059 
M: +919699133757 
  
Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information 
including trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an 
intended recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails 
are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. If 
you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail 
deletion. Thank you. 
  
  
On Fri, Oct 11, 2024 at 5:12 PM PIKTURE PERFECT DESIGN STUDIO <piktureperfectdesignstudio@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir,  
  
Please find the attached excel revised file as per JMR corrections made. 
 
  
Thanks & regards, 
  
Pavan Sharma  
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M: +918097344059 
M: +919699133757 
  
Disclaimer: This transmission (including any attachments) is intended solely for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential information 
including trade secrets which are privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law and/or subject to copyright. If you are not an 
intended recipient, any use, disclosure, distribution, reproduction, review or copying (either whole or partial) is unauthorized and may be unlawful. E-mails 
are susceptible to alteration and their integrity cannot be guaranteed. Pikture perfect design studio shall not be liable for this e-mail if modified or falsified. 
If you are not the intended recipient of this e-mail, please delete it immediately from your system and notify the sender of the wrong delivery and the mail 
deletion. Thank you. 
  
  
On Fri, Oct 11, 2024 at 5:08 PM Ashish Nagar <ashish.nagar@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Hi Pavan  
  
As per JMR  please find actual revised measurement sheet of KFC attached copy RA 1 sheet  
  
Regards 
  
Ashish 
  

 


