Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: 11 December 2024 16:04

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Subject: Fw: Invoices & Measurement Sheet

Attachments: Measurement Sheet.pdf; Extra work with measurements_Airport lounge updated.xlsx

Please upload.

Get Outlook for i10S

From: Prashant Dange <prashdange@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2024 2:14 PM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; amarjeet suri
<spacedesignerspvtltd@gmail.com>; Ravikant Gunagi <ravikant.gunagi@travelfoodservices.com>; Raghvendra Singh <rsb03@rediffmail.com>
Subject: Invoices & Measurement Sheet

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

HI Shashankji,

As discussed over the phone, sharing the invoice copy against the PO in the asked format.

Requesting your help in getting the payment released at the earliest

B Civil Work & WP Invoice.pdf

. Demolition Work Invoice.pdf



‘ Electrical Work Invoice.pdf
‘ FAS Invoice.pdf

‘ HVAC Invoice.pdf

‘ Interior Work Invoice.pdf
‘ Main Cable Invoice.pdf

‘ Plumbing Work invoice.pdf

Rgds,
Prashanth



