Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nazrul Mondal

Sent: 03 September 2024 15:06

To: Sabir Ali Shah; Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Binu Balachandran; Murchana Devi
Subject: Re: RA BILL ABC Bar Kolkata

Dear Nimisha,
Please process for payment.

Thanks,
Nazrul

Get Outlook for Android

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 2, 2024 3:44:52 PM

To: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: RA BILL ABC Bar Kolkata

You don't often get email from shahenterindia@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Find Attached the Tax Invoice for ABC Bar Kolkata please check and the process the payment



Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,

Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,
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On Fri, Aug 30, 2024 at 1:48 PM Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:
Dear Sabir,

Please find the attached sign-up copy of RA Bill at ABC Bar and submit the invoice for payment.

Thanks,
Nazrul

From: Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 22, 2024 2:49 PM

To: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RA BILL ABC Bar Kolkata




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Find Attached RA Bill for ABC Bar Kolkata please check and confirm

Thanks & Regards,

4111 Rustomjee Eaze Zone Mall, 2nd Floor, Opp ozone,

Malad (W), Mumbai 400 064,




