Trupti Dalvi

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Ms. Trupti,

Ajit Singh

18 May 2024 16:29

Trupti Dalvi

Rupali Pol; Santosh Tambe
RE: Invoice approval - TECHNOCRATS SECURITY SYSTEMS PVT. LTD. -Ahmedabad
324 DSC.pdf

As per Attached invoice material received.

Dear Ma’am,
Kindly approve the same.

Best Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, May 18, 2024 4:22 PM
To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>
Cc: Rupali Pol <rupali.pol@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Tambe <santosh.tambe@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Invoice approval - TECHNOCRATS SECURITY SYSTEMS PVT. LTD. -Ahmedabad

Dear Ajit ji,

Please Check and confirm the attached Invoice of TECHNOCRATS SECURITY SYSTEMS PVT. LTD.

SKPL V000292

Technocrats Security Systems
Private Limited

Payment

YES

ADV/23-24/000763

100%SEMOLINA/PO/23-24/000172

Thanks & Regards,
Trupti Dalvi
Project Coordinator







