Trupti Dalvi

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 29 April 2024 17:04

To: Trupti Dalvi

Cc: Santosh Tambe; Rupali Pol

Subject: RE: Invoice Submission - SWASTIK SYNERGY ENGINEERING PVT. LTD.- AHM
Attachments: Aj kitchen invoice.pdf

Dear Ms. Trupti,
Material Received and installed. Invoice attached with all sign and stamp.

Best Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Trupti Dalvi <trupti.dalvi@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, April 29, 2024 5:00 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@semolinakitchens.com>

Subject: Invoice Submission - SWASTIK SYNERGY ENGINEERING PVT. LTD.- AHM

Dear Ajit,
Kindly submit Invoice No. SSEPL/2885/23-24 against PO No. Semolina/P0O/23-24/000589 dtd. 07/03/2024 to upload on safal.
Thanks & Regards,

Trupti Dalvi
Project Coordinator



