Chennai Finance

From: Shruti Shroff

Sent: 02 December 2024 15:48

To: Chennai Finance

Subject: Re: Adyar Ananda Bhavan -Diwali gifts

Ok to process

Thanks & Regards
Shruti Shroff

Senior Manager-Finance
TFS Kolkata

From: Chennai Finance <chennai.finance@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Friday, November 29, 2024 6:08 PM

To: Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Adyar Ananda Bhavan -Diwali gifts

Dear mam,
PFA of invoice for Diwali gifts purchased at Adyar Ananda Bhavan.
Kindly check and confirm to process further.

Approval mail attached FYR.



Taxable

Gross

VENDOR Invoice Number Invoice Date value Taxes invoice Descriptior
value
ADYAR ANANDA BHAVAN CR246/250396 25 Oct 2024 183840 22061 205901 | DIWALI SWEET PURCHASE FOR DISTRIBUTION

Regards,
S. Aarthi.

tis



