Chennai Finance

From: Shruti Shroff

Sent: 29 November 2024 12:24

To: Chennai Finance

Subject: Fw: Vodafone CUG invoice- Oct'24
Attachments: Vodafone.pdf

PI process

Thanks & Regards
Shruti Shroff

Senior Manager-Finance
TFS Kolkata

From: Chennai Finance <chennai.finance@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Friday, November 29, 2024 12:13 PM

To: Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Vodafone CUG invoice- Oct'24

Dear mam,
PFA of Vodafone invoice FYR.

Kindly check and approve for further process

Taxable

VENDOR Invoice Number Invoice Date
value

Taxes

Gross
invoice
value

Descriptiol




| Vodafone Idea Ltd TNS0021124107092 25 Nov 2024 32350 5823 38173 | CUG CHR FOR THE MONTH OF OCT'24

Regards,
S. Aarthi.

tis



