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| GST INVOICE ]

ORIGINAL BUYER'S COPY

UNITED SUPPLY AGENCY

PRINTERS, STATIONERS, BLOCK MAKER, DRAWING EQUIPMENTS, PLASTIC EQUIPMETS ETC.
2A, Free School Street, Kolkata - 700 087, Phone : 2252 4594, 2252 6847, E-mail : usa_2a@rediffmail.com

m/s. TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PVT. LTD.

NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum, Kolkata

INVOICE : USA/G/ 190/2024-25

Buyer’s GSTIN No.:19AAECT8193L1ZJ

State Code _19

Date: 08.07.2024

St. DESCRIPTION HSN CODE | QUANTITY RATE LN
No. Rs. P
| 01 | STAINLESS STEEL TABLE PLATE - VEGETARIAN 7812 4 Nos. 150/- 600 |00
| 02 | STAINLESS STEEL TABLE PLATE - NON-VEGETARIAN 7812 4 Nos. 150/- 600 |00
// 03 | STAINLESS STEEL TABLE PLATE - RESERVED 7812 12 Nos. 150/- 1,800 |00
e oo 1ad PTEOIEY
frayel Foad Services KoIaia F¥t, T TrhoRRy
SECURITY IN-WARD
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7 7
DELIVERY CHARGES
Rupees three thousand five hundred forty only. . _.......cc.ccovorrvcrrecs e 3,000| 00
........................................................................................................................ T@-.9_ % 270100
........................................................................................................................ 65T @....9..% 270(00
GRAND TOTAL 3,540 |00
OUR BANK DETAILS : For ) SUPPLY AGENCY
GSTIN No. : 19AAAFU7692N1ZA| | CENTRAL BANK OF INDIA A \/
PAN No. : AAAEU7692N NEWMARKET BRANCH, KOLKATA uj
ACCOUNT NO. 1039704438 =
Subject to Kolkata Jurisdiction | IFSC CODE - CBIN0280105




ainjeudis

dvd

swen
Jadeuepy 19
uoSIABN Ul p3epdn

ainjeudis

awen
IAND uoelo]

aimeusis

sl

Jwen
14 ssauIsng uopeIn)

aunjeusis

swen
feaosddy vy

Aun SunRasy

ainleudis

sweN
Ja8euey 1o
Yy uosiae 1 pajepdn

unjeusis

Jwien
¢ D uonedo]

aineusis

Jwen
33ueuly ssauISNg UoNeIo]

.
aumeudis

L ) Iwen
didy vy

un Suniaysues)

oA ST

d

0fS )t Tl TR

W94 NN

710

“opvyd Tydel. jueis

Ha

‘WU U o/

A

L)

vl 7TVl el

oN [BuEs ON [2pon uojduIsag 1255y : Q139557 ONFIS
191U3) 1503/1211nQ 131U3) 350D/19)IN0
uonesoq uoted’ny
Au3 je297 Awug je8an

0] J9ysued),

w7~ WK

-23eq

‘weayxe| /yy Ag 20loaw Supesauad o) n_mmn B S8 pasn 3gq:

.\_ wo& EITSERETLT-TTE

12 [t Wiy SIUL spdoaal syl Suljepdn Joy

9duRul4 03 U3S 3q pinoys p3acsdde AIp ‘uiioy SiyL J3jsuel} 13sse Auedwiod-133u] ‘Ja4sUe.) ISSE (EUISIUL JO 3SBIUI BSN 3G O} ST WY S|YL

Wi04 Jaysues] 1assy




Fw: Approval of Steel Table Talkers for Lounge

Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>
Mon 7/15/2024 3:09 PM

To:Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

[I]J 1 attachments (2 KB)
Outlook-ugkrmti;

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Regs,

Priyo Ranjan Thoi
Travel Food Services

f

P

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 12:03 PM

To: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>; Risav Bhattacharyya
<risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb
<jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Required marketing Items for Lounge

ok

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

TEARS
el R T Y] i . o (e e

From: Priyoranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 27 June 2024 11:37

To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb <jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Rishav,



PFA the quotes for requirement of 12 pcs of each variant. Cost would be approx.4100/-. Pls arrange
for the cost approval to proceed further.

Regs,

Priyo Ranjan Thoi
Travel Food Services

pr

P

From: Jayanta Deb <jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 23, 2024 5:59 PM

To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhabesh Mondal
<bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>; Priyo Ranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge

Dear Risav & Purchase Team,

It's been 20 days we have received the product, please share deadline to receive the product.

Regards & Thanks,

JD

TERMINAL MANAGER

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Mobile: +91 8335032123

Email:- jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

YEARS
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From: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 23 June 2024 12:03

To: Bhabesh Mondal <bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb
<jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>; Priyo Ranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge
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I have looped in purchase kindly follow up with Priyo da . He is aware of the same .

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Bhabesh Mondal <bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 23, 2024 11:28:57 AM

To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose @travelfoodservices.com>;
Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb
<jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge

Dear Risav,

Following our last discussion, you mentioned that you would contact the purchasing department
regarding the SS tags. During our last conversation, you also inquired about the required size of the
SS tags over the phone. Please find attached a screenshot of your email requesting the purchasing
department for SS tags.

Regards,

Bhabesh

Asst. Manager, TFS KOL OPS
bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com

¢ +91914710885

From: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 23, 2024 10:37:52 am

To: Bhabesh Mondal <bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma(@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb
<jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge

The steel tags [ have already asked to talk to purchase . The tilt talkers already delivered kindly check

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Bhabesh Mondal <bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 23, 2024 10:22:17 AM

To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>;
Shailendra Singh <shailendra.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Jayanta Deb
<jayanta.deb@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Required marketing Items for Lounge

Dear Risav,
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We have received the Food Tags. Please update us on the remaining items, such as "allow us to change
the Buffet" Tilt Talker, SS Reserved Tags, and SS Veg & Non-Veg Tags.

Regards,

Bhabesh

Asst. Manager, TFS KOL OPS
bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com

¢ +91914710885

From: Bhabesh Mondal <bhabesh.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2024 9:31:40 pm

To: Risav Bhattacharyya <risav.bhattacharyya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Jyotilekha Sharma <jyotilekha.sharma(@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Das
<kunal.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Avijit Das <avijit.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Om Prakash Khan
<omprakash.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; KolTravel Club Lounge INT
<tfslounge.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Required marketing for Lounge

Dear Risav,

We required few marketing elements for all Lounges as mentioned bellow-

1. Tilt talker for Buffet Changing- Required quantity - 12 pcs

2. SS Tags for Buffet- Required quantity - 12 for both tags
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3. SS Reserved Tag- Required quantity - 8 pcs
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POCO

SHOT ON FOCO M3

4. Bellow mentioned Food Tags- Required quantity - 4 sets of each

POCO

SHOT QN POCD MT



Thanks & Regards,
Bhabesh

¢ +91 9147108885
@ +917319108034
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