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TROPICAL ELECTRIC ENGINEER

A.CD.C, Motor, Fan, Winding A.C, Fridge, Generator, Welding Set, pump,
Electrical Wiring, Mixci Grinder & All Other Equipments, Making, Repairing.

18/A, Ripon Lane, Kolkata - 700 016

GSTIN : 19BUQPS9468F1ZK
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ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING
CONTRACT

Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Tue 7/25/2023 3:33 PM

To:Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

[IJJ 3 attachments (1 MB)
IMG20220317151945.pdf; New Doc 2020-12-04 10.21.18.pdf; Tropical kolkata 23-24.docx;

FYI

Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Sent: 12 June 2023 16:26

To: Priyo Ranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@k-corp.in>; Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear Team

Kindly find attach AMC Draft approved share with partner
Along with sign and stamp please

Regards
Herambraj

From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 1:15 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Okay with me
Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000



From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Date: Monday, 12 June 2023 at 12:18 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose @travelfoodservices.com>, Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>, Shashank Mahadik
<shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear Sir

Please approve ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND
SERVICING CONTRACT

Service Provider : Tropical Electrical Engineer
Contract Tenure - 17-03-2023 to 16-03-2026

Location - Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd 1st floor, 83 NSCBI Airport, Kazi nazrul sarani, Kolkata -
700052

Note - The rate are same as per the last year contract, and it will be same for the next three
year ( Each year ) with vendor - Tropical Electrical Engineer

Payment Term:
e Total contract value is Rs 10300rs/ per month.

e GST @18% applicable extra

Payment within 1 month after submission of the Invoices.

Scope of Work
e Motor rewinding / Bearing Change / Servicing / Greasing

e Hood cleaning
e Supply and fitting of all spare parts as per requirement for properly working condition all time
e Response time 4 -6 hours

Inclusions:
. Travel Charges for technician to come to site

Place of Service:
e Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Itd(TFSKPL), International & Domestic Airport, Kolkata, India.

¢ Normally the equipment shall be serviced at above customer premises, if necessary the equipment shall me
moved to the workshop of the vendor for repair, The offsite expenses like transport, Packaging & Insurance
shall be paid by the TFSKPL.

Escalation Matrix:
e Contact Person: Mr Saurabh

e Mail Id. : tropical.e.engineer@gmail.com




e Contact Number: 9748867914,9073849250
The vendor will provide the details of the technician for preparation of Entry passes in prior.

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 1:36 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear Herambraj,
This AMC is very critical, Kindly close on urgent basis.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: Shashank Mahadik

Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2023 5:42 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-corp.in>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear Herambraj,
Kindly renew attached AMC on priority.

Regards,
Shashank Mahadik

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 20, 2023 9:54 AM

To: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Fw: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear Shashank,
The AMC contract of Hood motor is expiry on 16/03/2023.
| need to renewal with the same vendor. Please process the same on urgent basis.



With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 13 April 2022 08:35

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@copperchimney.in>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Priyo
Ranjan Thoi <priyoranjan.thoi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Okay with me

Best,

Gaurav Dewan
Sent from my iPhone

On 08-Apr-2022, at 12:16 PM, Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>
wrote:

Dear Sir

Your approval awaited on this

From: Sandeep Bhat

Sent: Thursday, March 24, 2022 3:08 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@copperchimney.in>

Subject: FW: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING
CONTRACT

Dear Sir

Please approve FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING contract for Kolkata

From: Shama Nair

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2022 6:40 PM

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shauvik Modak <shauvik.modak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Approved

Regards,
Shama Nair



From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 17 March 2022 17:20

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shashank Mahadik <shashank.mahadik@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Chandan Kumar Das
<chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Shauvik Modak <shauvik.modak@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING
CONTRACT

Dear Mam,

Please approve FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING contract for Kolkata .

From: Herambraj Sonawane

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2022 4:49 PM

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Salman Khan <salman.khan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: ANNUAL EXHAUST HOOD, DUCT, FRESH AIR UNIT CLEANING AND SERVICING CONTRACT

Dear sir
Please approve This agreement is entered into between Tropical Electrical Engineer,

Service Provider : Tropical Electrical Engineer,

Location : Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd 1st floor; 83 NSCBI Airport, Kazi nazrul sarani,
Kolkata - 700052

Tenure :17-3-2022 to 16-3-2023

Scope of Work
e Motor rewinding / Bearing Change / Servicing / Greasing

e Hood cleaning
e Supply and fitting of all spare parts as per requirement for properly working condition all time
e Response time 4 -6 hours

Inclusions:
° Travel Charges for technician to come to site

Place of Service:
e Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Itd(TFSKPL), International & Domestic Airport, Kolkata,
India.

e Normally the equipment shall be serviced at above customer premises, if necessary the
equipment shall me moved to the workshop of the vendor for repair, The offsite expenses like
transport, Packaging & Insurance shall be paid by the TFSKPL.

Escalation Matrix:
e (Contact Person: Mr Saurabh

e Mail Id. : tropical.e.engineer@gmail.com

e Contact Number: 9748867914,9073849250



The vendor will provide the details of the technician for preparation of Entry passes in prior.

Payment Term:
e Total contract value is Rs 10300rs/ per month.

e GST @18% applicable extra

e Payment within 1 month after submission of the Invoices.

Thanks and Regards
Herambraj Sonawane
Executive - Purchase
9702415737



