Arijit Bera

From: Mona Agarwal

Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2024 3:19 PM
To: Arijit Bera

Subject: RE: TTMS - ITC Reconciliation April 24
Approved

From: Arijit Bera <arijit.bera@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 27 August 2024 02:37 PM

To: Mona Agarwal <mona.agarwal@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: TTMS - ITC Reconciliation April 24

Dear Madam,

Please approve the attached ITC reconciliation invoice of TFSKPL, TFSCPL, TRS & TFS(R&R) April 24 for process payment.

In case of any queries, feel free to revert.

Thanks & Regards,
Arijit Bera

Travel Food Services



