
Tax Invoice

RAHUL MENS WEAR
R.C BARRACK NO.25 ,SHOP  NO.3, NEAR
JAI SHANKAR HALL , BHAJI MARKET ,CHEMBUR
CAMP MUMBAI-400074
GSTIN/UIN: 27AIFPP5649F1ZZ
State Name :  Maharashtra, Code : 27
E-Mail : pawanpandey681@gmail.com

Consignee (Ship to)

TFS (R&R) WORKS PVT LTD
129, MILESTONE,NH-8 NEAR HAMJAPUR
BEHROR, ALWAR
RAJASTHAN 301701
GSTIN/UIN : 08AADCTI597R1ZH
State Name : Rajasthan, Code : 08

Buyer (Bill to)

TFS (R&R) WORKS PVT LTD
129, MILESTONE,NH-8 NEAR HAMJAPUR
BEHROR, ALWAR
RAJASTHAN 301701
GSTIN/UIN : 08AADCTI597R1ZH
State Name : Rajasthan, Code : 08

Invoice No.
2023-24/28
Delivery Note

Reference No. & Date.
115  dt. 23-Mar-23
Buyer’s Order No.

Dispatch Doc No.
Pcs
Dispatched through

Bill of Lading/LR-RR No.
1009013 dt. 13-Apr-23

Dated
12-Apr-23
Mode/Terms of Payment

Other References

Dated

Delivery Note Date

Destination

Motor Vehicle No.

Terms of Delivery

Sl Description of Goods AmountDisc. %perRateQuantityHSN/SAC

No.

1 SHIRTS 1,324.00pcs331.004 pcs
FULL SLEEVE WHITE 40/4

2 SHIRTS 3,150.00pcs315.0010 pcs
HALF SLEEVE WHITE
40/6,42/4

3 Trouser 4,200.00pcs420.0010 pcs
BLACK 32/6,34/4

4 T-Shirt 9,010.00pcs265.0034 pcs
S/10,M/18,L/6

5 Cap 1,240.00pcs62.0020 pcs6505
6 APRON 2,200.00pcs110.0020 pcs

HALF
7 Chef Coat 1,996.00pcs499.004 pcs

WHITE CDP 40/4
8 Trouser 2,520.00pcs420.006 pcs

CHEF CDP 36/6
9 Chef Coat 7,360.00pcs368.0020 pcs

COMMI WHITE
38/4,40/10,42/6

10 Chef Coat 6,624.00pcs368.0018 pcs
COMMI BLACK
38/4,40/10,42/6

11 Trouser 12,958.00pcs341.0038 pcs
COMMI CHEF
30/4,32/18,34/10,36/6

continued ...

This is a Computer Generated Invoice

CT0031
Revised



Tax Invoice(Page  2)

RAHUL MENS WEAR
R.C BARRACK NO.25 ,SHOP  NO.3, NEAR
JAI SHANKAR HALL , BHAJI MARKET ,CHEMBUR
CAMP MUMBAI-400074
GSTIN/UIN: 27AIFPP5649F1ZZ
State Name :  Maharashtra, Code : 27
E-Mail : pawanpandey681@gmail.com

Consignee (Ship to)

TFS (R&R) WORKS PVT LTD
129, MILESTONE,NH-8 NEAR HAMJAPUR
BEHROR, ALWAR
RAJASTHAN 301701
GSTIN/UIN : 08AADCTI597R1ZH
State Name : Rajasthan, Code : 08

Buyer (Bill to)

TFS (R&R) WORKS PVT LTD
129, MILESTONE,NH-8 NEAR HAMJAPUR
BEHROR, ALWAR
RAJASTHAN 301701
GSTIN/UIN : 08AADCTI597R1ZH
State Name : Rajasthan, Code : 08

Invoice No.
2023-24/28
Delivery Note

Reference No. & Date.
115  dt. 23-Mar-23
Buyer’s Order No.

Dispatch Doc No.
Pcs
Dispatched through

Bill of Lading/LR-RR No.
1009013 dt. 13-Apr-23

Dated
12-Apr-23
Mode/Terms of Payment

Other References

Dated

Delivery Note Date

Destination

Motor Vehicle No.

Terms of Delivery

Sl Description of Goods AmountDisc. %perRateQuantityHSN/SAC

No.

12 APRON 3,160.00pcs158.0020 pcs
CHEF FULL SIZE

55,742.00

Output IGST 5% Tax 2,787.10%5
Less : Round Off (-)0.10

Total ₹ 58,529.00204 pcs

Amount Chargeable (in words) E. & O.E

INR Fifty Eight Thousand Five Hundred Twenty Nine Only

HSN/SAC TotalIntegrated TaxTaxable
Tax AmountAmountRateValue

2,725.102,725.105%54,502.00
6505 62.0062.005%1,240.00

Total 2,787.102,787.1055,742.00

Tax Amount (in words)  : INR Two Thousand Seven Hundred Eighty Seven and Ten paise Only

Declaration
We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of 
the goods described and that all particulars are true and 

Company’s Bank Details
A/c Holder’s Name : RAHUL MENS WEAR
Bank Name : Janakalyan Sahakari Bank (Current)
A/c No. : 011011300002435
Branch & IFS Code : Chembur & JSBL0000011

Customer’s Seal and Signature for RAHUL MENS WEAR

Authorised Signatory

This is a Computer Generated Invoice
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Invoices TFS

From: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 February 2024 13:35
To: Invoices TFS
Subject: Re: FW: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT
Attachments: TFS (R & R )-28.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 

BILL-28  
 
On Tue, 20 Feb 2024 at 18:12, Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Hi Rubi, 

  

   Please correct GSTN & share fresh copy.. 

  

From: Invoices TFS  
Sent: 02 June 2023 18:55 
To: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com> 
Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT 
Importance: High 

  

Ruby Mam, 
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      Please change bill as per attached GST Certificate… attached out all location’s GST Certificate for your reference… 

  

  

 

  

From: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com>  
Sent: 31 May 2023 13:12 
To: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT 
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THIS IS SKPL OUTSTANDING DETAIL & WE REQUEST TO DO PAYMENT AS SOON AS POSSIBLE  

  

--  

Thanking You, 

Rahul Mens Wear 

9820477315 

 
 
 
--  

Thanking You, 

Rahul Mens Wear 

9820477315 
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Invoices TFS

From: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com>
Sent: 21 February 2024 13:35
To: Invoices TFS
Subject: Re: FW: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT
Attachments: TFS (R & R )-28.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 

BILL-28  
 
On Tue, 20 Feb 2024 at 18:12, Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Hi Rubi, 

  

   Please correct GSTN & share fresh copy.. 

  

From: Invoices TFS  
Sent: 02 June 2023 18:55 
To: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com> 
Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT 
Importance: High 

  

Ruby Mam, 

  



2

      Please change bill as per attached GST Certificate… attached out all location’s GST Certificate for your reference… 

  

  

 

  

From: Pawan Pandey <pawanpandey681@gmail.com>  
Sent: 31 May 2023 13:12 
To: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Santosh Sawant <santosh.sawant@k-corp.in>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: REQUEST FOR PAYMENT 
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THIS IS SKPL OUTSTANDING DETAIL & WE REQUEST TO DO PAYMENT AS SOON AS POSSIBLE  

  

--  

Thanking You, 

Rahul Mens Wear 

9820477315 

 
 
 
--  

Thanking You, 

Rahul Mens Wear 

9820477315 


