Purchase Order

Order Number PO/BG232400129
Shipped Location

Travel Food Services

Vendor No. V0000444
Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited

TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited
TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited

A-7/119, Industrial Area SSGT Road, Haridwar Food Plaza,Adj to Crystal World

Invoice Location

TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited
TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited
Haridwar Food Plaza,Adj to Crystal
World

Roorkee NH-58 Batedi
Rajputana,Shantashah

Page No: 1
11-12-2023 18:49:02
Corporate Address
TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited

Haridwar Food Plaza, Adj to Crystal World,
Haridwar Roorkee NH-58, Haridwar

Uttarakhand, 249405

Ghaziabad, Uttar Pradesh Roorkee NH-58 Batedi Rajputana,Shantashah 249405 State 05
GHAZIABAD, India 201001 Uttarakhand, India 249405 India State Name Uttarakhand
India India IN Comp GST No. 05AADCT1597R1ZN
P.AN. No. AAKCM8204H Contact Person
State Code Contact No. bhagaliva@ food Requisition No.
E-Mail gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoods gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.c
ervices.com om PO Entry Date 11-12-2023
Vendor GST No. 09AAKCM8204H1ZA ETA: Payment Terms
Vendor Inv. No. Order Address GSTIN 05AADCT1597R1ZN Project ID
Vendor Fax No. No. PO Type Capex-NSO
Yandawr Crhraail FirnanmanMraitorralh i
HSN\SAC Total Tax Total Amount
SNo Item Code Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UoM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 7000204 84145910 AIR CURTAIN (ASP 2100 AP) - 4ft NOS 17,600.00 1 18.00  0.00 0 17600.00
Total Unit 1.00
Payment term - 100% advance with GST. Freight Extra at actual. Warranty- one year from invoice date. Outlet Name - Total Taxable INR 17,600.00
Bikarnerwala.
Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 3,168.00
a) Products to be Supplied by b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier at own cost
c) Delivery schedule to be d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 0.00
taken from the Buyer before  DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or
the GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 20,768.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority. If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at

the earliest. Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Swapnil Sutar

From: Abdul Rehman

Sent: 11 December 2023 18:36

To: Swapnil Sutar

Subject: FW: Wakhnaghat & Bollywood gully - Dominos PO - Mitzwah

Attachments: 10829 invoice.pdf; 10555 Invoice.pdf; TFS Ledger 0311.pdf; POBG232400025 Bollywood Gully — Banur - Dominos.pdf

Thanks & Regards,
Abdul Rehman

H | & +919920292129
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Mitzvah - 9211092110 <salesl@mitzvah.in>

Sent: 03 November 2023 18:28

To: Manish Kumar-New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Sales9.mitzvah@gmail.com; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>;
Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Chandan Ram <chandan.ram@travelfoodservices.com>; Pratap Singh <pratap.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Rituparn Sharma
<Rituparn.sharma@travelfoodservices.com>; Kunal Goswami <kunal.goswami@travelfoodservices.com>; Sales Coordinator Mitzvah <sales9@mitzvah.in>

Subject: Re: Wakhnaghat & Bollywood gully - Dominos PO - Mitzwah

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached Invoice and Clear Outstanding Payment
and please return my 4ft machine

still not received in factory

Thank You

On Fri, Nov 3, 2023 at 5:24 PM Mitzvah - 9211092110 <sales1@mitzvah.in> wrote:

Dear Team,

Please process balance payment.



Thank you

On Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 3:59 PM Mitzvah - 9211092110 <sales1@mitzvah.in> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached Invoice
Thank You

On Mon, Jul 24, 2023 at 6:07 PM Manish Kumar-New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi Concerned,

Please raise this bill on TFS Bollywood Gully with the attached GST details. The Air Curtain was used in the back of Bikanervala.

@Abdul, kindly create a purchase order for this expense. We will recover this cost from the landlord in future commercial agreements.

Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Best regards,

Manish Kumar

Manager- Projects & Maintenance



Travel Food Services

504, Regus, Level — 5
Caddie Commercial Tower,
Hospitality District Aerocity ,
New Delhi - 110037

+91-9899498693 / +91- 8828303889

Confidentiality Caution: This communication (including any attached documents) is intended only for the use of the addressee(s) and may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information. No confidentiality or privilege is waived or lost by any mis-transmission or error and it
should not be used by anyone not being the intended recipient. If you receive this message in error, please immediately delete it and all copies of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not, directly or indirectly, use, disclose, distribute, print, or copy any
part of this message if you are not the intended recipient. Any unauthorized use or any misuse of this ication, including attach may result in punitive action under law.

Disclaimer: The recipient acknowledges that K Hospitality Corp may be unable to exercise control or ensure or guarantee the integrity of the text of the email message and the text is not warranted as to completeness and accuracy. The views expressed in this email are those of the sender and not
necessarily that of K Hospitality Corp. Before opening and ing the h if any, please check and scan for viruses. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error or virus-free. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions. K Hospitality
Corp may monitor and record all emails.

From: Mitzvah - 9211092110 <salesl@mitzvah.in>
Sent: 24 July 2023 05:32 PM




To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Kumar-
New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Sales9.mitzvah@gmail.com

Subject: Re: Wakhnaghat & Bollywood gully - Dominos PO - Mitzwah

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

We haven't received 4 ft Air Curtain Machine

Please dispatch this machine to our factory address

and share docket details.

Thank You

On Thu, Jul 6, 2023 at 11:36 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman(@Xk-corp.in> wrote:

Hi Radha,

As discussed with Manish, we required 1000 mm size air curtain at our Bollywood gully location.



Existing curtain which is delivered at the site will be sent back by Manish.

Request you to kindly despatch the same at the earliest.

Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

| & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Sent: 16 June 2023 20:26

To: Mitzvah - 9211092110 <salesl@mitzvah.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Kumar-
New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Wakhnaghat & Bollywood gully - Dominos PO - Mitzwah

Hi Radha,

As discussed pfb details for billing and shipping details



Location Brand| Site Locations address |Contact Person|Contact No GST No Remarks

TFS (R&R Works) Pvt. Ltd.
Chandigarh royal city,
Chandigarh Patiala Highway,
Bollywood Gully — Banur|Dominos| Village Karala, Punjab — 140601 Anil Patial 787165833 03AADCT1597R1ZR

TFS (R&R) Works Private Limited
Near Bahara University, Waknaghat
Tehsil-Kandaghat, Dist-SOLAN
Waknaghat — Shimla |Dominos 173234 Kamal 8527821440 [02AADCTI1597R1ZT

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Abdul Rehman

Sent: Tuesday, May 30, 2023 11:58:15 AM

To: Mitzvah - 9211092110 <salesl@mitzvah.in>

Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Manish Kumar-
New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Wakhnaghat & Bollywood gully - Dominos PO - Mitzwah




Dear Radha,

Please find attached Bollywood Gully & Wakhnaghat PO.

The payment for this order is currently being processed.

Kindly prepare the material for dispatch and hold it until the payment is confirmed in your account.

Please arrange for the deliveries as soon as the payment is reflected.

Location Brand Equipment Qty|Category PO No Vendor
Waknaghat — Shimla Dominos|AIR CURTAIN-4Ft - with Censor 1 Air Curtain |PO/HMP232400012|Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited
Waknaghat — Shimla Dominos |LIMIT SWITCH -MAGNETIC SINGLE FLAP|1 Air Curtain |PO/HMP232400012|Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited
Bollywood Gully — Banur|Dominos|AIR CURTAIN-4Ft - with Censor 1 |Air Curtain [PO/BG232400025 |Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited
Bollywood Gully — Banur|Dominos |LIMIT SWITCH -MAGNETIC SINGLE FLAP|1 Air Curtain |PO/BG232400025 |Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited

Thanks & Regards,




Abdul Rehman

B | & +91 9920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

Angel

at Mitzvah Engg (India) Pvt Ltd

A B 8, Block B, Industrial Area, Sector 62
Noida, U.P.-201309
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13597+ Customers 179537 + Installations
22 Models in 7 Sizes 22+ Years in Business
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SINGLE VENDOR DECLARATION

Date: 11-12-2023

PO No:PO/BG232400129

PO Amt : 17600 ( Without GST)
20768 ( With GST)

Vendor Name:Mitzvah Engg India Private Limited

Product Description: Air curtain 4 ft

Unit / Project Name: Bollywood gullly Bikarnerwala.

Justification:

Only known supplier. (List of the suppliers which were contacted below
and the specific reasons why each was not a viable source).

Only known qualified supplier or item. (List the qualifications that each
source or items meet. If another supplier offers a similar item, provide the
item identification, supplier information and comparable pricing).

Supplier proprietary item. (The selected supplier is the only manufacturer
of this item. List the reasons why no substitute item can be used and if no
similar item is available)

Franchise / Management / User Dept Directed. (Provide a copy of letter,
or memo or e-mail specifically directing this source) Brand approved
vendor, No price change hence releasing the PO

Item / Rate Contracted. (Provide copy of the contract / agreement)

Prepared By

Approved By




