Travel Food Services

Vendor No. V0002485

Purchase Order
Order Number HO/PO/23-24/000139

Shipped Location Invoice Location
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE
LIMITED

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
Block-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar

Page No: 1
9/22/2023 6:45:54 PM

Corporate Address
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

Block-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar
Estate

ASSISTO TECHNOLOGIES PRIVATE LIMITED Block-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar Estate Estate Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli Mumbai
C 1303 ACE ASPIRE TECH ZONE 4 GREATER NOIDA Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli Mumbai Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli Mumbai MUMBAI, 400018
WEST, GREATER WEST NOIDA, UTTAR PRADESH MUMBAI, India 400018 400018 State 27
NOIDA, India 201306 India India State Name Maharashtra
India IN Comp GSTNo.  27AADCB2762L1ZI
P.AN. No. AAUCA6182G Contact Person
State Code
Contact No. bhagaliva@travelfood Requisition No.
E-Mail gaurav.bhagaliya@travelloods  gayrav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.c
ervices.com om PO Entry Date 9/22/2023
Vendor GST No. 09AAUCA6182G1Z5 ETA: Payment Terms
Vendor Inv. No. Order Address GSTIN 27AADCB2762L1ZI Project ID GEN
Vendor Fax No. No.
Vendar Fmail arcnnintefMaccictn tach
HSN\SAC Total Tax Total Amount
SNo Item Code Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UoM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 7000063 84730000 IT Softwares Email Analytics & Automation NOS 497,000.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 497000.00
Total Unit 1.00
Payment term - 100% advance along with GST Delivery - Immdiate Location - TFS HO - mumbai Total Taxable INR 497,000.00
Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 89,460.00
a) Products to be Supplied by b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier at own cost
c) Delivery schedule to be d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 0.00
taken from the Buyer before  DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or
the GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 586,460.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority. If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at
the earliest. Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Amit Upadhyay

From: Parag Pandey

Sent: 17 October 2023 13:09

To: Amit Upadhyay; Anil Nayak; Siddhesh Dolas

Subject: FW: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Attachments: FW: PO FOR Email Analytics & Automation; TFSPL-139-23-24 ASSISTO TECHNOLOGIES

PRIVATE LIMITED-EMAIL AUTOMATION.pdf

Hi Team,
Please process the advance payment today as per attached PO.

Regards,
Parag Pandey

From: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 17 October 2023 13:06

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Approved.

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, October 16, 2023 11:05 AM

To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Vikas,

Will need your approval for processing the advance
Regards,

Nikhil

+91 9820171661

From: Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 22 September 2023 11:50

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Ok from my side

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, September 22, 2023 11:28 AM

To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Vikas, Vipul,
PFA the go-ahead from Varun

Will request you to please share the Business Finance and Business Head approvals, as required by SAFAL (purchase to
issue the PO)

Regards,
Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Sent: 21 September 2023 12:50




To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>;
Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Nikhil,

Request you kindly share the BH and BF approval on said requirement. And also request you to share the said
requirement via Safal.

Regards,
Lovejot.

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 21, 2023 12:31 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: FW: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Lovejot,
As discussed, this will be a single vendor quotation
Regards,

Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>
Sent: 21 September 2023 12:12
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Nikhil,
Rephrased.

Thanks and regards,
Sakshi

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 21 September 2023 11:42
To: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Sakshi,

2.98 lac is the annual license cost or 2 years license cost? Rephrase, as for now it seems 2.98 is annual cost which | will
need to pay again for year 2

Regards,

Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>
Sent: 21 September 2023 11:09
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.




Hi Nikhil,

Referring to our today's discussion, here is the revised proposal with license fee for 2 yrs included and 1 time
set up cost.

Request for the earliest payment.

Thanks and regards,
Sakshi Jain

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>

Sent: 09 September 2023 15:44

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: RK <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Hi Nikhil,

Please find this in continuation to our discussion with Varun today.
I have enclosed the revised commercial proposal and would request your time for a discussion with our delivery
team to start the roll out from Monday.

Look forward to receiving the purchase order.

Warm Regards,
Sakshi Jain

From: Sakshi Jain
Sent: 06 September 2023 10:09
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Hi Nikhil,
Inline to our last discussion at your office, please find enclosed the commercial proposal along with the
tentative execution timelines for Email Analytics, Response Automation and process automation for customer

queries.

Please confirm your availability for today or Friday in your office to conclude the same.
I am arriving Mumbai today afternoon.

Look forward to your response.

Warm Regards,
Sakshi Jain



Amit Upadhyay
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Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Approved.

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, October 16, 2023 11:05 AM

To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation
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Will need your approval for processing the advance
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From: Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 22 September 2023 11:50

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Ok from my side

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, September 22, 2023 11:28 AM

To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Vikas, Vipul,
PFA the go-ahead from Varun

Will request you to please share the Business Finance and Business Head approvals, as required by SAFAL (purchase to
issue the PO)

Regards,
Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Sent: 21 September 2023 12:50




To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>;
Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Nikhil,

Request you kindly share the BH and BF approval on said requirement. And also request you to share the said
requirement via Safal.

Regards,
Lovejot.

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, September 21, 2023 12:31 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Kamal Saraf <kamal.saraf@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: FW: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Lovejot,
As discussed, this will be a single vendor quotation
Regards,

Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>
Sent: 21 September 2023 12:12
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Nikhil,
Rephrased.

Thanks and regards,
Sakshi

From: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 21 September 2023 11:42
To: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: RE: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Dear Sakshi,

2.98 lac is the annual license cost or 2 years license cost? Rephrase, as for now it seems 2.98 is annual cost which | will
need to pay again for year 2

Regards,

Nikhil
+91 9820171661

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>
Sent: 21 September 2023 11:09
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.




Hi Nikhil,

Referring to our today's discussion, here is the revised proposal with license fee for 2 yrs included and 1 time
set up cost.

Request for the earliest payment.

Thanks and regards,
Sakshi Jain

From: Sakshi Jain <Sakshi.jain@assisto.tech>

Sent: 09 September 2023 15:44

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: RK <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Re: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Hi Nikhil,

Please find this in continuation to our discussion with Varun today.
I have enclosed the revised commercial proposal and would request your time for a discussion with our delivery
team to start the roll out from Monday.

Look forward to receiving the purchase order.

Warm Regards,
Sakshi Jain

From: Sakshi Jain
Sent: 06 September 2023 10:09
To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: R K <rk@assisto.tech>

Subject: Commercial Porposal_Email Analytics & Automation

Hi Nikhil,
Inline to our last discussion at your office, please find enclosed the commercial proposal along with the
tentative execution timelines for Email Analytics, Response Automation and process automation for customer

queries.

Please confirm your availability for today or Friday in your office to conclude the same.
I am arriving Mumbai today afternoon.

Look forward to your response.

Warm Regards,
Sakshi Jain



