
SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000030 85160000 Refrigerator 3 door under counter chiller - 

UC3100GC
EA 68,000.00 4 18.00 0.00 0 272000.00

Total Unit 4.00
Payment Terms - 100% advance along with GST amount Warranty - 12 months from invoice date Freight - Including  TaT- 7 
days from advance Outlet name - Kolkatta Copper Kitchen

Total Taxable INR 2,72,000.00

Excise Amount 0.00
CGST Amount 24,480.00
SGST Amount 24,480.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 3,20,960.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Vendor No. V0000537
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/23-24/001799

Page No: 111-12-2023  16:38:40

BLUE STAR LTDEco Centre Business Tower, 11th Floor, Unit 1& 2, Sector V, SaltlakeKOLKATA, India  700091India

Shipped Location
STO_STORESTravel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd.83,Gate No-3C,NSCBI AirportKazi Nazrul Islam Sarani Dum DumKolkata, India  700052India

Invoice LocationSTO_STORESTravel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd.83,Gate No-3C,NSCBI Airport
Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani Dum Dum700052IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVATE LIMITED83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORTVIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum DumKolkata, 700052
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.com gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name West BengalComp GST No. 19AAECT8193L1ZJ

19AAECT8193L1ZJGSTIN No.

State 19

State Code
Vendor GST No. 19AAACB4487D1ZPVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No. 03340815596Vendor Email arabindakar@bluestarindia.co

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Vendor No. V0000537
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/23-24/001799

Page No: 211-12-2023  16:38:40

BLUE STAR LTDEco Centre Business Tower, 11th Floor, Unit 1& 2, Sector V, SaltlakeKOLKATA, India  700091India

Shipped Location
STO_STORESTravel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd.83,Gate No-3C,NSCBI AirportKazi Nazrul Islam Sarani Dum DumKolkata, India  700052India

Invoice LocationSTO_STORESTravel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd.83,Gate No-3C,NSCBI Airport
Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani Dum Dum700052IndiaIN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES KOLKATA PRIVATE LIMITED83, Gate no. 3C, N.S.C.B. INTERNATIONAL AIRPORTVIP Road, Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum DumKolkata, 700052
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.com gaurav.bhagaliya@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 11-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name West BengalComp GST No. 19AAECT8193L1ZJ

19AAECT8193L1ZJGSTIN No.

State 19

State Code
Vendor GST No. 19AAACB4487D1ZPVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No. 03340815596Vendor Email arabindakar@bluestarindia.co

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type







1

Abdul Rehman

From: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 12 December 2023 15:32
To: Abdul Rehman
Cc: Swapnil Sutar; Lovejot Sekhon; Shadab Sukri; Sandeep Bhat; Smrutika Thoti
Subject: RE: Kolkata Copper Kitchen Equipment Po

Approved 
 
Regards, 
Shama Nair 
+91 9821053476 
http://www.k-hospitality.com/ 

 
 

From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2023 11:11 AM 
To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat 
<sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Kolkata Copper Kitchen Equipment Po 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Shama,  
 
Please approve attached PO’s. 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
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From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 11 December 2023 19:31 
To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shadab Sukri 
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Kolkata Copper Kitchen Equipment Po 
 
Okay with me 
 
Best, 
 
Gaurav Dewan 
+91 96655 15000 
 
 

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Date: Monday, 11 December 2023 at 7:03 PM 
To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Shadab Sukri 
<shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>, Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Kolkata Copper Kitchen Equipment Po 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
  
Dear Sir /Madam  
  
Please approve Kolkata Copper Kitchen Equipment PO  
  

Company Name Location Outlet Name PO No Vendors Category PO Value  
without GST 

PO Value  
with GST 

TFSKPL Kolkata Copper Kitchen PO/23-24/001797 Gross Kitchen Equipment’s Fryer & Idli steamer 200500 236590 

TFSKPL Kolkata Copper Kitchen PO/23-24/001799 Blue star Under Counter Chiller 2,72,000.00 3,20,960.00 
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Thanks & Regards, 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
  


