Purchase Order
Order Number CHN/PO/23-24/001364

Page No: 1
28-07-2023 17:33:55

Travel Food Services Shipped Location Invoice Location Corporate Address
CHN KFCINTL T2 TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE
Vendor No. V0000162 Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd LIMITED
CHN KFC INTL T2 Ground Floor, Second Floor, Central Kitchen, Next to S2 Police Station,

Best Enterprises Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd

Chennai International Airport,

Maduravoyal Ground Floor, Second Floor, Apna Inte.rnational ,Chennai CHENNAI 600027
Airport, Tirusula
Ayanambakkam, 600095 Anna International ,Chennai Airport,Tirusula 600027 State 33
India CHENNAL 600027 India State Name Tamil Nadu
India India IN Comp GST No. 33AAECT8192M17ZS
P.AN. No. ARQPA9341R Contact Person
State Code Contact No. 022-43224304 022-43224304 Requisition No.
E-Mail k}lmar.dhulap@travelfoodser kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com PO Entry Date 28-07-2023
vices.com
Vendor GST No. 33ARQPA9341R1Z6 ETA: Payment Terms  Immediate
Vendor Inv. No. 1 Order Address GSTIN 33AAECT8192M17ZS Project ID GEN
Vendor Fax No. No.
HSN\SAC Total Tax Total Amount
SNo Item Code Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UoM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 7000013 85014090 Panels, Switchgears LT panel EACH 93,500.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 93500.00
Total Unit 1.00
Advance Payment - 50% along with work order Final Payment - Balance 50% after sucessfully delivery at site & submission of Total Taxable INR 93,500.00
invoice.
Excise Amount 0.00
CGST Amount 8,415.00
SGST Amount 8,415.00
a) Products to be Supplied by b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier at own cost
c) Delivery schedule to be d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 0.00
taken from the Buyer before  DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or
the GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 1,10,330.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority. If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at

the earliest. Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Travel Food Services

Vendor No. V0000162

Best Enterprises
Maduravoyal

Ayanambakkam, 600095
India

India

P.AN. No. ARQPA9341R

State Code

Vendor GST No. 33ARQPA9341R17Z6
Vendor Inv. No. 1

Vendor Fax No.

| § SRS DI o IR | | IR

ANA A

Purchase Order

Order Number CHN/PO/23-24/001364

Shipped Location

CHN KFC INTL T2
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd
Ground Floor, Second Floor,

Anna International ,Chennai Airport, Tirusula
CHENNAI, 600027

India

Contact Person

Contact No. 022-43224304
E-Mail kumar.dhulap@travelfoodser
vices.com
ETA:
Order Address

Invoice Location

CHN KFC INTL T2

Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd
Ground Floor, Second Floor,

Anna International ,Chennai
Airport, Tirusula

600027

India

IN

022-43224304

kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com

Payment Terms Immediate
GSTIN 33AAECT8192M1ZS
No.

Page No: 2
28-07-2023 17:33:55

Corporate Address

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE
LIMITED
Central Kitchen, Next to S2 Police Station,

Chennai International Airport,
CHENNAI 600027

State 33
State Name Tamil Nadu
Comp GST No. 33AAECT8192M1ZS

Requisition No.

PO Entry Date 28-07-2023

Project ID GEN

Page No: 2



Jogeswar Sahu

From: Gaurav Dewan

Sent: 04 August 2023 19:31

To: Binu Balachandran

Cc: Stephen P; Karthick K; Srinath Raghavan; Suraj Kumbhar; Murchana Devi; Smrutika Thoti; Irfan Sayed; Shama Nair; Lovejot Sekhon; Jogeswar Sahu
Subject: Re: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Okay with me

Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000

From: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Date: Wednesday, 2 August 2023 at 7:27 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>, Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>, Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>, Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>, Murchana Devi
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>, Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>, Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>, Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>, Lovejot Sekhon
<lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Dear sir,

Kindly approve below order for common LT panel being order for food court mezzanine due to multiple feeder being provided by AAl, total cost has been bifurcated amongst the store for computing purpose

502 001364 Best Enterprises TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso KFC Intl LT panel - common Area 93,500 50% 28-Jul
503 001367 Best Enterprises TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso Masal Kitchen Intl | LT panel - common Area 93,500 50% 28-Jul
Regards

Binu Balachandran
+91-8452876061

From: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 1, 2023 3:26 PM

To: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Approved
Regards,

Shama Nair
+91 9821053476



http://www.k-hospitality.com/
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happiness through food, since 1972
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From: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Sent: Monday, July 31, 2023 11:09 AM

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

ok

From: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 28 July 2023 17:50

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Dear madam/sir,

Kindly provide approval for below details outlets.

502 001364 Best Enterprises TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso KFC Intl LT panel - common Area 93,500 50% 28-Jul
503 001367 Best Enterprises TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso Masal Kitchen Intl | LT panel - common Area 93,500 50% 28-Jul

Thanks & Regards,
Jogeswar Sahu
+91 9082949517

From: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>
Sent: 28 July 2023 16:41

To: Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

For PO

From: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2023 9:12 AM

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: FW: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Dear Mam



Please approve to proceed..

Regards,
Irfan

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: Thursday, July 27, 2023 9:22 AM

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Cc: Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar <suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Dear Shama
Due to changes in main electrical power supply from AAI - authorities, extra feeder to be ordered/installed to get the power distribution for all 4 outlets of mezzanine food court (KFC/Masala Kitchen/A2B & Squeeze).
Cable confirmation still pending from AAI, once get the confirmation will share the costing if its under our scope.

Total costing - 2.1 Lacs + GST.
Delivery - 2-3 weeks.

Note :- It's a last moment changes from authorities, due to this KFC TAT will be delayed almost for 15-20 days.

Dear Srinath Sir — Fyi.

Dear Binu
Costing from Best & Wunder is attached, post Shama approval proceed immediately on the same.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Karthick K karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2023 2:13 PM

To: Irfan Sayed irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com

Cc: Shama Nair shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com; Srinath Raghavan srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com; Murchana Devi murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Hi Irfan,
As | have discussed with AECOM today, they currently 240 Sgm can be used for KFC and additional 240 Sgm they will confirm with 3 days.
Food Court Common Panel need to be fixed for the same. Attached details FYR..

Regards,
Karthick

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: Saturday, July 22, 2023 5:14 PM

To: Karthick K karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com

Cc: Srinath Raghavan srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com; Murchana Devi murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com; Shama Nair shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com
Subject: RE: Chennai T2 - KFC Back Door - extra work / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply changes for all food court outlets.

Dear Karthick



Please coordinate with authorities and get the final confirmation by coming Monday for further costing/procurement of the materials. Any delay will lead to delay in project TAT.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Irfan Sayed

Sent: Wednesday, July 19, 2023, 3:08 PM

To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Chennai T2 - KFC Back Door - extra work / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply changes for all food court outlets.

Importance: High

Dear Shama Mam

These all are additional costing as per last week Authorities site visit at site in terms of power supply connection etc.
Will share the final costing once confirmation received done from authorities by this weekend.

Due to delay in Ultra Bar, we are going ahead with Bond room construction work to get the licenses process.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2023 2:13 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Hi Irfan,
As | have discussed with AECOM today, they currently 240 Sgm can be used for KFC and additional 240 Sgm they will confirm with 3 days.

Food Court Common Panel need to be fixed for the same. Attached details FYR..

Regards,
Karthick

From: Karthick K

Sent: 19 July 2023 14:53

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Hi Irfan,

Adding to Point No.3 — Initial requirement which we have given was 193 KWH for Mezzanine kitchen, now total its coming around 300 KW with 4 outlets of brand changes from initial stage. So as discussed with AAI all additional infrastructure should
be handled by TFS. Will confirm the cable part by this weekend..



Regards,
Karthick

From: Karthick K

Sent: 19 July 2023 14:40

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinath Raghavan <srinath.raghavan@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: KFC Back Door / Ultra Bond Room / Power Supply

Hi Irfan,
As discussed,

1. KFC Back door wall broken as per the design and 7’ X 4’ and discussed with AAI horizontal lintel will be broken and they have asked us to make vertical lintel for existing wall support — Additional cost involved

2. Ultra Bar Bond room which is for FL 10 license, with KFC line. So for licence requirement we need to make Bond room at priority basis. Will share the cost ASAP

3. Power Supply for KFC / A2B / Masala Kitchen for complete kitchen trench, discussed with AAI existing they have 240 Sq.mm till edge of the kitchen area but for us additional 240 Sg.mm cable as to be layed. They will confirm on cable apart by
tomorrow.

Regards,
Karthick



LT Panel Requirmet - Chennai T2 Common area
SL NO. Description Qry
1 LT Panel
2 Freight
Total

Wunder Control

Amount

1,90,063
20,000
2,10,063

Best enterprises

Amount

1,87,000

1,87,000



ZA), Best Enterprises

Fire & Safety Solutions QU OTE BE'1 903

== 150 9001:2015 Certified

Best Enterprises Amount Due: 2,20,660.0

No : 167-A, Poonamalee High Rd, Maduravoyal, , Chennai, TN (33)

600095, IN Issue Date: 26 /07 /2023
+919790585519 Valid Until: 10/08 /2023
bestenter2016@gmail.com Place of Supply: TN (33)

GSTIN: 33ARQPA9341R1Z6 PAN: ARQPA9341R

Quote To Ship To
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt Ltd Chennai International Airport, Link Building Chennai-600 027, Chennai, TN
Chennai International Airport, Link Building Chennai-600 027, Chennai, (33) 600 027, IN

TN (33) 600 027, IN
GSTIN: 33AAECT8192M1ZS TIN:

No Item o HSN/SAC Taxable Value
Description )

1 SUPPLY OF SUB PANEL - 995461 1.00 1,87,000.0 1,87,000.0 16,830.0 16,830.0 2,20,660.0
Incoming: a) 630A TPN NOS 9% 9%

MCCB with handle &
spreader like — 1 setb) RY
B Indication lamp -1 set c)
630/5 CT -1 set d) Control
MCCB - 1 set e) Energy
meter — 1 set

Outgoing:

1) a) 200A TPN MCCB with
handle & spreader link -1 set
b) Control MCB — 1 set

c) 200/5 CT -1 set

d) KWH meter — 1 no

11) a) 125A TPN MCCB with
handle & spreader link- 2 sets
b) Control MCB - 2 sets

c) 125/5 CT -2 sets

d) KWH meter — 2 nos

1ll) a) 63A TPN MCCB with
handle & spreader link- 1 set
b) Control MCB - 1 set

c) 63/5 CT -1 set

d) KWH meter — 1 no

Bank Name: Canara Bank Total @18% 1,87,000.0 16,830.0 16,830.0 2,20,660.0

Account Number: 60461010000952

Branch Name: Maduravayol Total Taxable Value %1,87,000.0

IFSC Code: CNRB0016046 Total Tax Amount ¥33,660.0
Total Value (in figure) %2,20,660
Total Value (in words) ¥ Two Lakh Twenty Thousand Six Hundred Sixty Only

Provider Signature



Jogeswar Sahu

From: Best Enterprises <bestenter2016@gmail.com>

Sent: 26 July 2023 18:43

To: Irfan Sayed

Cc: Karthick K

Subject: Re: FW: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD
Attachments: BE-1903.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Sir,
Please find attached electrical sub panel quote for your reference,

Note: Panel delivery time 6 to 8 days.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 1:03 PM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Ashok

As per attached SLD get the costing & delivery timelines for the same on priority basis.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Hitesh Dhakre <hitesh@whitewaterdesign.in>

Sent: Wednesday, July 26, 2023 11:38 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: WhiteWater Design <creative@whitewaterdesign.in>; Studio <studio@whitewaterdesign.in>; Mep <mep@whitewaterdesign.in>
Subject: Re: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Updated with load details.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 9:02 AM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:




Dear Hitesh

As discussed, share the details of load in panel SLD for further processing.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Hitesh Dhakre <hitesh@whitewaterdesign.in>

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2023 6:44 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: WhiteWater Design <creative@whitewaterdesign.in>; Studio <studio@whitewaterdesign.in>; Mep <mep@whitewaterdesign.in>
Subject: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan,

As you required, PFA common panel SLD for your ready reference.

HITESH DHAKRE

MEP EXECUTIVE
White Water Design Studio LLP

T: + 91 22 67407636/37
mep@whitewaterdesign.in - whitewaterdesign.in

Anchorage, off Govandi Station Road, Near Amarnath Patil Ground, Govandi
East, Mumbai, Maharashtra 400088

Thanks and Regards,



E. Ashok Kumar

2

T
{mMWWM---

(Fire & Safety Solutions)

An ISO 9001:2015 Certified
No.167-A, Poonamalle High Road,
Maduravoyal, Chennai - 600 095.
Mobile : 91-97905 85519



WUNDER CONTROL & SWITCHGEAR (P) LTD
SN ®

. ————
7 (AN ISO 9001:2015 ORGANISATION)
GROUP  Works: GaliNo. 3, West Saroorpur Industrial Area, Sohna Road, WUNDER

Faridabad — 121 004 (Hr.)
Phone: 0129-2230223 E-mail: ravinder@rsgroup.in, sales@rsgroup.in, wundercontrols@gmail.com
Website:  rsgroup.in

WCSPL/ TFS/ WC/23178/ 07 /2023
27 th July 2023

M/S: Travel Food Services

Kind Attention : Mr. Irfan Ji
Subject : Offer for Common Panel
Dear Sir,

This is with reference to the enquiry regarding subject requirement.

As desired, we are giving below our most competitive & comprehensive prices for
your kind reference & consideration. Please note that our offer has following annexure
along with coveringletter:

Annexure - A : Technical Part
Annexure - B : Price Schedule
Annexure - C : Bill of Material
Annexure - D : Terms & Conditions

We hope that our offer is inline with your requirement.
Should you require any further details / information please feel free to contact us.

We now look forward to hear from you soon.

Thanking you.

For WUNDER CONTROL & SWITCHGEAR (P) LTD

Rajat Samyal (Director)
9999438279

H.O.: Plot No. 40, 16/5, Gali No. 5, Karkhana Bagh, Mathura Road, Faridabad - 121 003 (Hr.)
Ph .. 0129-2230223



GROUP WUNDER

ANNEXURE - A

TECHNICAL PART

We have quoted Wunder Make Panel with in-house Designing, Manufacturing &

Testing as per enclosed BOQ.

Panels shall be manufactured with CRCA Steel Sheet of 1.6mm (Load bearing), 1.6 mm

Thick for non-load bearing members(Doors, Side Covers etc.), Dust & vermin proof Fixed type,
Single front, compartmentalized & Self Standing type duly powder coated after 7 tank
pretreatment process for Long & Improve Life having IP: 42 degree of Protection.

Bus Bar will be Electrolyte grade AL & insulated with heat shrinkable PVC Sleeve.

Our price Based on as per enclosed Bill of Materials any variation shall have
price implication.

We have Considered following make of components: -

MCCB : L&T
Indication Lamp D L&T

Current Transformer : AE/ Hind Asia
Meter : Schneider
MCB D L&T

We have considered all components as specified in our BOM. All components make
shall be as per the approved makes List/Above mention list.

H.O.: Plot No. 40, 16/5, Gali No. 5, Karkhana Bagh, Mathura Road, Faridabad - 121 003 (Hr.)
Ph .. 0129-2230223



S GROUP WUNDER
ANNEXURE-B
PRICE SCHEDULE
S.NO DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 | common Panl 1| 190063 190063
2| Freight 1 20000 20000
Total Amount(INR) 2,10,063

Annexure- C, Bill of Material See PDF Sheet

H.O.: Plot No. 40
Ph .- 0129-223022

136/5, Gali No. 5, Karkhana Bagh, Mathura Road, Faridabad -121 003 (Hr.)



N

RS GROUP

Prices

Packing

Payment Terms

GST

Freight

Delivery
Transit Insurance

Validity

Warranty

WUNDER

ANNEXURE - D
TERMS & CONDITIONS

Ex Works Faridabad

At Actuals

50% advance balance against Performa Invoice before dispatch of material

18 % extra

At Actuals

Within 4 weeks from the date of receipt of technically & commercially
clear order

In your scope, we can also arrange at your behalf and same
Will be debited to you.

15 days

12 months.

All taxes & duties are subject to prevailing rates at the time of dispatch

Hope, you will find our rate to be the most competitive and we look forward to your valued order by
Return email/fax. In case you need any clarification, please feel free to contact the undersigned.

Thanking you
Yours faithfully

For WUNDER CONTROL & SWITCHGEAR (P) LTD.

Rajat Samyal (Director)

9999438279

H.O.: Plot No. 40 136/5, Gali No. 5, Karkhana Bagh, Mathura Road, Faridabad -121 003 (Hr.)

Ph .- 0129-223022



Jogeswar Sahu

From: Rajat Samyal <rajat@rsgroup.in>

Sent: 27 July 2023 00:19

To: Irfan Sayed

Cc: Karthick K; 'Abhishek’; santosh@rsgroup.in
Subject: RE: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD
Attachments: BOM.pdf; QUOTATION.pdf

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find the attached Quotation and BOM of Common Panel (as per Shared SLD) for Chennai T2.

Delivery:-
Switchgear Make L&T within 3-4 weeks.
Switchgear Make Legrand within 4-5 weeks.

With Regards:
Rajat Samyal (Director)

Wunder Control & Switchgear Pvt. Ltd

Address: Gali No.-3W,Saroorpur Indl Area,
Sohna Road, Ballabhgarh, Faridabad
Phone : 0129-2230223, 9999438279

From: Irfan Sayed [mailto:irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com]
Sent: 26 July 2023 13:04

To: Rajat Samyal; Abhishek

Cc: Karthick K

Subject: FW: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD

Dear Rajat/Abhishek
Can you check and update on the costing & delivery part of the attached SLD required for Chennai T2 — KFC and other stores electrical.
Need the details asap.

Regards,
Irfan

From: Hitesh Dhakre <hitesh@whitewaterdesign.in>

Sent: Wednesday, July 26, 2023 11:38 AM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: WhiteWater Design <creative@whitewaterdesign.in>; Studio <studio@whitewaterdesign.in>; Mep <mep@whitewaterdesign.in>
Subject: Re: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.




Updated with load details.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 9:02 AM Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Hitesh

As discussed, share the details of load in panel SLD for further processing.

Regards,

Irfan

From: Hitesh Dhakre <hitesh@whitewaterdesign.in>

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2023 6:44 PM

To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: WhiteWater Design <creative@whitewaterdesign.in>; Studio <studio@whitewaterdesign.in>; Mep <mep@whitewaterdesign.in>
Subject: T2 AIRPORT-CHENNAI-COOMON PANEL SLD

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irfan,

As you required, PFA common panel SLD for your ready reference.

HITESH DHAKRE

MEP EXECUTIVE
White Water Design Studio LLP

T: + 9122 67407636/37
mep@whitewaterdesign.in - whitewaterdesign.in

Anchorage, off Govandi Station Road, Near Amarnath Patil Ground, Govandi
East, Mumbai, Maharashtra 400088
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