
SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000273 83100010 SIGNAGE DETAILS AS PER ANNEXURE NOS 20,500.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 20500.00
2 7000072 83100010 Others INSTALLATION & 

TRANSPORTATION CHARGES
EACH 6,500.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 6500.00

Total Unit 2.00

PAYMENT TERMS 50% ADVANCE BALANCE 50% POST 30 DAYS OF INVOICE SUBMISSION ADDITIONAL ORDER FOR PO 
CHN/PO/23-24/003005

Total Taxable INR 27,000.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 4,860.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or the 
GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 31,860.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at the earliest. 
 Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Vendor No. V0001314

Purchase Order
Order Number CHN/PO/23-24/003005

Page No: 1

11/7/2023  5:46:19 PM

Varnn INC
No. 62/1, 5th Cross, 15 Th Main Road Pete Channapa

Industrial Estate Kamakshipalya Bangalore
BANGALORE, 560079
India

Shipped Location

CHN MASALA KITCHEN INTL T2
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd
Ground Floor, Second Floor,

Anna International ,Chennai Airport,Tirusula
CHENNAI, 600027
India

Invoice Location
CHN MASALA KITCHEN INTL T2
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt.Ltd
Ground Floor, Second Floor,

Anna International ,Chennai 
Airport,Tirusula
600027
India
IN

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE 
LIMITED
Central Kitchen, Next to S2 Police Station ,
Chennai International Airport,

CHENNAI, 600027

P.A.N. No. AYIPK6573E Contact Person

Contact No.
E-Mail 

022-43224304
kumar.dhulap@travelfoodser
vices.com

022-43224304

kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com

ETA: PO Entry Date
Payment Terms

11/7/2023
Net 30 days

Corporate Address

State Name Tamil Nadu
Comp GST No. 33AAECT8192M1ZS

33AAECT8192M1ZSGSTIN 
No.

State 33

State Code

Vendor GST No. 29AYIPK6573E1Z2
Vendor Inv. No.
Vendor Fax No.

Vendor Email accounts@varnn.com

Requisition 
No.

Project ID GENOrder Address
Capex-NSOPO Type
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Sarvesh Patil

From: Lovejot Sekhon
Sent: 09 November 2023 18:25
To: Sarvesh Patil; Lovejot Sekhon
Cc: Chetan Bobade; Nimisha Jadhav; Karthick K; Amit Singh; Suganthraj B; Murchana Devi; Binu 

Balachandran; Stephen P; Shama Nair; Sonali Dhadve; Irfan Sayed
Subject: RE: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. TFSCPL-2324-00149

Approved. 
 

From: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Wednesday, November 8, 2023 4:59 PM 
To: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K 
<karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Singh <amit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Suganthraj B <suganthraj.b@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi 
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. TFSCPL-2324-00149 
 
Dear Lovejot Sir, 
 
Request your approval to proceed further. 
 

Sr No WO NO Vendor Name Company Location  NSO/MNT Outlet Package  Wo-Value 
(B.Tax) 

Approved Budget 
(B.Tax) 

Advance 

896 003005 Varnn INC TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso Masala KItchen Signage 27,000   498,000  50% 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Sarvesh Patil 
 

From: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 08 November 2023 16:43 
To: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K 
<karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Singh <amit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Suganthraj B <suganthraj.b@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi 
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P 
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. TFSCPL-2324-00149 
 
Approved 
 
Regards, 
Shama Nair 
+91 9821053476 
http://www.k-hospitality.com/ 

 
 

From: Sonali Dhadve <Sonali.dhadve@k-corp.in>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 7, 2023 6:10 PM 
To: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K 
<karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Singh <amit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Suganthraj B <suganthraj.b@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi 
<murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P 
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Subject: RE: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. TFSCPL-2324-00149 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Shama Ma’am & Irfan Sir, 
 
Please find the enclosed WO for Additional Signage for Masala Kitchen Outlet @Chennai  
 
Request your approval to proceed further. 
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Note : This is an additional order For PO CHN/PO/23-24/003005 
 

Sr No WO NO Vendor Name Company Location  NSO/MNT Outlet Package  Wo-Value 
(B.Tax) 

Approved Budget 
(B.Tax) 

Advance 

896 003005 Varnn INC TFSCPL Chennai T2 nso Masala KItchen Signage 27,000   498,000  50% 
 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 
Sonali D  
 

From: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 03 November 2023 17:47 
To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Singh <amit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Suganthraj B <suganthraj.b@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; 
Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: RE: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. TFSCPL-2324-00149 
 
Dear Team, 
 
We have uploaded request for Additional Signage for Masala kitchen Chennai T2.  in safal.. 
 
PR No.: TFSCPL-2324-00149 
 
Request you to process 
 
 
Regards, 
Smrutika 
02243224361 
 

From: Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: 03 November 2023 17:29 
To: Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Amit Singh <amit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Suganthraj B <suganthraj.b@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: FW: BOQ for Masala kitchen signage for Chennai T2. 
 
Hi Smrutika, 
 
Please upload the Chennai – Masala Kitchen Additional signage BOQ in safal. 
 
 
Thank You, 
Murchana Devi 
 
 
 



Sr. No. Particulars Artwork reference Sizes Specification Uom Qty Rate Amount

1
Front Regional 
Signage

Sizes Mentioned in the creative 
file
Blue Sizes mentioned in small 
font are for Clear Acrylic (joint 
section given after 61 inch)
Red Sizes mentioned in small font 
are letters sizes

50 MM depth LED 3D cut Black 
Aluminium channel letters + Letters 
front 3mm thk White Acrylic + Vinyl 
sticker print on Dots as per same 
colour
There will be clear acrylic behind all 
Letters 

Nos 1 4500 4500

2
Wall Photo 
frame

2630 mm (H) X 550 mm (W)
Vinyl Graphics print with 20MM 
Black colour wooden Frame

Nos 2 8000 16000

6500
27000
4860

31860

VARNN INC

Transportation and installation to Chennai
sum total

taxes@18%
grand total


