Nimisha Jadhav

From: Karthick K

Sent: 24 June 2024 15:16

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Ajit Yadav; binu.balachandran; Shama Nair; Murchana Devi
Subject: RE: Related to RA Bill Chennai T2 Partition & Lounge Work
Hi Nimisha,

Please proceed further..

Regards,
Karthick

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 24 June 2024 13:00

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana
Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Related to RA Bill Chennai T2 Partition & Lounge Work

Dear Karthick,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further .

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>
Sent: 22 June 2024 22:00




To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>;
Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Related to RA Bill Chennai T2 Partition & Lounge Work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi,

I am Going to attached tax invoice of Ra-01 CHN-2 lounge work Please check and proceed the Payment

Thanks & Regards
Ejazul haque

Project Engineer
SHAH ENTERPRISES

On Sat, Jun 22, 2024 at 1:36 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Team,
I have attached the Tax invoice for CHN T2 lounge, please check and process the payment

Thanks & Regards,
Modassir Wasim

On Fri, Jun 21, 2024 at 7:17 PM Karthick K <karthick . k@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi Sabir,

Please share the invoice for the same..



Regards,

Karthick

From: Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 21 June 2024 19:10

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Related to RA Bill Chennai T2 Partition & Lounge Work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

PFA

Thanks & Regards,



EJAZUL HAQUE
Project Engineer

SHAH ENTERPRISES

On Fri, Jun 21, 2024 at 7:06 PM Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi Sabir,

We have discussed with Ejaj’s to share the revised sheet for the same.

Regards,

Karthick

From: Sabir ali Shah <project.shahenterindia@gmail.com>

Sent: 18 June 2024 16:06

To: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Ajit Yadav <ajit.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Jogeswar Sahu <jogeswar.sahu@travelfoodservices.com>;
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Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Murchana Devi <murchana.devi@travelfoodservices.com>; Anuj Dubey
<anuj.dubey@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Related to RA Bill Chennai T2 Partition & Lounge Work

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

I am going to Attached RA-01 For snag point lounge work 1 need your confirmation to Generate Invoice

Thanks & Regards,
Ejazul haque
Project Engineer

SHAH ENTERPRISES

On Sat, Jun 15, 2024 at 2:09 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:
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Reminder

On Wed, Jun 12, 2024, 4:49 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Reminder

Regards
Modassir Wasim

On Sat, Jun 8, 2024 at 4:47 PM Sabir Ali Shah <shahenterindia@gmail.com> wrote:

Dera All,
I have attached the RA bill so please check & confirm

Regards
Modassir Wasim



