Nimisha Jadhav

From: Ajit Singh

Sent: 20 June 2024 13:45

To: Prashant Singhal

Cc: Shadab Sukri; sminfra piyush; sminfrasushant@gmail.com; sminfra.krishna@gmail.com; raju; Delhi Project; Nimisha Jadhav
Subject: RE: MS Structure Work Payment Request for Del Subway

Dear Prashant
Approved 75% of the work as per the Measurement Sheet kindly share the Invoice for MS work at Subway.

Regards
Ajit Singh

From: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 1:30 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; sminfrasushant@gmail.com; sminfra.krishna@gmail.com; raju
<rjsminfra@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: MS Structure Work Payment Request for Del Subway

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir,
PFA of sign mb.

Regards
Prashant Singhal
Phone: +91 7417405315



On Thu, Jun 13, 2024 at 11:57 AM raju <rjsminfra@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

PFA the RA of MS Structure & Anchor works for site Del subway, kindly review & release the payment



