Nimisha Jadhav

From: Shadab Sukri

Sent: 15 June 2024 08:01

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Ajit Singh; Shama Nair; Smrutika Thoti

Subject: RE: FW: TACO BELL ( PANEL ) -SM Infra Services llp invoice approval
Approved

Regards

Shadab Sukri

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 June 2024 05:20 PM

To: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Smrutika Thoti <smrutika.thoti@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: FW: TACO BELL ( PANEL ) -SM Infra Services llp invoice approval

Dear sir,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further.

Vendor Name Basic Amount PO Value Outlet Invoice Invoice Invoice
date No Amount
06- | TFSPL/PO/24- 16-06- GST-HR-
SM Infra Services llp 2024 | 25/000314 1,81,125 32,603 2,13,728 | Taco Bell Electrical Panel 2024 24-25-017 | 170982

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav.



From: krishna jha <krishnaop87 @gmail.com>

Sent: 14 June 2024 11:34

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>; Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar
<prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <Sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: FW: TACO BELL ( PANEL)

Some people who received this message don't often get email from krishnaop87@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,
Please find the attached file and make this payment ASAP...

On Wed, Jun 12, 2024 at 6:33 PM Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Jha

Approved 80% for taco bell electrical panel kindly submit the invoice

Regards

Ajit Singh

From: KRISHNA JHA <sminfra.krishna@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 3:57 PM

To: Ajit Singh <ajit.singh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Shadab Sukri <shadab.sukri@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhat Kumar <prabhat.kumar@travelfoodservices.com>; Nimisha Jadhav
<nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; sminfra piyush <sminfra.piyush@gmail.com>; Prashant Singhal <prashant.singhal1992 @gmail.com>
Subject: TACO BELL ( PANEL)




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please find attached file and check PANEL RA

Regards KRISHNA KANT JHA.
Accounts & Finance #

SM INFRA

B-657, NEAR ROYAL PLAZA-2
GREEN FIELDS

FARIDABAD -121010

M. NO:- 8700207243



