
SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000047 84240000 FRYERS Twin Basket Deep Fat Fryer ( 

Table Model )-ELDORAD
NOS 31,500.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 31500.00

Total Unit 1.00
Payment term - Within 30 days against delivery Delivery If In Stock within 10/12 working days and If non In Stock, we will info 
Delivery. Freight & installation charges extra at actual. Outlet Name- AJ Kitchen, LKO

Total Taxable INR 31,500.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 5,670.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 37,170.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.

Page No: 1

Vendor No. V000531
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001874

Page No: 107-12-2023  12:46:41
Cambro Nilkamal Private Limited77-78 Nlkamal House Road No. 13,14 MIDCMumbaiMUMBAI, 400093India

Shipped Location
LKN Dom AJ 1881Chaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,LUCKNOW, 226009IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationLKN Dom AJ 1881Chaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,226009IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAECC2392J Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 07-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

09ABICS8699F1ZHGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAECC2392J1ZIVendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 7506470381/70456
Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email shilpa.chavan@nilkamal.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type



Page No: 2

Vendor No. V000531
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001874

Page No: 207-12-2023  12:46:41
Cambro Nilkamal Private Limited77-78 Nlkamal House Road No. 13,14 MIDCMumbaiMUMBAI, 400093India

Shipped Location
LKN Dom AJ 1881Chaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,LUCKNOW, 226009IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationLKN Dom AJ 1881Chaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,226009IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAECC2392J Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 07-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

09ABICS8699F1ZHGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAECC2392J1ZIVendor Inv. No.
Vendor Phone No. 7506470381/70456
Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email shilpa.chavan@nilkamal.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Swapnil Sutar

From: Abdul Rehman
Sent: 06 December 2023 13:44
To: Swapnil Sutar
Subject: FW: TC Recommendation - Nilkamal - Supply of Kitchen Equipment for CIP Longe at Lucknow Int. Airport - Terminal-3
Attachments: Nilkamal Quote.xlsx; CW5201 - FINAL ARC - Cambro Nilkamal Pvt Ltd.pdf - signed.pdf.pdf

 
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
 

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>  
Sent: 06 December 2023 12:36 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Pankaj Rohatgi <Pankaj.Rohatgi@adani.com>; Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com>; Stephen P 
<stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: TC Recommendation - Nilkamal - Supply of Kitchen Equipment for CIP Longe at Lucknow Int. Airport - Terminal-3 
 
Dear Irfan/Sandeep 
 
Please find our below recommendation for you to proceed. Attached Quotation and ARC copy for your reference. 
 
SUMMARY 

Sl. No. Project Location Amount w/o Tax GST Amount with Tax Vendor 

1 AJ Kitchen, LKO LKO 31,500 5,670.00 37,170.00 Cambro Nilkamal Pvt Ltd 
2 Carl's LKO 2,69,584 48,525.12 3,18,109.12 Cambro Nilkamal Pvt Ltd 

 TOTAL  3,01,084 54,195.12 3,55,279.12  

 
DETAILED REQUIREMENT AS PER BOQ 

Sl. NO. Project Item No. Product Description Size Make Model 
82 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 01 Twin Basket Deep Fat Fryer ( Table Model ) 570 x 540 x 480 SIRMAN ELDORADO 8X2R 
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274 Carl's 39 Walk-in Rack (Cambro) 1848  4T  Cambro Element or Basic with Camguard 
275 Carl's 40 Walk in chiller rack (Cambro) 1836 4T  Cambro Element or Basic with Camguard 
276 Carl's 41 Walk -in freezer Bow tie dunnage rack (Cambro) 18x48  Cambro S Series 
277 Carl's 42 Walk-in freezer rack (Cambro) 1860 4T  Cambro Element or Basic with Camguard 
284 Carl's 52 Dry Storage Rack (Cambro) - 1848 4T  Cambro Refer to Ajit for model number as each has 64" or 72" height
285 Carl's 53 Dry Storage Rack (Cambro) - 2448 4T  Cambro Refer to Ajit for model number as each has 64" or 72" height
286 Carl's 54 Dry Storage Rack (Cambro) - 1836 4T  Cambro Refer to Ajit for model number as  each has 64" or 72" height

      TOTAL AMOUNT 
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 

From: Jayesh Rana <jayesh.rana@cambro-nilkamal.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 6, 2023 12:08 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Cc: Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Manish Singhi <manish.singhi@cambro-nilkamal.com>; Ashish Rathod 
<ashish.rathod@nilkamal.com>; Ajitkumar Rathod <ajitkumar.rathod@cambro-nilkamal.com> 
Subject: Re : RFQ - Supply of Kitchen Equipment for CIP Longe at Lucknow Int. Airport - Terminal-3 
 
*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Thanks to receipt of your valued inquiry. 
 
Please find attached offer for the Cambro Cold Room Shelving and Sirman Fryer. Please look into and do the needful. 
 
Please feel free to ask us if any query or require further information. 
 
regards, 
 

Jayesh Rana 
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Asst. Manager (Hospitality Div.) |CAMBRO NILKAMAL PVT. LTD. 
M:08980011628  
Email: jayesh.rana@cambro-nilkamal.com 

NILKAMAL LIMITED 

BLOCK-A/501-504, TIME SQUARE ARCADE-II, 

NR.AVALON HOTEL, OPP.MANN PARTY PLOT, 

BODAKDEV,AHMEDABAD-380054 

 

 
The information in this mail is confidential and is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this mail and the information by anyone other than the intended recipient is 
unauthorized. The opinion expressed in this mail is that of the sender and do not necessarily reflect sanction of Nilkamal Ltd.  
 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is 
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this 
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views 
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  


