Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001008

Page No: 1
12/20/2023 6:03:14 PM

Shipped Location Invoice Location Corporate Address
LKN Int good times bar SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD
Vendor No. V000133 LKN Int good times bar 1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate,
NSA DESIGN STUDIO Chaudhary Charan Singh International Airport Chaudhary Charan Singh International Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, Mumbai
Airport
371, 1ST FLOOR, RANGPURI, NEAR CELEBRATION Amausi, Lucknow, Amausi, Lucknow, MUMBAI, 400018
GARDEN, NH-48, NEW DEHLI LUCKNOW, 226009 226009 State 27
New Delhi, 110027 India India State Name Maharashtra
India India IN Comp GST No.  27ABICS8699F1Z]
P.A.N. No. AAJFN4351N Contact Person
State Code Contact No. 022-43224304 022-43224304 Requisition
E-Mail k.umar.dhulap@travelfoodser kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com  No.
vices.com
PO Entry Date 8/4/2023
Vendor GST No. 07AAJFN4351N1ZV ETA: Payment Terms Y /4
Vendor Inv. No. Order Address GSTIN  09ABICS8699F1ZH ProjectID GEN
Vendor Fax No. No. PO Type Capex-NSO
Vendor Email bk.oipl@gmail.com
HSN\SAC Total Tax Total Amount
SNo _Item Code Code  Item Description Description 2 Item Category UoM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % _ Excise _Amount(ININR) (ININR)
1 7000008 998311 DESIGNER Budwiser NOS 380,000.00 1 18.00  0.00 0 380000.00
Total Unit 1.00
PAYMENT TERMS 10% after kick off meeting (Site feasibility & Project discussion) - 25% after completion of Concept design - Total Taxable INR 380,000.00
25% after completion of detailed design - 25% after completion of BOQ & tender document - 15% after closeout or within 6
months from tender document submission whichever is earlier.
Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 68,400.00
a) Products to be Supplied by b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00
Supplier at own cost
c) Delivery schedule to be d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 0.00
taken from the Buyer before ~ DELIVERY ADDRESS.
Despatching the mater
e) The Payment of taxes will
be Released once the Taxes is
Credited to our Account or the
GST Portal
Total INR Incl. Taxes 448,400.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority. If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at the earliest.
Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Vendor No. V000133
NSA DESIGN STUDIO

371, 1ST FLOOR, RANGPURI, NEAR CELEBRATION
GARDEN, NH-48, NEW DEHLI
New Delhi, 110027

India

P.AN. No. AAJFN4351N

State Code

Vendor GST No. 07AAJFN4351N1ZV

Vendor Inv. No.
Vendor Fax No.

Vendor Email bk.oipl@gmail.com

Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001008

Shipped Location

LKN Int good times bar
Chaudhary Charan Singh International Airport

Amausi, Lucknow,

LUCKNOW, 226009

India

India

Contact Person

Contact No. 022-43224304

E-Mail kumar.dhulap@travelfoodser

vices.com
ETA:

Order Address

Invoice Location
LKN Int good times bar

Chaudhary Charan Singh International
Airport

Amausi, Lucknow,

226009

India

IN

022-43224304

kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com

Payment Terms
GSTIN No. 09ABICS8699F1ZH

Page No: 2
12/20/2023 6:03:14 PM

Corporate Address

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD
1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate,
Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, Mumbai

MUMBAI 400018
State 27

State Name Maharashtra
Comp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1Z]

Requisition No.

PO Entry Date 8/4/2023

Project ID GEN
PO Type Capex-NSO
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Sonali Dhadve

From: Stephen P

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2023 5:46 PM

To: Sarvesh Patil; Sonali Dhadve

Cc: Jogeswar Sahu; Binu Balachandran

Subject: FW: Lucknow D42 - Budweiser - Genesis Scope of work.

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>

Sent: 13 December 2023 16:02

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com>

Subject: RE: Lucknow D42 - Budweiser - Genesis Scope of work.

Dear Stephen

Based on the proposals you called from all consultants in line to your requirement, below is our recommendation for you to proceed.

Final Negotiated Final Negotiated Amount with

Vendor Name Project / Outlet Remark

Amount Taxes

Finalized Packages:
M/s. Genesis Architects Pvt Ltd Rs.3,80,000 Rs.68,400 Rs.4,48,400 Lucknow D42 - Budweiser 1 Design
Consultancy
Payment Terms As per existing order
Regards,

Manish Mulchandani

From: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Sent: Saturday, November 18, 2023 3:45 PM

To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com>; Avadhesh Kumar Singh <Avadhesh.Kumar@adani.com>
Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Lucknow D42 - Budweiser - Genesis Scope of work.

*¥CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.*

Hi Manish,

With respect to the below mail received from Prakash on change in designer scope, we reached out to Genesis and received a revised quote.
Request you to review and confirm to proceed further.

Please note: PO for complete designing work was already awarded to Genesis on 07-Aug based on the contracted rates.

Regards
Stephen

From: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 17 November 2023 16:05

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Khushbu Verma
<khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed @travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Lucknow D42 - Budweiser - Genesis Scope of work.

Dear Stephen,

We need designing to be done for a D-42 Budweiser in Lucknow (Scope of work as mentioned below).

Area :- BOH : 36 sq.mt and FOH : 194.21 sq.mt

Scope of work.

(] Civil and wet work
(] MEP designing — BOH and FOH.



(] Kitchen equipment and design — BOH & FOH
o Bar — equipment
(] BOQ

Interior work and furniture of FOH area will be in brand scope.

We have given a design brief to Genesis team, kindly take this forward.

Regards,

Prakash Mistry

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain
information that is confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that
any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this
e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the
company.

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts
no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.



