
Tax Invoice

IRN : c5401b9511563ea1bbda91e4af571d4083a9e3c35975618-
1e3adb05a7d44108e

Ack No. : 122422853999448
Ack Date : 29-Aug-24

e-Invoice

Shambhu Gupta & Co.
Chartered Accountants
512-513, Manish Chamber
Sonawala Lane, Opp. Hotel Karan Palace
Goregaon (East) Mumbai
Maharashtra Pin:- 400063
GSTIN/UIN: 27AADFS4499Q1Z7
State Name :  Maharashtra, Code : 27
E-Mail : shambhu.gupta@gmail.com / mumbai@casgc.in
Buyer (Bill to)

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
Block-A South Wing 1st Floor Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr. 
Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai-400018
GSTIN/UIN : 27AADCB2762L1ZI
PAN/IT No : AADCB2762L
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27
Place of Supply : Maharashtra

Invoice No.

SGC/24-25/251
Reference No. & Date.

Dated

29-Aug-24
Other References

Particulars AmountperRateHSN/SAC

CERTIFICATION CHARGES 2,500.00998224
Certificate from Chartered Accountant regarding Eligibility
UDIN:24116375BKCIFI1422
DATED 29-08-2024

CGST @ 9.00% 225.00%9
SGST @ 9.00% 225.00%9

Total 2,950.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) E. & O.E

Indian Rupees Two Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty Only
TotalState TaxCentral TaxTaxable

Tax AmountAmountRateAmountRateValue
450.00225.009%225.009%2,500.00

Total: 450.00225.00225.002,500.00

Tax Amount (in words)  : Indian Rupees Four Hundred Fifty Only
Remarks:
BEING CERTIFICATION CHARGES

Company's PAN : AADFS4499Q

Declaration
TAX IS NOT PAYABLE UNDER REVERSE CHARGE 
BASIS FOR THIS SERVICE AND IN OUR CASE MSMED 
ACT 2006 IS APPLICABLE. UDYAM REGISTRATON NO: 
UDYAM-RJ-17-0161807

Company's Bank Details
Bank Name : Union Bank of India
A/c No. : 317001010058124
Branch & IFS Code : Goregaon (East) & UBIN0531707

Customer's Seal and Signature for Shambhu Gupta & Co.

Authorised Signatory

SUBJECT TO MUMBAI JURISDICTION

This is a Computer Generated Invoice
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Invoices TFS

From: Pankaj Rathi
Sent: 29 August 2024 19:02
To: Invoices TFS
Cc: Parag Pandey
Subject: FW: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall
Attachments: SGC-24-25-251-TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED-CERTIFICATE.pdf

Hi Sawlaram, 
 
Kindly process the attached invoice in SAFAL. 
 
B/Rgds 
Pankaj 
 

From: Parwati Singh <parwatisingh.sgco@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, August 29, 2024 6:07 PM 
To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: ankit@casgc.in; Mukul Shah <mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Re: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

 
Dear Sir,  
 
Please find the attached certificate & invoice for the same 
 
 
On Thu, Aug 29, 2024 at 3:06 PM Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com> wrote: 

Hi Ankit, 

  

Pls issue the attached certificate, “Please note” words added rest same as given by you. 

  

B/Rgds 

Pankaj 

  

From: Ankit Jain <ankit@casgc.in>  
Sent: Wednesday, August 28, 2024 1:13 PM 
To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Mukul Shah <mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Parwati Singh <parwatisingh.sgco@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

Please find the attached draft certificate. 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

Ankit Jain 

  

From: "Mukul Shah" <mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com> 
Sent: 8/27/24 11:01 AM 
To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>, Ankit Lodha <ankit@casgc.in> 
Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Hi Ankit, 

 
 The amounts as mentioned for the yearwise consol turnover were mentioned in reverse order in the certificate  

  

Have updated the same, and attached is the updated certificate copy. 

  

Please have a look and confirm if OK to be issued. 

 
 Thanks, 

  

Mukul. 

  

From: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: 08/27/2024 09:56 
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 To: Mukul Shah <mukul.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Ankit Lodha <ankit@casgc.in> 
 Subject: Fw: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Hi Ankit, 

  

Can you kindly check the certificate and let me know if ok to be issued. 

  

B/Rgds 

Pankaj 

From: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 7:45 PM 
 To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Hi Pankaj Sir, 

  

Pfa revised version of CA certificate for Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

  

From: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 7:01 PM 
 To: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Hi Faizan, 

  

Pls confirm if the attached certificate meets your requirement. 
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B/Rgds 

Pankaj 

  

From: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: Monday, August 26, 2024 12:57 PM 
 To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Dear Pankaj Sir, 

  

As per discussion and as advise by you, please find attached CA certificate format. Further also need a covering letter from the CA stating as to why the Financial statement for year 2023-2024 one could not be submitted. 

  

Note: You can modify the attached letter , there is no specific format given by Bangalore Authority.  

  

Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

  

From: Faizan Khan  
 Sent: Tuesday, August 20, 2024 12:36 PM 
 To: Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
 Importance: High 

  

Dear Pankaj Sir, 

  

Knowing the criticality and importance of Bangalore Tenders, need your urgent update on points emailed earlier and as detailed hereunder 

  

Warm Regards, 
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Faizan Khan 

Business Development 

Travel Food Services Private Limited  

(Tel): 022 4322 4329 

 

  

  

  

From: Faizan Khan  
 Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 11:58 AM 
 To: Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Yash Jain <yash.jain@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sumeet Rane <sumeet.rane@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani 
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Shalki Khanna <shalki.khanna@travelfoodservices.com>; Soni Viswanathan <soni.viswanathan@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Pankaj Rathi <pankaj.r@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Varun Kapur <varun.kapur@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com>; Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
 Importance: High 

  

Dear All, 

  

Please find attached queries revert from BIAL. 

  

@Pankaj Sir: We can submit the CA certificate instead of the Statutory Certificate. We will also need to include a covering letter from the CA explaining why the 2023-2024 audit report isn't available. Please see the yellow-highlighted cell for 
details. 

  

Document 
 Name 

Section / 
Clause 

 Number 

Brief description of the provision Clarification 
 Sought 

Remarks from BIAL 
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RFP 
ELIGIBILITY 
CRITERIA 
Pt. No. 3 

The Bidder must have an annual turnover of INR 1,00,00,000/- 
(Rupees One Crore only) in any of the last three (3) Financial 
Years, as per the audited financial statements available (please 
attach copies of audit reports); In case of a consortium at least 
one member of the consortium should meet the annual 
turnover criteria. Financial years to be considered FY 2021-22, 
FY 2022-23, FY 2023-24. Bidder must provide Annual 
Reports and Certificate from the Statutory Auditor to 
substantiate the same. 

Since the audit for FY 2023-
2024 is not completed yet, can 
we submit the audited financial 
statement for FY 2020-2021, 
2021-2022 & 2022-2023 
instead? 

We kindly advice to share the Financial statement as 
mentioned in the tender. In case the audit report is not 
ready for the FY 2023-24 then you shall be able to 
submit the Financial statement for FY 2020-2021, 
2021-2022 & 2022-2023 with a covering letter 
attached from the CA stating as to why the recent one 
could not be submitted. 

 

RFP 

ELIGIBILITY 
CRITERIA 
Pt. No. 6(b) 

Certificate from Statutory Auditor proving the Financial 
Eligibility Criteria, along with the supporting documents 
(audited annual reports). 
In case the audited annual reports are available in currencies 
other than (INR), the statements should be converted to (INR), 
and the same should be certified by the Statutory Auditor. 

Instead of the statutory 
certificate, can we submit a CA 
certificate proving the Financial 
Eligibility Criteria? 

CA certified report shall be submitted 

 

 

  

  

Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

  

From: Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 8:15 AM 
 To: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Yash Jain <yash.jain@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sumeet Rane <sumeet.rane@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani 
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Shalki Khanna <shalki.khanna@travelfoodservices.com>; Soni Viswanathan <soni.viswanathan@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Varun Kapur <varun.kapur@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com>; Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 

  

Dear Faizan, 

  

PFA queries 

  

  

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Shrutej Sawant 

9029902538 
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From: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2024 1:28 PM 
 To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Yash Jain <yash.jain@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sumeet Rane <sumeet.rane@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani 
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Shalki Khanna <shalki.khanna@travelfoodservices.com>; Soni Viswanathan <soni.viswanathan@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Varun Kapur <varun.kapur@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com>; Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
 Importance: High 

  

Dear All, 

  

With respect to the BIAL South Indian Specialty (F&B) Outlet at Terminal 2. Please share all your queries/clarification if any in the attached query format only, latest by 16th August 2024  

  

Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

From: Faizan Khan <faizan.khan@travelfoodservices.com>  
 Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 2024 7:06 PM 
 To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Yash Jain <yash.jain@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sumeet Rane <sumeet.rane@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani 
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Shalki Khanna <shalki.khanna@travelfoodservices.com>; Soni Viswanathan <soni.viswanathan@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Varun Kapur <varun.kapur@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com>; Business Development <bd@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: RE: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
 Importance: High 

  

Dear All, 

  

BIAL has issued the tender for Establishing, Operating, Maintaining, and Managing South Indian Specialty (F&B) Outlet at Terminal 2 of Kempegowda International Airport, Bengaluru. Attached herewith are the Tender documents including 
annexures, Locations. Bid Submission date : 3rd Sept 2024 

  

As confirmed by Varun Sir, our standard data will remain the same which was used for the Maiyas tender. The only change is that the South Indian Specialty data needs to be updated and more enhanced to a Premium South Indian 
Specialty. 

  

Currently the proposed Option 1 brand is Kappa Chakka Kandhari. 
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Airport Tender For 
Queries 

Submission 
Submission 

Date 
Presentation 

Area 
(SQM) 

Location MMG Tenure 
Tender 

Fee 
EMD 

Marketing 
Fund 

Financial 
Criteria 

Bengaluru 

Premium 
South 
Indian 

Specialty 

17th Aug 
2024 

3rd Sept 
2024 

4 to 9  
 Sept 2024 

154 
International 

Departure 
Hall 

Higher of, Monthly 
Guarantee OR 

Progressive Revenue 
Share. 

5 Years 1,18,000/- 5,00,000/- 1% 
One 

Crore 

Technical 
Criteria 

Min of 1 years’ experience as on 31st 
March 2024 of direct operations of F&B 

outlets at Airports          
  

  

@Samarjit Sir Please confirm if the format, fonts, and theme for the technical book and presentation have been verified and approved by Varun and Gaurav. 
  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

@Shama Mam 

a. Proposed Capital Expenditure for the Outlet (CAPEX per sqm) 

b. CAPEX Bifurcation: 

1. Consultancy 2. Construction 3. Interiors, Fixtures, Fittings & Equipment 

c. Overall Concept design and approach: Rationale and justification for selecting the proposed concept, positioning of the stores, and as to how the concept shall 
create a world-class experience, appeal to the passengers and other users of the airport, and enhance revenue by maximizing sales. 

d. Demonstration of the Concept Design alignment with four key pillars of T2. 

i. Terminal in a Garden 

ii. Sustainability 

iii. Technology 

iv. Art & Culture 

e. Proposed 3D rendering from all sides. 

f. Demonstration of how the concept design shall ensure freshness and flexibility for brand evolution. Exclusive & Instagrammable design for BLR Airport shall 
be preferred. 

g. Submission of Digital Mood Board & Material Board 

h. Setup and Roll-out Plan 

i. Sustainable Construction, Setups, and Fit-outs practices that will be adopted, including but not limited to: 

i. At least 20% of the construction materials/furniture are re-furbished, reused, reclaimed, or recycled materials 

ii. Energy efficient lightings & equipment 

iii. Locally sourced construction materials 

iv. Carbon Footprint reduction methodology 
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@Soni Sir 

Currently the proposed Option 1 brand is Kappa Chakka Kandhari. 
 As per discussion between you and Varun Sir, kindly update on the option 2 and option 3 brands ASAP. In the meantime, please gather the following data from 
the Option 1, 2, and 3 brands. 

a. Brand Authorisation letter confirming that the TFSPL has right to operate the Brand Store at BLR Airport 

b. History of the proposed brand(s) 

c. Global Presence of the proposed brand(s) 

d. Category Leadership of the proposed brand(s) 

e. Unique proposition of the proposed Brand(s) 

f. Awards & Recognition & Customer Ratings etc. 

h. CSR, Sustainability and Green initiatives undertaken by the Proposed Brand                              

i. Technology and Digital 

j. Range of Products/brands that will be offered 

k. Travel Retail Oriented Menu/Product(s) for BLR Airport 

l. Proposed Sustainability and Green initiatives, including but not limited to, Product Development & manufacturing, Product Packaging, Daily Operations: 

i.                     Sustainable & Green initiatives (eg. Zero Single-use plastics in packaging & Sustainable Carry Bags etc) 

ii.                   ii. Circular economy & Resource Efficiency 

iii.                 iii. Lifecycle Carbon Analysis (reduction of Carbon footprint generated) 

m. Innovation implemented in Product, People, Processes, Project execution, and Customer Engage 
  

Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

  

From: Faizan Khan  
 Sent: Monday, August 5, 2024 12:35 PM 
 To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh <vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Yash Jain <yash.jain@travelfoodservices.com>; Shama Nair 
<shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sumeet Rane <sumeet.rane@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani 
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Shalki Khanna <shalki.khanna@travelfoodservices.com>; Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>; Soni Viswanathan <soni.viswanathan@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Cc: Varun Kapur <varun.kapur@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com>; Darpan Mehta <darpan.mehta@travelfoodservices.com>; 
Nilesh Patil <nilesh.patil@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Nair <vivek.nair@travelfoodservices.com>; Deepak Kurian <deepak.kurian@travelfoodservices.com> 
 Subject: Bangalore T2-55F South Indian Specialty Int Dept Hall 
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Dear All, 

  

Tender documents is out for Establishing, Operating, Maintaining, and Managing South Indian Specialty (F&B) Outlet at Terminal 2 of Kempegowda International Airport, Bengaluru. Attached herewith are the Tender documents including 
annexures, Locations. Bid Submission date : 3rd Sept 2024 

  

Please note that the tender is for a Premium South Indian Specialty with an area of 154 sqm with a 5-year tenure, located in the International Departure Hall at T2 BIAL. 

I will share the summary details shortly. 

  

Location Detail. 
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Warm Regards,   

Faizan Khan 

Business Development 

Travel Food Services Private Limited  

(Tel): 022 4322 4329 
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Thank You 

  

Regards, 

Faizan 

 
 
 
--  
 
In case of any queries, feel free to revert.  
 
Parwati Singh  
+91 9821697876 
022- 40214937 / 42661638 
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