From: Nikhil Bhushan

To: Asad Shamsi

Subject: Re: Renewal of SSL Certificate - travelfoodservices.com
Date: Wednesday, February 14, 2024 4:59:14 PM
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Approved

Regards,

Nikhil

+91 9820171661

From: Asad Shamsi <asad.shamsi@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 14, 2024 4:45 PM

To: Nikhil Bhushan <nikhil.bhushan@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Renewal of SSL Certificate - travelfoodservices.com

Dear Nikhil,

As discussed, Below SSL Certificate is expired and will needs to be renewed. The same will be done
through Alletec.
Request for your approval to proceed.

Sr.No. Description Total Tenure
1 SSL Certificate for 17000 Annual
*. travelfoodservices.com
(Use on Multiple URL's)

Asad Shamsi
Manager —IT

+91 9930909463

Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.

Shiv Sagar Estate, A-Block, 1st Floor,
Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli,
Mumbai-400018.
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Creating memories and inspiring

_ 1 %.s happiness through food, since 1972
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