
Outlook

Re: Celejor Cakes Oct'24# B

From Conrad Alves <conrad.alves@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Sat 11/2/2024 1:15 PM
To Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc Ajit Pawar <ajit.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Mumbai Admin <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>; Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Romit Machado <romit.machado@travelfoodservices.com>

Okay 

Best,
Conrad

On 2 Nov 2024, at 12:52, Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Hi Conrad,

Pls approve below statement for cakes ordered.

Sr Date Bill No Amount Reason
1 21-Oct 6182 2,540 Neeta and Shadab
2 22-Oct 6188 1,170 Pooja Shah cake ordered but was not cut
3 24-Oct 6199 1,370 Pooja Shah
4 29-Oct 6431 1,650 Mangesh

6,730

Thanks & Regards,
Rochelle Alphonso
Executive - Administration
Travel food services.
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