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Chennai Finance

From: Shruti Shroff
Sent: 08 April 2024 13:22
To: Chennai Finance
Subject: Re: REAL FRESH HOMECARE SERVICES

Ok to process 
 
 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Shruti Shroff 
 
Senior Manager-Finance 
TFS Kolkata 

From: Chennai Finance <chennai.finance@travelfoodservices.com> 
Sent: Monday, April 8, 2024 1:13 PM 
To: Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: REAL FRESH HOMECARE SERVICES  
  
  
  
Dear mam, 
  
PFA of Real Fresh Garbage clearence manpower invoice. 
  
Kindly check and approve for further process. 
  

Vendor name Invoice Number Invoice Date Taxable 
value   Taxes    Freight & 

Transport  

 Gross 
invoice 
value  

Nature 

REAL FRESH HOMECARE SERVICES 36/23-24 25 Mar 2024 177076 31874   208950 CLEANING SERVICES WET & DRY GARBAGE COLLECTING MANPOWER ALL TERMINAL
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Regards, 
S. Aarthi. 

 
  
  
  
  
  


