S R.M. ENTERPRISES

A7

. Exclusive Interior Decorator
22/1H/9/3, Bright Street, Ground Floor, Kolkata - 700 017

Mobile-9903707201,9038388050, Email-rmenterprisesoffical.com, GSTIN- 19ABLPI0471R1Z1, PAN NO-ABLPI0471R

R M ENTERPRISES

B/22/1/H/9/3, BRIGHT STREET, PARK
CIRCUS, KOLKATA-700017
GSTIN/UIN : 19ABLPI0471R1Z1

Invoice No. Dated

ACK-11-10-24

11/10/2024

Delivery Note-along
within 30 days of Successful

Mode/Terms of-

Reference No. & Date.

Other References-Projects Kol -Cofee

State Name : West Bengal, Code : 19 and More
BILLTO, TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED.
N.S.C.B.INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT ,VIP ROAD KAZI Dated- 11/10/2024
NAZRUL ISLAM SARANI, DUM DUM, KOLKATAWEST |Djspatch Doc No. Delivery Note Date
BENGAL- 700052
Comp GST No : 19AADCB2762L1ZF
BILLTO, TRAVEL FOOD SARVICES PRIVATE LIMITED. Dispatched through Destination
N.S.C.B.International Airport Vip Road,
Kazi Nazrul Islam Sarani, Dum Dum, Cost Center Code : 90360001
Kolkata, West Bengal, 700052 . }
Comp GST No : 19AADCB2762L1ZF Cost Center Name : KOL -Cofee and More
Sl Description of |HSN/SAC Quantity Rate Amount
No. Goods
1 SS Skirting -6" L Patti Fitting 9954 30 650 19500.00
2 Flooring Corner Bitting 9954 30 100 3000.00
3 Vinayle Flooring Labour Charge 9954 160 65 10400.00
Total 32900.00
CGST 9% 2961.00
SGST 9% 2961.00
Grand Total 38822.00
HSN/SAC 9954 Taxable CGST SGST
Value Rate Amount Rate Amount
Total 5922.00 9% 2961.00 9% 2961.00
Tax Amount (in words) : Indian Rupees- Tharty eight thousand eight hundred twenty two Only
Declaration- Mrunal joshi -8399081380, Binu Balachandran

We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the goods described and that all particulars are true and correct.




E Outlook

Fw: Flooring work Quotation in CNM-4

From Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Fri 10/18/2024 10:04 PM
To Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

MJ 1 attachments (212 KB)
airport cafe and more ( ACK-11-10-24).pdf;

Dear Rakesh,

As per below approval mail, please find the attached invoice and process payment
for flooring work at CNM - 4 outlet.

Thanks,
Nazrul

From: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2024 9:44 AM

To: sujat099@gmail.com <sujat099@gmail.com>

Subject: Fw: Flooring work Quotation in CNM-4

FYI

Get Outlook for Android




From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Monday, October 7, 2024 11:34:02 AM

To: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Flooring work Quotation in CNM-4

ok

CELEBRATING
Creating memeoeries and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
FEARE

Ty . i s =
K-

From: Nazrul Mondal <nazrul.mondal@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 07 October 2024 11:14

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Flooring work Quotation in CNM-4

Dear Sir,
Please check the attached quote for flooring work at CNM-4.

Thanks
Nazrul



