Tax Invoice

PROCHEM LABORATORY

Regd. Office : A-403, Jayanti Society , Sr No.183/2
Kate Nagar, Pimple Saudagar, Pune-411027.Maharashtr
GSTIN/UIN: 27ATBPK5245P129

State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27

E-Mail : varshasw@yahoo.co.in / accounts@prochemlab.com

Invoice No. Dated
0048/2024-2025 17-Jul-24
Delivery Note Mode/Terms of Payment

Reference No. & Date.

Other References

Consignee (Ship to)

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

Ist Floor, Block A South Wing , Shiv Sagar Estate , Dr.
Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai Suburban,
Maharashtra, 400018

Buyer's Order No.

Dated

Dispatch Doc No.

Delivery Note Date

GSTIN/UIN - 27AADCB2762L1ZI Dispatched through Destination
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27
Contact person : Aratika Roy Terms of Delivery
E-Mail - aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com
Buyer (Bill to)
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
Ist Floor, Block A South Wing , Shiv Sagar Estate , Dr.
Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai Suburban,
Maharashtra, 400018
GSTIN/UIN : 27AADCB2762L1ZI
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27
Contact person . Aratika Roy
E-Mail - aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com
Sli Particulars HSN/SAC | GST Quantity Rate per Amount
No. Rate
1 Valuable Service 998221 18 % 15,000.00
Guidance on Verification and Review
Of 5 Labels
OUTPUT- CGST 9% 1,350.00
OUTPUT- SGST 9% 1,350.00
Total ¥17,700.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) E. & O.E
INR Seventeen Thousand Seven Hundred Only
HSN/SAC Taxable CGST SGST/UTGST Total
Value Rate Amount Rate Amount Tax Amount
998221 15,000.00 9% 1,350.00 9% 1,350.00 2,700.00
Total 15,000.00 1,350.00 1,350.00 2,700.00

Tax Amount (in words) :

Company's PAN . ATBPK5245P

Declaration

We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the Service
described and that all particulars are true and correct . Ms. Varsha

Khatake, Founder and Propritor, Prochem Laboratory. We will
happy to provide any further information that you may need, &
trust that you would count on us fulfill your demands, which will
receive our prompt & careful attention. ( No refund policy )

INR Two Thousand Seven Hundred Only

Company's Bank Details
Bank Name

Al/c No.

Branch & IFS Code

: HDFC BANK (Prochem Laboratory)
: 50200085732648

. PIMPLE SAUDAGAR & HDFC0002524

for PROCHEM LABORATORY

Authorised Signatory

This is a Computer Generated Invoice




RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>
Tue 7/2/2024 3:58 PM

To:Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc:Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>;Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>;Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>;Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

[I]J 1 attachments (29 KB)
Raise Invoice for 1 no label reveiw of SUGAR CANE JUICE;

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Ok.

Regards
Chhabir

From: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Sent: 02 July 2024 14:34

To: Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>

Cc: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin
Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Chhabir,
Please approve consultant cost of Rs. 15k + GST for label verification.

Warm Regards

Paresh

From: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 01 July 2024 18:56

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir
Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>

Subject: FW: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Paresh

Required approval on below amount for verification of all labels from consultant .
5 labels - cost 15k+GST

Thanks
Farhin



From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 01 July 2024 18:16

To: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Farhin,
Each verification will cost 3k+ GST, for 5 items it will cost 15k+GST .
Please get this approved

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 01 July 2024 18:08

To: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Hi Aratrika
We need to verify these all labels from consultant (Varsha Ma’am) and get confirmation on same.

Thanks
Farhin

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 13 June 2024 12:17

To: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarjit Pani
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Paresh,
PFB link of final nourish juice label designs print file in pdf format.

Download link: https://we.tl/t-gSoz20pgsk

Also attached are view files in low resolution for reference.

Thank You,
Amita

From: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 13, 2024 12:11 PM




To: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarijit
Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Hi Amita
Labels ok from my end

Thanks
Farhin

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 13 June 2024 12:08

To: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarjit Pani
<samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Farhin,

PFA of revised design, kindly confirm the same.

Thank You
Amita

From: Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 3:24 PM

To: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarijit
Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Amita



Please correct the storage condition statement-
Storage Condition- Keep refrigerated between 2-5 C & After opening it should be consumed within 2 days while
store at temperature range of 2-5C

Rest all is good to go.

Thanks
Farhin

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 12 June 2024 11:36

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Farhin,

PFA of revised label designs with suggested changes done in Sodium section for Valencia Orange,
Sugarcane & Mix Fruit. Request you to kindly confirm to release final print files.

Thank You,
Amita

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 11:17 AM

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Samarjit Pani <samarijit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Paresh,

Please find attached the email reference regarding the latest update following Aratrika's email. As we
discussed yesterday on call, we anticipate receiving clarity from QA today, and consequently, the print
files will be released accordingly. We expect this process to be completed by the end of the day today.

Thank You,
Amita



From: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Sent: Wednesday, June 12, 2024 10:51 AM

To: Samarjit Pani <samarijit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Amita Dustakar
<amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>;
Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan Hanamghar
<madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas
Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Samarjit,
Request to confirm by when final artwork will be received.

Warm Regards

Paresh

From: Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 23 May 2024 11:10

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; meena.shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev
Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>;
Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; gaurav.dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Hi Paresh,

As we have been updating you all, we cannot give you final labels unless they are signed off. In order to
do that we had to get the dummy labels signed off, which your vendor was unable to make, and we are
getting the same done as vinyl stickers.

Once the same is done and signed off we will have the artwork released. Please be assured that the work
is on and not being delayed.

Best Regards
Samarjit Pani (he/him)
GM, Marketing, Travel Food Services

From: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>
Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2024 11:03:01 AM
To: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>




Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade
<chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy
Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhushan Gawade <bhushan.gawde @travelfoodservices.com>; Madan
Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>; Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com>; Gaurav Dewan
<gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Amita,
Request to share final label file.

Warm Regards

Paresh

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 15 May 2024 12:11

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Madan Hanamghar <madan.hanamghar@travelfoodservices.com>;
Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; meena.shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev
Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>;
Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh <farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>;
Bhushan Gawade <phushan.gawde@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Thank You, Paresh.

Dear Madan,
As discussed, sharing below link of Nourish Juice Label Artwork for Sample print.

Download link: https://we.tl/t-irS7JjnlXZ

Thank You,
Amita

From: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2024 9:26 PM

To: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>;
Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan
Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>;




Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Amita,
ABC stand for Apple Beat Carrot juice.

For other information, have asked vendor to share details.
Warm Regards

Paresh

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 14 May 2024 15:02

To: Samarijit Pani <samarijit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Chhabir Sahoo
<chhabir.sahoo@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; meena.shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika
Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Farhin Shaikh
<farhin.shaikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra <sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan
Bobade <chetan.bobade@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Dear Chabbir,

We are currently reviewing the product specifications for the mixed fruit juice, and I would like to kindly
request your confirmation regarding the composition of the ingredients, particularly the inclusion and
concentration of banana juice, which is listed as 7%.

Additionally, we would like to request information on ABC Juice, as per our previous discussions with
Purchase Team. Please include all relevant specifications and ingredient compositions

1. Full form of ABC Juice
2. Bar code
3. Nutrional Value Chart

Thank You,
Amita

From: Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, May 13, 2024 12:18 PM

To: Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Meena
Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

Hi Samarjit,



I am working on rest of the label designs as per the Sir's two approved options and shall share all the
creatives for your review by tomorrow EOD.

Thank You,
Amita

From: Samarijit Pani <samarijit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, May 13, 2024 11:05 AM

To: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Amita Dustakar <amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Meena
Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

(@Amita Dustakar what is the status of this?
(@Paresh Patil Juice ABC is Apple Beet and Carrot, | assume.

With Regards
Samarjit Pani
(he/him)

GM, Marketing

-

sofe space ~

From: Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Sent: 08 May 2024 15:12

To: Samarjit Pani <samarijit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Amita Dustakar
<amita.dustakar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Manish Thakkar Kcorp <manish.thakkar@k-corp.in>; Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Meena
Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Discussion - In House Juice Brand

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Samarijit,
As discussed, please find below juice variant to be started

JUICE MIX FRUIT

JUICE ORANGE RAW
JUICE SUGARCANE RAW
JUICE ABC

JUICE COCONUT

Warm Regards

Paresh



