TAX INVOICE

Phone: +91-33-40084792 ;Z ,

Email: powerelectricals1960@gmail.com W 5&6&‘6&&

Mobile : 9547000836 12-B, Netaji Subhas Road (1St Floor) Room No: 27
Kolkata -700 001.

PAN No: AYBPD1892)

GSTIN: 19AYBPD1892J1ZA | ORIGINAL BUYERS COPY
Invoice No: 491 (2023-24) Invoice Date: 26-12-2023
Challan No.: 463 Challan Date: 26-12-2023
Order No.: Order Date:
LR No.: LR Date:
Bill To Ship To
Name: Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt. Ltd. Name: Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt. Ltd.
Address: NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum, Address:NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum,
Kolkata - 52 Kolkata - 52
GSTIN: 19AAECT8193L12) GSTIN:
STATE: West Bengal |CODE: 19 STATE: West Bengal CODE: 19
Interest will be charges at the rate 24% per Annum on over due account.
Si e HSN . CGST SGST
No Description Code Qty. | Unit Rate | Amount Rate | Amount | Rate | Amount Total
1|20Amp Industrial Top 2P + E 8536 12.00 265.00| 3,180.00( 9% 286.20 9% 286.20 3,752.40
2|32Amp SP MCB Switch Type Havell's 8536 12.00 120.00| 1,440.00( 9% 129.60| 9% 129.60 1,699.20
3[20Amp DP MCB Switch Type Havell's 8536 3.00 315.00 945.00( 9% 85.05| 9% 85.05 1,115.10
4|16Amp Top Anchor 8536 12.00 80.00 960.00( 9% 86.40| 9% 86.40 1,132.80
5[6Amp Top Anchor 8536 12.00 58.00 696.00| 9% 62.64| 9% 62.64 821.28
6[6Module Plate Crabtree 8538 6.00 132.00 792.00| 9% 71.28| 9% 71.28 934.56
7[20Amp Switch Crabtree 8536 20.00 180.00| 3,600.00( 9% 324.00( 9% 324.00 4,248.00
8[20Amp Socket Crabtree 8536 20.00 230.00| 4,600.00( 9% 414.00( 9% 414.00 5,428.00
9(36W Electronic Ballast Philips 8504 10.00 130.00| 1,300.00( 9% 117.00| 9% 117.00 1,534.00
10(28W T5 Electronic Ballast Osram 8504 10.00 240.00| 2,400.00( 9% 216.00f 9% 216.00 2,832.00
11{60W B.C. Lamp Philips 8539 10.00 18.00 180.00| 9% 16.20 9% 16.20 212.40
12|Glue Pad 8516 15.00 320.00| 4,800.00( 9% 432.00( 9% 432.00 5,664.00
13[10mm China Saddle 8536 1.00 75.00 75.00| 9% 6.75| 9% 6.75 88.50
14[12mm China Saddle 8536 1.00 80.00 80.00| 9% 7.201 9% 7.20 94.40

Total| 25,048.00| CGST| 2,254.32| SGST| 2,254.32| 29,556.64

RUPEES: Twenty Nine Thousand Five Hundred & Fifty Six Paise Sixty Four Only.

Bank Name : HDFC Bank E.& O.E
Account No. : 50200017787797
Branch : Jardine House Branch, Kolkata 700001 For Power Electricals

IFSC Code : HDFC0001015




RE: Materials Received Confirmation - Power Electricals

Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Wed 6/5/2024 9:59 AM

To:Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc:Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>

ok
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From: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 05 June 2024 09:59

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Fw: Materials Received Confirmation - Power Electricals

Dear Sir

Please approve the following pending Power Electricals Invoices for Kolkata:-

Vendor's Taxable . . !
SL . R Invoice Cost GL . Value of| Taxes (if Freight & (A
Description Invoice [Department GL Description
no Date Centre |Code the|any) Transport (1
(Number !
Invoice T
INV-486(2023- |21-Dec- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
1|[Power Electricals 24) 2023 OPERATION 90311000|583050 ’ 2,875 518 3
INV-491(2023- |26-Dec- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
2|Power Electricals 24) 2023 OPERATION 90311000|583050 : 25,048  |4,509 2
INV-346(2023- [21-Sep- |[KOL OTHER . .
3|Power Electricals 24) 202 |OPERATION 90311000[583050|RePairMaint. Other 1, 509 |50 1
INV-299(2023- [29-Aug- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
4[Power Electricals 24) 2023 OPERATION 90311000(583050| P ’ 21,502  [3,870 2
INV-555(2023- |6-Feb- KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
5|Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000[583050] P ’ 21,985  [3,957 2
INV-573(2023- [20-Feb- |[KOL OTHER Renain/Maint. Other
6|Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000[583050] P ) 9,150 1,647 I
INV-597(2023- |7-Mar- KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
7|Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000(583050| P ’ 4,530 815 5
INV-600(2023- [11-Mar- [KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
8|Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000[583050] P ) 10,218 1,839 1
INV-608(2023- [13-Mar- |[KOL OTHER Repair/Maint, Other
9|Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000[583050 ) 5,400 972 6
INV-613(2023- |15-Mar- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other
10[Power Electricals 24) 2024 OPERATION 90311000|583050 : 42,255 {7,606 4

Thanks & Regards
Avirup Das
Finance Kolkata

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 4, 2024 4:58 PM

To: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Materials Received Confirmation - Power Electricals

Dear Avirup,
I checked that, vendor power electricals all the attached materials my department have already received.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

e

From: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 31 May 2024 14:12

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Materials Received Confirmation - Power Electricals




Hi Chandan Da

Please confirm following materials are received as invoices were missing, no RA stamp available:-

'Vendor's Taxable '
SL . . Invoice Cost GL L. Value of| Taxes (if Freight &|.
no Description Invoice Date Department Centre |Code GL Description thelany) Transport
Number . .
Invoice

INV-486(2023- |21-Dec- |KOL OTHER Repait/Maint. Other

1{Power Electricals 24) 2023 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ' 2,875 518
INV-491(2023- [26-Dec- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

2|Power Electricals 24) 2023 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ’ 25,048 14,509
INV-346(2023- |21-Sep-  |KOL OTHER . .

3|Power Electricals 4) 2023 b OPERATION 90311000| 583050 PairMaint. Other ;50 1154
INV-299(2023- [29-Aug- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

4[Power Electricals 24) 2023 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ’ 21,502  |3,870
INV-555(2023- KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

5|Power Electricals 24) 6-Feb-2024(OPERATION 90311000/583050] ’ 21,985  |3,957
INV-573(2023- [20-Feb- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

6|Power Electricals 24) 2024 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ' 9,150 1,647
INV-597(2023- |7-Mar- KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

7|Power Electricals 24) 2024 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ' 4,530 815
INV-600(2023- [11-Mar- [KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

8|Power Electricals 24) 2024 (OPERATION 90311000/583050] ' 10,218 1,839
INV-608(2023- |13-Mar- |KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

9|Power Electricals 24) 2024 (OPERATION 90311000[583050] P ’ 5,400 972
INV-613(2023- [15-Mar- |[KOL OTHER Repair/Maint. Other

10|Power Electricals 24) 2024 (OPERATION 90311000|583050] P ’ 42,255 7,606

Thanks & Regards
Avirup Das
Finance Kolkata




