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Invoices TFS

From: Vikas Kapoor
Sent: 17 September 2024 12:59
To: Pratap Singh; Parag Pandey
Cc: Invoices TFS; Rituparn Sharma
Subject: RE: Pannu Car Rental  Bill

Approved  
 

From: Pratap Singh <pratap.singh@travelfoodservices.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, September 17, 2024 12:58 PM 
To: Vikas Kapoor <vikas.kapoor@travelfoodservices.com> 
Cc: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Rituparn Sharma <Rituparn.sharma@travelfoodservices.com> 
Subject: Pannu Car Rental Bill 
 
Dear Sir, 
  
Please find attached "Pannu Car Rental" scanned bill that you used on dated 08.08.24 
 
Request your approval to make the payment as per same. 
 

  

Invoice Date Inv no Car No. Car Type Duty Date Name of Bill Guest Net Amt 

10-08-24 I240800018526 7559 Crysta 08.08.24 
.TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES 
PVT.LTD 

Mr.Vikas 
Kapoor 

        3,598 

 

  

  

Thanks & Regards 

  

Pratap Singh 

  




