Phone: +91-33-40084792

Email: powerelectricals1960@gmail.com

Mobile : 9547000836

TAX INVOICE

Powern Electrnicals

12-B, Netaji Subhas Road (1St Floor) Room No: 27

Kolkata -700 001.

PAN No: AYBPD1892J

GSTIN: 1SAYBPD1892J1ZA

| ORIGINAL BUYERS COPY

Invoice No: 390 (2024-25) Invoice Date: 06-12-2024
Challan No.: 374 Challan Date: 06-12-2024 |
Order No.: Order Date:
LR No.; LR Date:
Bill To Ship To
Name: Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. Name: Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.
Address: NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum, Address:NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum,
Kolkata - 52 Kolkata - 52
GSTIN: 19AADCB2762L1ZF GSTIN: 19AADCB2762L1ZF
STATE: West Bengal |CODE: 19 STATE: West Bepgal CODE: 19
Interest will be charges at the rate 24% per Annum on over due account.
sl - HSN CGST SGST
No. Description Code Qty. Unit Rate | Amount Rate | Amount | Rate | Amount Total
1|LED Light Fitting with oW Lamp WW E27 940540 6.00|Pcs| 2,200.00| 13,200.00| 9% | 1,188.00| 9% 1,188.00| 15,576.00
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Total| 13,200.00| CGST| 1,188.00| SGST 1,188.00 15,576.00

RUPEES: Fifteen Thousand Five Hundred & Seventy Six Only.

Bank Name : HDFC Bank
Account No. : 50200017787797

IFSC Code : HDFC0001015

Branch : Jardine House Branch, Kolkata 700001

For #6wer Electricals




12/6/24,'4:18 PM Gmail - Fw; Approval required

wg- Gmaii Avijit Dey <powerelectricals1960@gmail.com>
Fw: Approval required

1 message

Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com> Fri, Dec 6, 2024 at 12:04 PM

To: "powerelectricals 1960@gmail.com" <powerelectricals1960@gmail.com>
Cc: Kalkata RA <kolkata.ra@travelfoodservices.com>, Kolkata Stores <kolkata.stores@travelfoodservices.com>

FYI

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 06 December 2024 12:03

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.coms>
Subject: RE: Approval required

ok

CELERRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972

YEARS
_’;“4":‘_ IO NI R . K] .{' [fs [ TR e

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.coms>

Sent: 06 December 2024 11:12
To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Approval required

Dear sir,

Please approved below intemational lounge upper huffel area light set

S1 No Details Qty Rate Amount GST Total Amount

1 Wall light set 6 2200 13200 2376 15576

https://mail._qooqle.Qom/mawu/()/?ik=azeamﬁ90ﬁ&\,iﬁw=nmgmmhza|mppmthjd:thrﬁd-f‘ 1817671782170806303&cimpl=mog 10176717 02470005999 1/2



12/6/24, 4:18 PM , Gmail - Fw: Approval required

.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das

Travel Food Services

https://mail.qooqIe.com/mail/u/0/?ik=a2&ﬁfﬂﬁﬂﬂﬁ&view=pfﬂsearf:h=a|I&permthid-throad-f: 1817671782470805393&simpl=msg-:101767 1702479095393 2/2
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