Phone: +91-33-40084792
Email: powerelectricals1960@gmail.com
Mobile : 9547000836

Powen Electnicals

12-B, Netaji Subhas Road (1St Floor) Room No: 27

Kolkata -700 001.

TAX INVOICE

|PAN No: AYBPD1892J
“IGSTIN: 19AYBPD1892J1ZA | ORIGINAL BUYERS COPY
Invoice No: 341 (2024-25) Invoice Date: 07-11-2024
Challan No.: Challan Date:
Order No.: Order Date:
LR No.: LR Date:
Bill To Ship To
Name: Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. Name: Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.
Address: NSCBI Airport, VIP Road, Dum Dum, Address:NSCBI Airport, VIP Road, Dum Dum,
Kolkata - 52 Kolkata - 52
GSTIN: 19AADCB2762L1ZF GSTIN:
STATE: West Bengal ICODE: 19 STATE: West Bengal CODE: 19
Interest will be charges at the rate 24% per Annum on over due account.
sl s HSN ] CGST SGST
No Description Code Qty. Unit Rate | Amount Rate | Amount | Rate | Amount Total
1|20Amp Industrial Top 853690 | 10.00|Pcs 265.00| 2,650.00| 9% 238.50| 9% 238.50 3,127.00
2|9W LED Filament Lamp Dimmable 8940510 | 10.00|Pcs 378.00| 3,780.00| 9% 340.20| 9% 340.20 4,460.40
3[15W LED Downlight Reund White Havells| 940510 6.00|Pcs 850.00| 5,100.00| 9% 459.00|] 9% 459.00 6,018.00
4/2.55q.mm U-Type Lugs 853650 | 100.00|Pcs 7.00 700.00| 9% 63.00| 9% 63.00 826.00
° 5|6000W Deep Fat Frier Coil Batura(AP) 830710 3.00|Pcs| 2,150.00| 6,450.00| 9% 580.50| 9% 580.50 7,611.00
6|LED Indicator Panel Lamp Red 940510| 2G.00|Pcs 95.00| 1,9C0.00| 9% 171.00f 9% 171.00 2,242.00
7|LED Indicator Panel Lamp Green 940510 | 20.00|Pcs 95.00f 1,900.00| 9% 171.00| 9% 171.00 2,242.00
8[1.5mm Heat Proof Wire 854460| 15.00:Mt 60.00 900.00| 9% 81.00| 9% 81.00 1,062.00
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Total| 23,380.00| CGST| 2,104.20| SGST| 2,104.20| 27,588.40
#| RUPEES: Twenty Seven Thousand Five Hundred & Eighty Eight Paise Forty Only.
Bank Name : HDFC Bank Documents Submission Delails: & O.E
Account No. : 50200017787797 oo
Branch : Jardine House Branch, Kolkata 700001 | goation- N a) Nhea e [6 213> _For<PBwer Electricals
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11/7/24, 1:27 PM Gmail - Approval required for electrical materials.

M Gmiall Avijit Dey <powerelectricals1960@gmail.com>
Approval required for electrical materials.

1 message

Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com> Thu, Nov 7, 2024 at 12:02 PM

To: "powerelectricals 1960@gmail.com” <powerelectricals 1960@gmail.com>
Cc: Kolkata Stores <kolkata.stores@travelfoodservices.com>, Kolkata RA <kolkata.ra@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Team,
Please supply attached Electricals materials urgently.

With Regards
Chandan Kumar Das
Travel Food Services

e bt e

From: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 07 November 2024 11:59

To: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfocdservices.com>
Subject: RE: Approval required for electrical mateiials.

ok
CELEBRATING
=" % Creating memories and inspiring
" B%.# happiness through food, since 1972
o eans
- P Lkt PR =. o g e
3

From: Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 06 November 2024 21:41

To: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.coms>

Subject: Approval required for electrical materials.

Dear Sir,

Please approve, find the attached electrical material's with cost for all counter.

Regards,
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=a2eef0590a&view=pt&search=ali&permthid=thread-f: 181504435257 19544448&simpl=msg-f: 181504435257 1954444
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11/7/24, 1:27 PM Gmail - Approval required for electrical materials.
, Chandan Kumar Das
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.Ea QUOTATION for Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd. as on 06-11-2024 (1).pdf
470K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=a2eef0590a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1815044 352571954444 &simpl=msg-f:1815044352571954444 2/2



Phone: +91-33-40084792
Email: powerelectricals1960@gmail.com
Mobile : 9547000836

QUOTATION

Power Electnicals

12-B, Netaji Subhas Road (1St Floor) Room No: 27

Kolkata

-700 001.

PAN No: AYBPD1892J

GSTIN: 19AYBPD1892J1ZA

!

Quotation No: 339

Quotation Date: 06-11-2024

Bill To

Name: Travel Food Services Pvt. Ltd.
Address: NSCBI Airport, Dum Dum,

Account No. : 50200017787797
Branch : Jardine House Branch, Kolkata 700001
IFSC Code : HDFC0001015

Kolkata - 52
GSTIN: 19AADCB2762L1ZF GSTIN:
STATE: West Bengal [CODE: 19 STATE: West Bengal |copE: 19
Interest will be charges at the rate 24% per Annum on over due account.
sl N HSN . CGST SGST
No. * Description Code Qty. Unit Rate [ Amount Rate | Amount | Rate | Amount Total
1]60-200C Thermostat with Probe Germany 392630 | 10.00|Pcs 979.92| 9,799.20| 9% 881.93| 9% 881.93| 11,563.06
2|20Amp Industrial Top 853690 | 10.00|Pcs 265.00f 2,650.00|] 9% 238.50| 9% 238.50 3,127.00
3|6Module PVC Box Crabtree 853890| 5.00[Pcs 130.00 650.00| 9% 58.50| 9% 58.50 767.00
4|6Module PVC Plate Crabtree 853890 5.00(Pcs 120.00 600.00| 9% 54.00f 9% 54.00 708.00
5]16AMp Switch Crabtree 853669 | 15.00|Pcs 180.00| 2,700.00| 9% 243.00| 9% 243.00 3,186.00
6|16AMp Socket Crabtree 853650 | 15.00|Pcs 230.00f 3,450.00| 9% 310.50] 9% 310.50 4,071.00
7|36W Flectronic Ballast 850410| 10.00|Pcs 130.00f 1,300.00| 9% 117.00| 9% 117.00 1,534.00
8|10mm China Saddle 853650 1.00{Pkt 80.00 80.00| 9% 7.20| 9% 7.20 94.40
9 | b2NHRE SRS — 940510 5 00|Pcs 750.00] 3,750.00| 9% 337.50| 9% 337.50 4,425.00
10|9W LED Filament Lamp Dimmable 940510 | 10.00|Pcs 378.00f 3,780.00| 9% 340.20| 9% 340.20 4,460.40
11{15W LED Downlight Round White Havells{ 940510 | 6.00|Pcs 850.00] 5,100.00| 9% 459.00| 9% 459.00 6,018.00
12|20W LED Tubelight White 940510 5.00(Pcs 150.00 750.00| 9% 67.50| 9% 67.50 885.00
13|10W LED Tubelight White 940510 5.00|Pcs 140.00 700.00] 9% 63.00| 9% 63.00 826.00
14[12mm China Saddle 853650 1.00|Pkt 90.00 90.00| 9% 8.10| 9% 8.10 106.20
15[2.55g.mm U-Type Lugs 853650 | 100.00|Pcs 7.00 700.00| 9% 63.00| 9% 63.00 826.00
16|5.5W GUS.3 LED Spot WW Osram 853650 | 10.00|Pcs 230.00f 2,300.00| 9% 207.00| 9% 207.00 2,714.00
17{300mm PVC Cable Tie 853650 1.00| Pkt 210.00 210.00| 9% 18.90| 9% 18.90 247.80
18/200mm PVC Cable Tie 853349 1.00| Pkt 280.00 280.00| 9% 25.20| 9% 25.20 330.40
19|6000W Deep Fat Frier Coil (AP) 830710 3.0C|Pcs| 2,150.00| 6,450.00| 9% 580.50| 9% 580.50 7,611.00
20[PVC Tape 854610| 20.00|Pcs 10.50 210.00| 9% 18.90| 9% 18.90 247.80
21]1.5mm Heat Proof Wire 854460| 15.00|Mty 60.00 900.00| 9% 81.00| 9% 81.00 1,062.00
22|1500W Brain Marie Coil 851610 | 15.00|Pcs 650.00| 9,750.00| 9% 877.50| 9% 877.50| 11,505.00
23]1.55g.mm X 2C Cu Cable Havell's / Polyca| 854460| 1.00|Coil 3,839.50| 3,839.50| 9% 345.56| 9% 345.56 4,530.61
24|3Ft LED Strip Light White $40510{ 15.00|Pcs 120.00| 1,800.00| 9% 162.00| 9% 162.00 2,124.00
25|LED Indicator Panel Lamp Red 940510 | 20.00|Pcs|  95.00f 1,900.00| 9% 171.00] 9% 171.00 2,242.00
26|LED Indicator Panel Lamp Green 940510 | 20.00|Pcs 95.00| 1,900.00| 9% 171.00| 9% 171.00 2,242.00
Total| 65,638.70| CGST| 5,907.48| SGST| 5,907.48| 77,453.67
RUPEES:
Bank Name : HDFC Bank E.& O.E

For Power Electricals




