


SNo Item Code
HSN\SAC 

Code Item Description Description 2 Item Category UOM Unit Cost Qty GST% VAT % Excise
Total Tax 

Amount(ININR)
Total Amount

(ININR)
1 7000038 84239010 REFRIGERATOR Fridge - 240ltr- Model no. - 

VC250
NOS 23,000.00 1 18.00 0.00 0 23000.00

Total Unit 1.00
payment term- 50% advance with GST & bal within 30days after delivery. Warranty - 1 year from invoice date. Freight & 
installation & Unloading extra at actual. Outlet Name - Nestcafe

Total Taxable INR 23,000.00

Excise Amount 0.00
IGST Amount 4,140.00

a) Products to be Supplied by 
Supplier at own cost

b) Any deficiency in Documents and Process will be liability of the supplier only Cess 0.00

c) Delivery schedule to be 
taken from the Buyer before 
Despatching the mater

d) PLEASE SEND THE ORIGINAL COMMERCIAL/GST INVOICE ALONG WITH THE MATERIAL TO THE 
DELIVERY ADDRESS.

0.00

e) The Payment of taxes will 
be Released once the Taxes is 
Credited to our Account or 
the GST Portal

Total INR Incl. Taxes 27,140.00

Disclaimer - Unless informed to us it is assumed that you are not registered as MSME with the respective government authority.  If you have not yet provided the MSME details along with proof kindly provide the same at 
the earliest.  Alternatively once you get registered then provide us relevant proof to update our records.
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Vendor No. V000376
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001858

Page No: 106-12-2023  13:22:41
Blue Star Limited9A, Blue Star House, Ghatkopar Link RoadSakinaka, Andheri EastMUMBAI, 400072India

Shipped Location
LKN Dom NescafeChaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,LUCKNOW, 226009IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationLKN Dom NescafeChaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,226009IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 06-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

09ABICS8699F1ZHGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAACB4487D1ZSVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email crdnad_support@bluestarindia.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Vendor No. V000376
Purchase Order

Order Number PO/SKPL/23-24/001858

Page No: 206-12-2023  13:22:42
Blue Star Limited9A, Blue Star House, Ghatkopar Link RoadSakinaka, Andheri EastMUMBAI, 400072India

Shipped Location
LKN Dom NescafeChaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,LUCKNOW, 226009IndiaIndia

Invoice LocationLKN Dom NescafeChaudhary Charan Singh International AirportAmausi, Lucknow,226009IndiaIN

SEMOLINA KITCHENS PVT LTD1ST FLOOR, Block A, Shiv Sagar Estate, Dr Annie Besant Road,Worli, MumbaiMUMBAI, 400018
P.A.N. No. AAACB4487D Contact PersonContact No.E-Mail 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com 022-43224304kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.comETA: PO Entry DatePayment Terms 06-12-2023

Corporate Address

State Name MaharashtraComp GST No. 27ABICS8699F1ZJ

09ABICS8699F1ZHGSTIN No.

State 27

State Code
Vendor GST No. 27AAACB4487D1ZSVendor Inv. No.Vendor Fax No.Vendor Email crdnad_support@bluestarindia.com

Requisition No.
Project ID GENOrder Address Capex-NSOPO Type
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Abdul Rehman

From: Abdul Rehman
Sent: 06 December 2023 10:53
To: Swapnil Sutar
Subject: FW: TC Recommendation - Blue Star -  Kitchen Equipment for Lucknow Airport - Terminal 3

Please create PO  
 
Thanks & Regards, 
Abdul Rehman 
📱 | ☎  +91 9920292129 
Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited. 
 

From: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com>  
Sent: 06 December 2023 10:25 
To: Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in> 
Cc: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Saikat Pal <Saikat.Pal@adani.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>; 
Akshay Sharma <akshay.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Pankaj Rohatgi <Pankaj.Rohatgi@adani.com>; Sanjiv Dhawan <Sanjiv.Dhawan@adani.com> 
Subject: TC Recommendation - Blue Star - Kitchen Equipment for Lucknow Airport - Terminal 3 
 
Dear Irfan/Sandeep 
 
Please find our below recommendation for you to proceed. Quotation you may refer in trail mail for your reference. 
 
SUMMARY 

Sl. No. Project Location Amount w/o Tax GST Amount with Tax Vendor 

1 AJ Kitchen, LKO LKO 1,89,000 34,020 2,23,020 Blue Star 
2 CIP Lounge, LKO LKO 3,36,000 60,480 3,96,480 Blue Star 
3 Nestcafe LKO 23,000 4,140 27,140 Blue Star 
4 SHAWARAMA LKO 87,000 15,660 1,02,660 Blue Star 
5 TACOS & BURGERS LKO 60,000 10,800 70,800 Blue Star 
6 INDIAN KITCHEN LKO 60,000 10,800 70,800 Blue Star 
7 Carl's LKO 1,21,000 21,780 1,42,780 Blue Star 

 TOTAL  8,76,000 1,57,680 10,33,680.00  
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DETAILED REQUIREMENT AS PER BOQ 

Sl. NO. Project Item No. Product 
Description Size Make Model UOM Qty Rate   Amount  Vendor Remarks 

88 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 07 Reach In 
Freezer 

700 x 
880 x 
2043 

Blue Star RF2D700GP No 1            65,000             65,000  New Model No - RF2D550N 

89 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 08 Reach In 
Chiller 

700 x 
880 x 
2043 

Blue Star RC2D700GP No 1            56,000             56,000  New Model No - RC2D550N 

110 AJ Kitchen, LKO FO -12 

Three Door 
Under 
Counter 
Refrigerator ( 
Compressor 
on LHS) 

1805 x 
700 x 
850 

Blue Star UC3100GP No 1            68,000             68,000  Model no - UC3100GC 

125 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-01 

2 DOOR 
VERTICAL 
HALF 
FREEZER & 
HALF CHILLER 

680 x 
755 x 
1965Ht. 

Blue Star RC2D640E No  1            56,000             56,000  New Model No - RC2D550N 

141 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-16 

2 DOOR U/C 
CHILLER. 
WITH 
LOCKABLE 
CASTOR 
WHEELS (2 
Nos.WITH 
BREAK 
INFRONT & 2 
Nos. 
WITHOUT 
BREAK)  & 
HEATING 
ELEMENT 
FOR DRAIN 

1380 x 
700 x 
850Ht 

Blue Star UC2100A No  2            60,000         1,20,000  UC2100GC 
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147 CIP Lounge, LKO BC-06 OPEN DECK 
CHILLER 

830 x 
600 x 
1400 

ELAN 
PRO/BLUE 
STAR OR 
EQUIVALENT 

  No  1        1,60,000         1,60,000  Model - KORAL12CDL Dimension -1285x750x1930

172 Nestcafe   Fridge - 
240ltr   Blue Star   No 1            23,000             23,000  Model no. - VC250 

182 SHAWARAMA SH-07 Undercounter 
chiller 2 Door 

1380 x 
700 x 
850 

Blue Star UC2100A No 1            60,000             60,000  UC2100GC 

185 SHAWARAMA SH-10 VISI COLLER 
560 X 
618 X 
1815 

Blue Star AS PER 
BRAND No 1            27,000             27,000  Model No. - SC375F    Dimension - 576x686x1724

192 TACOS & BURGERS TB-07 Undercounter 
chiller 2 Door 

1380 x 
700 x 
850 

Blue Star UC2100A No 1            60,000             60,000  UC2100GC 

205 INDIAN KITCHEN IN-13 Undercounter 
chiller 2 Door 

1380 x 
700 x 
850 

Blue Star UC2100A No 1            60,000             60,000  UC2100GC 

251 Carl's 17 2- doors 
Freezer    Blue star RF2D700GC No 1            65,000             65,000  New Model No - RF2D550N 

252 Carl's 18 2-doors 
Chiller    Blue star RC2D700GC No 1            56,000             56,000  New Model No - RC2D550N 

  TOTAL                        8,76,000    
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani 
 

From: Pankaj Sakarkar <pankajsakarkar@bluestarindia.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 4, 2023 12:11 PM 
To: Manish Mulchandani <Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com> 
Cc: Jatin Jain <Jatin.Jain@adani.com>; Utkarsh Singh <Utkarsh.Singh@adani.com> 
Subject: RE: Kitchen Equipment for Lucknow Airport - Terminal 3 
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*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and attachments.* 
 
Dear Manish, 
 
Greeting from Blue Star! 

Thanks for sharing your requirement, we have great pleasure in proposing our commercial offer based on your requirement. Please find below commercial offer. For 
walk-in chiller and freezer pls provide size of room.  

We trust our offer is in line with your requirement and look forward for your valued order. 

 

Sl. NO. Project Item No. Product Description Size Make Model UOM Qty 
Price 

(Basic) 

88 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 07 Reach In Freezer 700 x 880 x 2043 Blue Star RF2D700GP No 1 65000 
89 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 08 Reach In Chiller 700 x 880 x 2043 Blue Star RC2D700GP No 1 56000 

110 AJ Kitchen, LKO FO -12 Three Door Under Counter 
Refrigerator ( Compressor on LHS) 1805 x 700 x 850 Blue Star UC3100GP No 1 68000 

125 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-01 2 DOOR VERTICAL HALF FREEZER & 
HALF CHILLER 680 x 755 x 1965Ht. Blue Star RC2D640E No 1 56000 

141 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-16 

2 DOOR U/C CHILLER. WITH 
LOCKABLE CASTOR WHEELS (2 
Nos.WITH BREAK INFRONT & 2 Nos. 
WITHOUT BREAK)  & HEATING 
ELEMENT FOR DRAIN 

1380 x 700 x 850Ht Blue Star UC2100A No 2 60000 

147 CIP Lounge BC-06 OPEN DECK CHILLER 830 x 600 x 1400 

ELAN 
PRO/BLUE 
STAR OR 
EQUIVALENT 

 No 1 160000
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172 Nestcafe  Fridge - 240ltr  Blue Star  No 1 23000 

182 SHAWARAMA SH-07 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 850 Blue Star UC2100A No 1 60000 

185 SHAWARAMA SH-10 VISI COLLER 560 X 618 X 1815 Blue Star AS PER BRAND No 1 27000 

192 TACOS & 
BURGERS TB-07 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 850 Blue Star UC2100A No 1 60000 

205 INDIAN KITCHEN IN-13 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 850 Blue Star UC2100A No 1 60000 

209 INDIAN KITCHEN IN-17 10ltr Tea Boiler 255 x 530 x 350 PRADEEP 111564 No 1  

251 Carl's 17 2- doors Freezer  Blue star RF2D700GC No 1 65000 

252 Carl's 18 2-doors Chiller  Blue star RC2D700GC No 1 56000 
257 Carl's 23 Walk-In Chiller  Blue star  No 1  

258 Carl's 24 Walk-in Freezer  Blue star  No 1  

 
Terms & CondiƟon: 
* GST @18% extra on above mentioned basic prices 
* Payment 100% advance   
*Comprehensive Warranty of 12 months on the machines from the date of sale  
*Above prices are inclusive of installation, transport & unloading charges with delivery at ground floor  
*Unloading Charges- at actuals above ground floor.  
*Validity of offer : 30 days  
*Any civil, electrical and plumbing work at site will be to your account 
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Regards 
Pankaj 
9168701011 
 
 
 

From: Manish Mulchandani [mailto:Manish.Mulchandani@adani.com]  
Sent: Saturday, December 2, 2023 1:32 PM 
To: Pankaj Sakarkar 
Cc: Jatin Jain; Utkarsh Singh 
Subject: Kitchen Equipment for Lucknow Airport - Terminal 3 
 

CAUTION: ** This mail has been sent from outside Blue Star. Please open attachments/links after validating credentials. ** 

Dear Pankaj, 
 
Please share your final price for below mentioned items which are required for Lucknow Airport – Terminal 3. Please note, the PO will be released from Semolina which is a JV of Adani & 
TFS. 
 

Sl. 
NO. Project Item 

No. Product Description Size Make Model 

88 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 07 Reach In Freezer 700 x 880 x 
2043 Blue Star RF2D700GP 

89 AJ Kitchen, LKO BO - 08 Reach In Chiller 700 x 880 x 
2043 Blue Star RC2D700GP 

110 AJ Kitchen, LKO FO -12 Three Door Under Counter Refrigerator ( Compressor on LHS) 1805 x 700 x 
850 Blue Star UC3100GP 

125 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-01 2 DOOR VERTICAL HALF FREEZER & HALF CHILLER 680 x 755 x 
1965Ht. Blue Star RC2D640E 

141 CIP Lounge, LKO LK-16 
2 DOOR U/C CHILLER. WITH LOCKABLE CASTOR WHEELS (2 
Nos.WITH BREAK INFRONT & 2 Nos. WITHOUT BREAK)  & HEATING 
ELEMENT FOR DRAIN 

1380 x 700 x 
850Ht Blue Star UC2100A 
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147 CIP Lounge BC-06 OPEN DECK CHILLER 830 x 600 x 
1400 

ELAN PRO/BLUE 
STAR OR 
EQUIVALENT 

  

172 Nestcafe   Fridge - 240ltr   Blue Star   

182 SHAWARAMA SH-07 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 
850 Blue Star UC2100A 

185 SHAWARAMA SH-10 VISI COLLER 560 X 618 X 
1815 Blue Star AS PER BRAND 

192 TACOS & BURGERS TB-07 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 
850 Blue Star UC2100A 

205 INDIAN KITCHEN IN-13 Undercounter chiller 2 Door 1380 x 700 x 
850 Blue Star UC2100A 

209 INDIAN KITCHEN IN-17 10ltr Tea Boiler  255 x 530 x 350 PRADEEP  111564 

251 Carl's 17 2- doors Freezer    Blue star RF2D700GC 

252 Carl's 18 2-doors Chiller    Blue star RC2D700GC 

257 Carl's 23 Walk-In Chiller   Blue star   

258 Carl's 24 Walk-in Freezer   Blue star   

 
 
Regards, 
Manish Mulchandani  
Contracts & Procurement 
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Cell No. | +91 8105870198 
Adani Airport Holdings Limited 
 
Office Address | 6th Floor | East, Commerce House 6, Corporate Road, Off S G Highway, Prahladnagar, Ahmedabad 380 051, Gujarat, India 
 

 
 
 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is 
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this 
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views 
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  
 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is 
confidential, privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this 
e-mail, in whole or in part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views 
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  
 
WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any 
damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  






