& PCS EXPRESS CARGO Invoice Number. :| CR/1462/24-25

Shop No. 980 Ist Part, Riddhi Siddhi

=EXEEE L= CHSL, Adarsh Nagar, Jogeshwari West. Invoice Date : uSiofia0ed
QOshiwara - 400102 Mumbai, Mal
A R _ rbel Mehaashia GSTIN: 27AARPH3638J1ZA
Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com
Udyam Registration : UDYAM-MH-18-0286806
TAX INVOICE
To,
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PVT LTD (T-2 BLR)
T-2 , KEMPEGOWDA INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT, Page No. : Page 1of1
BENGALURU ( BANGALORE) URBAN,KARNATAKA, Period From - 08/06/2024
BANGALORE Period To - 08/06/2024
KARNATAKA-560300 Customer Code : T-0010
GSTIN. : 29AADCB2762L1ZE Other Docket Ref. No. ;
SR Docket Date  Destination Consignee From Reference Mode Dimension  Invoice Qly Rate  Weight Ch. Wt Total
LR Value
1 1018045 08.06.2024 MUMBAI TFSWORLI  BANGAL Mr. Harish SFC 52*34*19*1 3501 1 16.00 840  10.000  160.00
ORE-TRA
VEL
FOOD
SERVICE
S WEAR
HOUSE
DOCKET /LR CHARGE 50.00
Total Bill Amount = 210.00
TP\A\{E\" F00 on declared invoice value 0.02% = 7.00
onre® Fuel Surcharge = 21.70
Sigit- 2 e IVE! SUB TOTAL = 238.70
TORES REgF; NSPEC IGST @ of 5.00 % = 11.94
SUBJECT 1 Rounding Off = 0.36
Grand Total = 251.00

INR Two Hundred Fifty One Only

E.&0.E.PAYMENTS
1. All Bills should normally be settled within one week of the date of the bill For PCS EXPRESS CARGO
unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge

interest at the rate of 24% p.a. on all outstanding accounts.
. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.
PAN NO : AARPH3638J
. SAC / HSN CODE : 996791 @5% for Transport Service
. SAC / HSN CODE : 996812 @18% for Courier Service
. All cheques should be drawn cross Alc. Payee in favour of "PCS EXPRESS CARGO"
. This is computer generated invoice, does not required signature. Accountant / Manager

-qmr.n-l:-g.nm

Bank Details
Bank Name : ICICI BANK LTD
AJC No. : 643405054048
A/C Name PCS EXPRESS CARGO
Bank Branch : GOREGAON

IFSC Code : ICIC0006434
MICR Code
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g T o D krcmanpatory  pockeT/LrR
! /i ; Not Negotiable
p fwﬂ m 980,Adarsh Nagar,Link Road,Next to Lotus petrol pump, At Owner’s Risk
ﬁhﬂ‘x&*ﬁiv«'i@"—_’-’i%ﬁ ndheri-West, Mumbai-400053,+912262360112 i
EXPRESE Customercare@pcsexp.in www.pcsexp.in | 1 01 8 0 4 5
|
Every Time, On Time SUBJECT TO MUMBAI JURISDICTION ;
ACCOUNTNUMBER | SHIPPERREFERENCE |  ORIGIN _DESTINATION | PiEcEs | paTE | weewr
T-0010 Mr. Harish | BANGALORE MUMBAI 1 08/06/2024 10.00
* | [Jeasu [ Topar [] sHipPER'S [[] consiGnEE ACT. WT. 0.96
o AR R N R S TR v 1T ACCOUNT i il . VOL. WEIGHT
Sender's Name Receipt's Name 8.400
.. | MR SANTOSH SAWANT LT 5 (|
l Company Company DIMENSION in CM
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES WEAR HOUSE P e R | TFS WORLI L2 0 L*W*H
AddressEite Falt I SEENE T et 195 - 2 0 i atarens ST 52*34*19*1=8.398
SHIV SAGAR ESTATE WORLI POINT
" |Bancaore | mumsar
ToliNOSMWNT o vy 0 v i) e U L KTeliN ol 3
©  |City: BANGALORE cCountry: INDIA | City: MUMBAI  Country: INDIA
Description of Goods Shipment Value DOMESTIC D DOX N-DOX D AIR
j 3501 [ wrernaTiONAL COMMERCIAL SURFACE j
R e ot I VIR M ia L I N A | S SHIPMEN TG S e ) R plet g el ot
SHIPPER AGREEMENT PCS EXPRESS Received in Good order & Condition | Freight 217.00
' Fuel 21.70
GST 11.94
NAME : NAME : TOTAL 250.64
| SHIPPER'S Affix Co. Stamp ACCOUNT COPY
Date  (08/06/2024 |Date  (8/06/2024

SIGNATURE
Domestic

International Air Freight

Rail / Road
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7/9/24, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

M Gmail Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>

Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

1 message

" Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>
To: Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Zafar Hashmi <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>, "zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in" <zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in>, Pcs Customer Care <customercare@pcsexp.in>,

~ Sweta Pugalia <sweta.pugalia@blriounge.in>, T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>, Akshit Sogani
<akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com=, Prathap R <prathap.r@k-corp.in>

Wed, Jun 12, 2024 at 4:41 PM

Dear sir,
AWB No. 1018045
Booking Date 08/06/2024
Consignee Name TFS WORLI
Origin BANGALORE
Destination MUMBAI
Status Delivered
Delivery Date and Time 12/06/2024
Receiver Name SIGN_CO. STAMP_ressam receptio
Forwarding AWB No.
Shipment Progress for AWB No. 1018045
Date Time Location Status
08/06/2024 1746 MUMBAI SHIPMENT RECEIVED
PFA POD
Regards,

SEEMA RAWAT

&=

EXPRESS
Every Time, On Time.

Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com

Liquidity is the main substance to move anything faster.

On Tue, Jun 11, 2024 at 1:30 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir,
Shipment Picked up from TFS T2 Bangalore
Being sent to / For TFS Worli
Docket / LR Number & Date 1018045 Dt.08.06.2024
Declared Invoice Value Rs.350/-
Vendor Invoice Number 2741/2742
Total Number of Parcels 1 No
Billing / in account of... TFS
PO Number (issued to vendor) if any -

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:18010206529971 95069%7Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416...

115




719124, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore
s Thanks & regards,

Harish M R
Assistant Manager - SCM & Procurement.

+91 99640 88755

From: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 5, 2024 14:33 PM

To: Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sweta Pugalia <sweta.pugalia@blrlounge.in>

Subject: RE: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Dear sir

Stock ready for send pla inform to pcs person.

Carry Bag
Beverage Cup
Dosa Wrap
Parchment Paper
Take Away Bag
Biryani Tub

Wrap Box

Burger Box

Container with LID

Regards..

Azmir Hossain

From: Sweta Pugalia <sweta.pugalia@blrlounge.in>

Sent: 4 June, 2024 4:10 PM

To: T2 BLR Stores <t2blr.stores@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Harish MR <harish.mr@travelfoodservices.coms; Ritika Kapasi Charcoal <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>; Sweta Pugalia
<sweta.pugalia@blriounge.in>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@
travelfoodservices.coms; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@
charcoalconcepts.coms; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir.Arora@Travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath_charcon@
travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.coms; Chetan Bolar BB <chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@
travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.coms; Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@
travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Fw: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Dear Store Team,

Please send 3 Sets of all GK packaging to HO as soon as you can and share the update here. | mentioned the details below.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1801020652997 195069%7 Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416. ..

3/15




7/9/24, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore
' Container Front Design

Regards

Sweta Pugalia

From: Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 4, 2024 3:48 PM

To: Ritika Kapasi Charcoal <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>; Sweta Pugalia <sweta.pugalia@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Samarijit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>; Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty
<rajesh.shetty@iravelfoodservices.coms>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@charcoalconcepts.com>; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir.Arora@
Travelfoodservices.coms; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath_charcon@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Chetan Bolar BB
<chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@travelfoodservices.com>; Meena Shah <meena.shah@

travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Hi Ritika/Sweta,
Sharing images of Gully Kitchen Packaging...
item List:

e Tray Design

e Carry Bag

e Beverage Cup

e Dosa Wrap

e Parchment Paper
e Take Away Bag

e Biryani Tub

e Wrap Box

e Burger Box

e Container with LID

e Container Front Design
@Sweta: As discussed, please speak to Harish and send 3 sets of each GK packaging to Mumbai Head office..

Thank you

Akshit Sogani

From: Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: 04 June 2024 14:44
To: Ritika Kapasi Charcoal <ritika,kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>; Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@travelfoodservices.com>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1801020652997195069%7Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416... 5/15




7/9/24, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath charcon@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Chetan Bolar BB
f <chetan.bolar rcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@irav i m>
Subject: Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Hi Akshit,
Hope you're well.
Could you please let me know the next steps on this? Happy to geton a call in case of any confusion.

@Samarijit Pani no problem, thank you.

Cheers,

Ritika Kapasi

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
) happiness through food, since 1972

YEARS

G Gnacon” A (@) | S J—

From: Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 15, 2024 11:58 AM
To: Ritika Kapasi <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.coms>; Akshit Sogani <akshit.sogani@fravelfoodservices.com>

| Ce: Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@;travelfoodservices.com>; meena.shah
<meena.shah@fravelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@charcoalconcepts.com>; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir.Arora@
Travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath charcon@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Chetan Bolar BB
<chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@fravelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

(@Akshit Sogani please work with Ritika on this

Apologies for missing the earlier mail Ritika

With Regards
Samarjit Pani
(he/him)

GM, Marketing

L.}

safe space

COME AL TOU AN

From: Ritika Kapasi <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>
Sent: 15 May 2024 10:54
To: Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@travelfoodservices.com>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1801 020652997195069%7Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416... 7/15 1




719124, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Happy to get on a call in case of any confusion.

Cheers,

Ritika Kapasi

CELEBRATING

Creating memories and inspiring

- happiness through food, since 1972
YEARS

favie  CaaRGow JFEA . Do fils s s

From: Rajesh Shetty <rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 9, 2024 5:17 PM
To: Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@charcoalconcepts.com>

Cc: meena.shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir. Arora@Travelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath
<vivek.raghunath charcon@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.corn:-; Chetan Bolar BB <chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Samarjit

Pani <samarjit.pani@fravelfoodservices.com>; Ritika Kapasi <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@
travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Priyanka / Vivek,

sharing the updated file

Thanks

Chef Rajesh

From: Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 8, 2024 6:27 PM
To: Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@charcoalconcepts.com>

Cc: Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir. Arora@Travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty

<rajesh.shetty@iravelfoodservices.com>; Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath charcon@fravelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>; Chetan

Bolar BB <chetan.bolar@gcharcoalconcepts.com>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@iravelfoodservices.com>; Ritika Kapasi Charcoal
<ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>; Joseph Raj <joseph.raj@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Dear Vivek,

Please find Meal — Time wise menus for Gully Kitchen. The proposed changes are suggested keeping in mind — kitchen efficiency & streamline

operations .

I've outlined the adjustments we propose -

. Breakfast Slot — 5am to 11 am — We aim to streamline operations by temporarily removing Thalis and North India Special meals from

the menu. Instead, we will focus on promoting combos featuring Dosa variations and North Indian Breakfast item.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d8&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1801 020652997 195069%7Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416...
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719124, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the

content is safe.

Hi Priyanka,

Further to the below changes to be incorporated into the menu, | would like to see the menu list as per Breakfast / Lunch / Dinner

and Post Dinner to solve the operations challenges.
This is most critical to ensure the MENU CLUTTER is resolved and the Digital Screen design is optimized.

Second most critical bit is to get a clear plan for the GRAB & GO — timewise items + planogram + planogram for Beverages.

There are in house items on the shelf today which have not been approved by the brand. This needs to stop immediately.

Both above to be aligned with @Samarjit Pani for ensuring branding is aligned which is a serious missing element.

Menu comments to be incorporated:

1. We need to retain CURD RIICE

1. This can be even kept as Cold Grab & Go
2. At present this product is probably not visible in the menu clutter.

2. Don't introduce DONE BIRYANI VEG

3. Please share sales of DONNE BIRYANI CHICKEN - Need to understand menu | category contribution to confirm this can
be retained.

4. Ok to implement SUPER SAVER COMBOS

1. Need to be a separate combo menu screen
2. Need to understand what time will this be available ?

5. There is FILTER COFFEE in the menu — This can be replaced with DEGREE COFFEE. ( CANNOT HAVE BOTH)

6. PEPPER CHICKEN MEAL - RENAME - "Murgh Kali Mirch " No Change to Name
7. There is confusion around GULLY MEALS & THALI (VEG / NON VEG)

1. Let's do only Gully Meals
2. Menu representation for this needs to be cleared — cu

i. Refer the pairing options and also the karol bagh chole description / actual

rrent NORTH INDIAN SPECIAL MEALS is very confusing.

execution

1. Separate menu board — timings for this category should be defined clearly.

REMOVE
« MINI COCKTAIL SAMOSA BUCKET OF 12

Additional Suggestions
. ADD CHEESE — OPTION FOR DOSAS - to help push ticket size.

Can | see the above inputs incorporated before our meeting day after tomorrow so we can agree on timelines for the execution.

| | Hi @PRitika Kapasi,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:18010206529971 95069%7Cmsg-a:r40060214287775416...  11/15




7/9/2:%, 4:43 PM Gmail - Re: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

i

Additions List:

CATEGORY | ; : DMB Name
BREAKFAST

SUPER SAVER SOUTH INDIAN COMBOS

BIRYANIS

3 BEVERAGES

Current South Meals Section will be replaced by “Super Saver South Indian Combos”. Final Menu attached for reference .

BR Priyanka

From: Meena Shah <meena.shah@fravelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, May 6, 2024 11:38 AM

To: Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@gcharcoalconcepts.com>; sudhir Arora <Sudhir.Arora@Travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty
<rajesh.shetty@iravelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bolar BB <chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@
travelfoodservices.coms>; Ritika Kapasi Charcoal <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.comz>; Priyanka Holani <priyanka.holani@,
travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

Hi Vivek,

Priyanka is sharing the same

Regards,

Meena

From: Vivek Raghunath <vivek.raghunath@charcoalconcepts.com>

Sent: 06 May 2024 10:55

To: Meena Shah <meena.shah@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudhir Arora <Sudhir.Arora@Travelfoodservices.com>; Rajesh Shetty
<rajesh.shetty@travelfoodservices.com>; Chetan Bolar BB <chetan.bolar@charcoalconcepts.com>; Samarjit Pani <samarjit.pani@
travelfoodservices.coms; Ritika Kapasi Charcoal <ritika.kapasi@charcoalconcepts.com>

Subject: Gully Kitchen - T2 TFS Blore

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the
content is safe.

Hi Meena,

5 Hope you had a great weekend.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f.1 801020652997 195069%7Cmsg-a:r4006021428777541... 13/15




719124, 4:52 PM
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