Shop No. 980 Ist Part, Riddhi Siddhi
[ = "*{ ;’j@ E 5 = CHSL, Adarsh Nagar, Jogeshwari West.

h P PCS EXPRESS CARGO GSTIN : 27AARPH3638J1ZA

Invoice Number. CR/25/24-25

; w—
Oshiwara - 400102 Mumbai, Maharashtra

ary Time, Gn Timi : A : Invoice Date : 10/04/2024
Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com
TAX INVOICE
To,
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PVT. LTD. )
CHENNAI INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT, LINK BUILDING Page No. -: Page 1 of 1
NEAR INTERNATIONAL ARRIVALS, Period From . 12/01/2024
| CHENNAI Period To : 12/01/2024
| TAMIL NADU-600027 Customer Code . T-0003
| GSTIN.: 33AAECT8192M1ZS Other Docket Ref. No. :
SR DOCKET DATE  DESTINATION CONSIGNEE FROM REFERENCE MODE DIMENSION INVOICE QTY RATE WEIGHT CHWT  TOTAL
] LR VALUE
1 1017288 12.01.2024 BANGALORE MS.BHEDI CHENNAI- MR. VIJAY SFC 69*41*23*1 1000 1 15.00 16.27 17.000 255.00
INNVOVATIONS  TFS
CHENNAI
Total Bill Amount = 255.00
FOV on declared invoice value 0.02% = 2.00
Fuel Surcharge = 25.70
SUB TOTAL = 282.70
| IGST @ of 5.00 % = 14.14
» . Grand Total = 297.00
| INR Two Hundred Ninety Seven Only
E.&0.E.PAYMENTS
1. All Bills should normally be settled within one week of the dale of the bill For PCS EXPRESS CARGO

unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge
interest at the rate of 24% p.a. on all oulstanding accounts.
2. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.
3. PAN NO : AARPH3638J
4. SAC / HSN CODE : 996791 @5% for Transport Service
| 5. SAC / HSN CODE : 996812 @18% for Courler Service
6. All cheques should be drawn cross Alc. Payee in favour of "PCS EXPRESS CARGO"
7. This is computer generaled invoice, does not required signature.
| Changes in the Invoice can be done only within 5 days.

Accountant / Manager

| BANK DETAILS
Bank Name ICICI BANK LTD
A/C No.: 643405054048

A/C Name : PCS EXPRESS CARGO

Bank Branch ~ GOREGAON

IFSC Code : ICIC0006434 v
MICR Code : :
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Chennai to BHEL
commercial/ Business value from our end.

CRHELDEINNOVATIONS PATT AR
(.l\()l \Ull()()mu{)v“w (R()\S
OMBR LAYOLUT NE. AD
BINGALAURU
SOUHIS.

Conduct Derails
PIL: 01301
M. Ambreesh = 80802 42568




Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>

Re: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

1 message

Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> Mon, Jan 15, 2024 at 9:45 PM
To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>

Cec: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>, "zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in" <zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in>,
"zafarhashmi74@gmail.com" <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>, Chennai Maintenance
<chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>, Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com=>, Kumar V
<kumar.v@travelfoodservices.com>, Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@fravelfoodservices.com>, Azmath Baig
<azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>, Srinivas Venkatesan <srinivas.v@travelfoodservices.com>, "Chennai.Chef"
<chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>, Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>

Shipment Picked up from TFS Chennai
Being sent to / For Bheldi Innovations Pvt Ltd Bangalore
Docket / LR Number & Date 1017288 Dt.12.01.2024

Declared Invoice Value -
Vendor [nvoice Number -
PO Number (issued to the vendor by You) -
Total Number of Parcels 1 Nos
Billing / in account of... TFS
Mode of Transit -

Ik KYCMANDATORY  ONCKET/LR
o Ar o =3 T
EXPRESS 1017288
.’Nn‘lll:l';l:r:l!liil‘ ‘:H!“r.'u i Tomein | otsimaton "-_:l:ft:tii:; T | wom
T NEJaN Mk 'é%:: ¥ I - ! ){) EipY St
|m ﬁwlulm "ﬂ'\ s S
,uunu;?’.ﬂ‘f [jq\}‘_ UMM lIcEl'!nlﬁHnmr/!M P/ F{—()H N

USRS ey

Compony Gampany ?é) //‘&'ehf S il
Addioes Z HAVL / ]}{'}Z’) (3/ Ailress O
e ;O@ffyﬁf P o HZM ﬂmf&r}f W_AJ:

; _ 'J—E:H'EH .i\lkf{‘] 'i Pin Code h&&ﬁ#—_ N

Tel N Tel o
oty Gcmnl
Lll):_‘ n iz Counley L)( ﬁ.) ,/rvk
.Kcﬂp{bﬂﬁ&nuﬁs VAL | Eriomesuc | Cloox EIWoox | [Jaw
ey I Cymennonac | [ covmtncacsimnr | stTiEact
PCS EXPRESS Rocolvo i gast ender Aceesien *rr"lla'll
LG
~ | ndhe i ) HAME (1)
' . A o TOTAL
(™ oy " / J
L P L L T L RUEE b
BATE: Loalied Allix Gu. Stamp 'i/(
EnEPLing SSNATINE oA —
Domes 0 ationa A 03 isa pefzle] | SHIPPER COPY

Regards,

Vikash sah

EXPRESS

Fvery Time, On Time.

pcs.courier@gmail.com



On Sun, Jan 14, 2024 at 3:24 PM Sowri Raja <sowriraja. m@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear PCS Team

Request to share the courier LR Copy.

Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M

Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Lid.,
Chennai International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

Next to S2 Police Station.

Mobile ; +91 - 9884054540

Email: sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com

Creating memories and inspiring

happiness through food, since 1972
TEARS
£ vt e FiL ﬁ g we

From: Vijayakumar $ <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>
Sent: 11 January 2024 15:35

To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>; Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>;
zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in; zafarhashmi74@gmail.com

Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.coms>; Karthick K <karthick.k@
travelfoodservices.coms: Kumar V <kumar.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@
travelfoodservices.coms; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>; Srinivas Venkatesan

<srinivas.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajan N

<rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working
Importance: High



!
1
]
i

the sender and know the content is safe.

II

! CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
1

\

i

Dear Zafar i,

Refer trial mail & do the needful.
Contact Person — Mr.Sowriraja 9884054540

Regards

Vijay

From: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@ftravelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 11 January 2024 12:17

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@
travelfoodservices.com>; Kumar V <kumar.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@
travelfoodservices.com>; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.coms; Srinivas Venkatesan
<srinivas.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajan N
<rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Vijay

Request your support to arrange PCS courier to courier the robout coupe blender.
Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M

Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd.,
Chennai International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

Next to 52 Police Station.

Mobile : +91 — 9884054540



Email: sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com

Creating memories and inspiring

happiness through food, since 1972

i ife

From: Sowri Raja

Sent: 11 December 2023 15:15

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@

fravelfoodservices.com>; Kumar V <kumar.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@
travelfoodservices.com>; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.coms>; Srinivas Venkatesan
<srinivas.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>; Rajan N

<rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Vijay

Request to arrange PCS courier team for Robot coupe immersion blender send from Main kitchen chennai to

Bengaluru.

This blender is send for service only.



BHELDI INNOVATIONS PVT LTD
GROUND FLOOR 109 2 ND E CROSS
OMBR LAYOUT NEAR BANASWADI
BENGALURU

YeRishbne: 7485013017

Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M

Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd.,
Chennai International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

Next to S2 Police Station.

Mohile : +91 — 9884054540

Email: sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com

CELEBRATING
Creating memaries and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
YEARS

o @ f e
K

From: Sowri Raja
Sent: 19 October 2023 12:34



Please find the trail mail, request to hand over the immersion blender.

Regards

M. Sowri Raja

From: Sowri Raja

Sent: 20 August 2023 13:16

To: Rajan N <rajan.n@fravelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@
travelfoodservices.coms; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V <kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selva
Kumar <selvakumar.m@k-corp.in>; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Chef

Please refer trail mail, Request to hand over the robot coupe immersion blender to Maintenance, we will send courier
to Bangalore for service.

Thanks and Regards

M. Sowri Raja

From: BS International <info@bsi.equipment>

Sent: 28 July 2023 02:28

To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; BS INTERNATIONAL
<bs.inter.in@gmail.com>; Karthick K <karthick k@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar 5 <vijayakumar.s@Kk-
corp.in>; Kumar V <kumar.v@Kk-corp.in>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize i

the sender and know the content is safe.
|

Dear Mr Raja Sowri as informed kindly send the same to our Bangalore office address ,we will check n repair.Address is
attached herewith.

Thanks

Satish Kumar



“To: Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>

Ce: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick k@
travelfoodservices.coms>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V <kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selva
Kumar <selvakumar.m@Kk-corp.in>; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working :

Dear Team

Reminder mail, request to hand over the hand blender, will send it to service centre for servicing.

Regards

Sowti Raja

From: Sowri Raja

Sent: 03 September 2023 13:17

To: Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@
travelfoodservices.coms; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V <kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selva
Kumar <selvakumar.m@k-corp.in>; Azmath Baig <azmath.baig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Rajan Chef

Reminder mail, Request to handover the immersion blender, will send for service.

Regards

M. Sowri Raja

From: Sowri Raja
Sent: 27 August 2023 19:06
To: Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>; Chennai.Chef <chennai.chef@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@
travelfoodservices.coms; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V <kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selva
Kumar <selvakumar.m@k-corp.in>; Azmath Baig <azmath Dbaig@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Chef



‘B S International

Mumbai

On Thu, 27 Jul 2023, 12:23 Sowri Raja, <sowriraja.m@lravelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Mr. Sathish

Reminder mail, Request to update the status of technician visits.

Thanks and Regards

M. Sowri Raja

From: Sowri Raja
Sent: 21 July 2023 16:11
To: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>; BS International

<info@bsi.equipments; bs.inter.in@gmail.com
Ce: Karthick K <karthick k@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V

<kumar.v@k-corp.in>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Team

Reminder mail, Request to update on technician visit status.

Thanks and Regards

M. Sowri Raja

From: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 11 July 2023 09:42 ‘ ,
To: BS International <info@bsi.equipment>; bs.inter.in@gmail.com; Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@

travelfoodservices.com>
Ce: Karthick K <karthick k@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V

<kumar.v@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear BS Team



Request to update the status of your technician visits.
Thanks & Regards

Sowri Raja M

Sr. Executive-Maintenance

Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd.,
Central Kitchen,

Chennai International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

Next to S2 Police Station.

Mobile : +91 - 9884054540

From: Chennai Maintenance <chennai.maintenance@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, July 10, 2023 11:37 AM

To: BS International <info@bsi.equipment>; bs.inter.in@gmail.com <bs.inter.in@gmail.com>; Sowri Raja
<sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>

Ce: Karthick K <karthick k@travelfoodservices.coms; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Kumar V
<kumar.v@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Team
Reminder mail, Request to send your service engineer to rectify the complaint on stick blender.

Vegetable cutting machine not working, Mr shakul had send the service person and converted to conductor system, sensor not
closing properly.

request to do the needful.

Thanks & Regards

Sowri RajaM
Sr. Executive-Maintenance

Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd.,

Central Kitchen,



Chennai International Airportt,
Chennai-600027,
Next to S2 Police Station.

Mobile : +91 - 9884054540

From: Chennai Maintenance

Sent: Wednesday, May 31, 2023 3:33 PM

To: BS International <info@bsi.equipment>; bs.inter.in@gmail.com <bs.inter.in@gmail.com>
Cc: Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>
Subject: Robot Coupe MP 450Ultra not working

Dear Sir

This is to inform you regarding, our MP450 Ultra immersion blender had given and serviced back on
February month, again it's not working.

Request to send your service engineer to attend the same.

Thanks & Regards,

Sowri Raja M _

Sr.Executive- Project & Maintenance |Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt Ltd

Chennai Airport | Chennai - 600 027.

Mobile : +91 - 9884054540/8939817419
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