PCS EXPRESS CARGO

=

GSTIN : 27AARPH3638J1ZA

Shop No. 980 1st Part, Riddhi Siddhi )
Ea{gﬁﬁ:ggg CHSL, Adarsh Nagar, Jogeshwari West. Invoice Number. CR/24/24-25
Oshiwara - 400102 Mumbai, Maharashtra )
ry Tiene, Gn Tim ; i . Invoice Date : 10/04/2024
Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com
TAX INVOICE
To,
TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PVT. LTD.
CHENNAI INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT, LINK BUILDING i’age No. : Page 1 of 1
NEAR INTERNATIONAL ARRIVALS, Period From : 12/01/2024
CHENNAI Period To ' 12/01/2024
TAMIL NADU-600027 Customer Code : T-0003
GSTIN. : 33AAECT8192M1ZS Other Docket Ref. No. :
SR DOCKET DATE  DESTINATION CONSIGNEE FROM REFERENCE MODE DIMENSION INVOICE QTY RATE WEIGHT CHWT  TOTAL
LR VALUE
1 1016052 12.01.2024 COIMBATORE MS.ESS EMM CHENNAI- MR, VIJAY SFC 5000 1 20.00 140.00 140.000 2,800.00
SERVICES TFS
CHENNAI
DOCKET / LR CHARGE 50.00
Total Bill Amount = 2,850.00
FOV on declared invoice value 0.02% = 10.00
Fuel Surcharge = 286.00
SUB TOTAL = 3,146.00
IGST @ of 5.00 % = 157.30
Grand Total = 3,303.00

INR Three Thousand Three Hundred Three Only

E.EQ.E.PAYMENTS

1. Alll Bills should normally be settled within one week of the date of the bill
unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge
interest at the rate of 24% p.a. on all outstanding accounts.

2. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.

3. PAN NO : AARPH3638J

4. SAC / HSN CODE : 996791 @5% for Transport Service

5. SAC / HSN CODE : 996812 @18% for Courier Service

6. All cheques should be drawn cross Alc. Payee in favour of "PCS EXPRESS CARGO"

7. This is computer generaled invoice, does nol required signature.

Changes in the Invoice can be done only within 5 days.

BANK DETAILS

Bank Name ICICI BANK LTD

A/C No.: 643405054048
A/CName: PCS EXPRESS CARGO
Bank Branch  GOREGAON

IFSC Code : ICIC0006434

MICR Code :

-For PCS EXPRESS CARGO

Accountant / Manager
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vl N ‘iiﬁig Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com=

Re: Potato Peeler P.R
1 message
Care - Service EssEmm <care@essemmservices.com> Wed, Jan 24
- To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Service EssEmm <service@essemmservices.com>, Pes Courier <pes.courier@gmail.coms, “zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in” <zafarhashmi@pesexp.in>, "zafarhashmi74@gmail.com"
<zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>, Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>, Krishnakumar R <krishnakumar@essemmgroup.co.in>, ESSEMM-Enquiry <enquiry@essemmindia.com>, Kart
. <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>, Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.com>, Sathish M <sathish.m@travelfoodservices.com>, Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.cor
Venkatesan <srinivas.v@travelfoodservices.com>, Accounts EssEmm Services <accounts@essemmservices.com>, Nisha <accounts@essemmindia.com>, Pournami Sathish
<pournami.sathish@essemmindia.com>, Service Manager <servicemanager@essemmservices.com>
Dear Sir,
The Emery Coaling work is completed, Today Evening we will dispatch the machine by the Transport and the Next day we wil share the LR details.
Thanks & Regards ,
Nandha Kwomnar, §
Service Team /
EssEmm Services
270-1. GK.S. Nagar, Sathy Road,
Saravanampatti,
Coimbatore 641035, Tamil Nadu, INDIA
Tel: +91-422-4243836

Ph-8220051512.
hitpiwww.essemnmindia.com

On Wed, Jan 24, 2024 at 1:24 PM Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@iravelfoadservices.com> wrote:

Dear Care Team

Request to update the status of potato peeler we had given for emery coating.
Almost 11days completed. It will affect our production also.

Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M

Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd,,
Chennai International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

Next to S2 Police Station.

Mohile : +91 — 9884054540

Email: sowriraja.m@iravelfoodservices.com

Creating memories and inspiting

happin through food, since 1972

YEARY

i “ i

From: Sowri Raja :
Sent: 17 January 2024 12:42 J

To: Service EssEmm <service@essemmservices.com>

Ce: Pcs Courier <pes, courier@armail.com>; Care - Service EssEmm <care@essemmservices.coms; zafarhashmi@pesexp.in; zafarhashmi74@gmail.com; Vijayakumar S
<vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Krishnakumar R <krishnakumar@essemmgroup.co.in>; ESSEMM-Enquiry <enquiry@essemmindia.com>; Karthick K <karthick k@
travelfoodservices.coms; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.com>; Sathish M <sathish.m@lravelfoodservices.coms>; Srinivas Venkatesan <srinivas.vi@

iravelfoodservices.coms; Rajan N <rajan.n@travelloodservices.com>; Accounts EssEmm Services <accounts@essemimservices.coms>; Nisha <accounis@essemmindia



Pournami Sathish <pournami.sathish@essemmindia.com>; Service Manager <servicemanager@essemmservices.com>
Subject: RE: Potato Peeler P.R

Dear Care Team
Request to give permanent solutions and send it back ASAP.
Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M . ;
Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance

Travel Food Services Chennai Put. Ltd.,

Chennai International Airport,

Chennai-600027,

Mext 10 52 Police Station,

Mobile : +91 - 9884054540

Email; sowriraja.m@fravelfoodservices.com

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
huppiness through food, since 1972
TEARS

K ks

From: Service EssEmm <service@essemmservices,coms=

Sent: 17 January 2024 09:54

To: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelloodservices.com>

Ce: Pcs Courier <pos.courier@gmail.comy; Care - Service EssEmm <care@essemmservices,com>; zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in; zafarhashmi74@gmail.com; Vijayakumar S
<vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>; Krishnakumar R <krishnakumar@essemmgroup.co.in>; ESSEMM-Enquiry <enquiry@essemmindia.coms; Karthick K <karthick @
Iraveffoodservices.coms; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@lravelfoodservices.coms; sathish M <sathish.m@travelfoodservices com>; Srinivas Venkatesan <srinivas.vie
iravelfoodservices.coms; Rajan N <rajan.n@travelfoodservices.coms; Accounts EssEmm Services <accounts@essemmservices.coms; Nisha <accounts@essernmindia
Pournami Sathish <pournami sathish@essemmindia.com>; Service Manager <servicemanager@essernmservices.com>

Subject: Re: Potato Peeler PR

L CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

S —

Dear Sir/Mam,

»

We received your Potato Peeler machine on 13.1.2024. The work is under Process. Once we finish the work we will iet you know.
Looking forward lo working with you !

Thanks & Regards,

Nandha Kumar.S | SErviCE COORDINATOR

EssEmm Services
270 GKS Nagar | Saravanampali | Sathy Road | Coimbatore 641035 | India

M +91 | 8220051512
TEL | 0422 - 4243836

E - servicef@essemmaenvices,.com



www.essemimindia.com

On Sat, Jan 13, 2024 at 8:17 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@amail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,
Shipment Picked up from TFS Chennai
Being sent to / For MS ESS Emm Services Coimbatore
Docket / LR Number & Date 1016052 Dt.12.01.2024

Declared Invoice Value -

Vendor Invoice Number -

Total Number of Parcels 1 NOS

Billing / in account of... TFS

PO Number (issued to vendor) if any
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Regards,

Mohd Suleman

o ==

12il s pes.coutier@gmail.com

On Fri, Jan 12, 2024 at 11:12 PM Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@traveifoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Ess Eimm Care Team

Please find attached LR copy of Potato peeler, send courier by today
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Request to rectify the complaints and return back the machine ASAP.

Thanks and Regards

Sowri Raja M
Assistant Manager — Project & Maintenance
Travel Food Services Chennai Pvt. Ltd,,
Chennal International Airport,
Chennai-600027,

ext to 52 Police Station.
Miobile : +91 — 9884054540

Email: sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com

CTLERRATING
Cresting memaoties and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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From: Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.coms>

Sent: 11 January 2024 15:30

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.s@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@iravelfoodservices.com>; zafar. hashmi@pcsexp.in; zafarhashmi74@gmail.com; Krishnakumar R <krishnakumar@essemmgroup.co
Enquiry <enquiry@essemmindia.com>; Karthick K <karthick.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Selva Kumar <selvakumar.m@travelfoodservices.comy; Sathish M
<sathish.m@travelfoodservices.coms; Srinivas Venkatesan <srinivas.v@iravelfoodservices.com>; Rajan N <tajan.n@lravelfoodservices.com>; Care - Service EssEn
<cars@essemmservices.coms; Accounts EssEmm Services <accounis@essemmservices coms>; Nisha <accounts@essemmindia.com>; Service EssEmm
<service@essemmservices com>; Pournami Sathish <paurnami.sathish@essemmindia.corm>; Service Manager <servicemanager@essemmsernvices.com>
Subject: Re: Potato Peeler PR

CAUTIGH: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

[

Fmait: pes.courier@gmail.com

On Thu, Jan 11, 2024 at 3:15 PM Vijayakumar S <vijayakumar.si@k-corp.in> wrote:
Dear Zafar ji,

Refer trial mail, kindly do the needful from chennai tfs to ess emm services.

Regards

Vijay 2

From: Sowri Raja <sowriraja.m@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 11 January 2024 11:44

To: Vijayakumar S <vijayakumars@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Krishnakumar R <krishnakumar@essemmgroup.co.in>; ESSEMM-Enquiry <enquiry@essemmindia.com>; Karthick K <karthick k@travelfoodservices.com>; Selva Kum
<selvakumarm@travelfoodservices.com>; Sathish M <sathish.m@travelfoodservices.comz>; Srinivas Venkatesan <srinivas.v@travelioodservices.com>; Rajan N
<rajan.n@travelfoodservices.com>; Care - Service EssEmm <care@essemumservices.com>; Accounts EssEmm Services <accounts@essemmservices.com>; Nisha
<accounts@essemmindia.com>; Service EssEmm <service@essemmservices.com>; Pournami Sathish <pournami.sathish@essemmindia.com>; Service Manager <service
CS5EMIMSErVices.con>

Subject: RE: Potato Peeler P.R

Dear Vijay

Request to arrange PCS courier for new potato peeler, again we want to send for emery coating.

Address to courier

EssEmm Services o

2701, G.K.S. Nagar, Sathy Road,

Saravanampatti,
Coimbatore 641035, Tamil Nadu, INDIA



