PCS EXPRESS CARGO

Shop No 980 1st Part, Riddhi Siddhi CHSL,
Jogeshwari West, Oshiwara,
Mumbai - 400102

Email .: pcs.courier@gmail.com | Tel:+9122 6236 0112

GSTIN : 27AARPH3638J1ZA

TAX INVOICE

To,
M/S . TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PVT. LTD. Invoice No  : CR/1807/23-24
CHENNAI INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT, LINK BUILDING ' pageNo. : 1
NEAR INTERNATIONAL ARRIVALS, Invoice Date 19.12.2023
CHENNAI - 600027 Period From : 07-10-2023
Customer GSTIN : 33AAECT8192M1ZS Period To 07-10-2023
Pan No : AAECT8192M Customer Code I- 0022
SR. DOCKET DATE. DESTINATION CONSIGNEE PICK-UP FROM REFERENCE  DIMENSION DECLARED Qry D/fs wT CHWT TOTAL
INVOICE VALUE
1 1011171 07.10.2023  CHENNAI  TFST-2_ CHENNAI SHRE:ET_:?HEY MR. STEPHEN 75111?12; 27,848.00 5  SPX 449.595  450.000 8,150.00
Total Bill Amount = 8,150.00
FOV ON DECLARED INVOICE @0.2%= 55.70
Fuel Surcharge @10%= 820.57
SUB TOTAL= 9,026.27
IGST 5.00% = 451.31
Grand Total=  9,477.58

INR NINE THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SEVENTY SEVEN AND PAISE FIFTY EIGHT ONLY.

e
E.&0.E.PAYMENTS

1, All Bills should normally be settled within one week of the date of the bill

unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge interest

at the rate of 24% p.a. on all outstanding accounts.

2. All cheques should be drawn Cross "A/c Payee" in favour of "PCS Express Cargo"
. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.

. PAN NO : AARPH3638)
SAC / HSN CODE : 996791
BANK DETAILS

o v b W

Bank Name : SAMATA SAHAKARI BANK LTD.

Account Number : ¥004300100003009
IFSC CODE : SRCBOSAMO001
BRANCH : OSHIWARA

Changes in the Invoice can be done only within 5 days.
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e-invoice

\WUrLIVATE FUN IANOFURICR ]

IRN . bdbfb5ee59ed0f77e9bb9f31585817930fe89970c1che-
71c494961afb0816808
Ack No. : 132316186377556
Ack Date : 7-Oct-23
SHREE RADHEY KRISHNA INDUSTRIES LLP Invoice No.
PLOT NO -142 PHASE- IV SECTOR -56 ' S 1121 : 7-Oct-23
HSIIDC IND AREA KUNDLI (HR) Delivery Note Mode/Terms of Payment

GSTIN/UIN: 06ADNFS7869R1ZP
State Name : Haryana, Code : 06
E Mail : SRK.INDUSTRIES2018@GMAIL.COM

Reference No. & Date. Other References

Consrgnee (Ship to)

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE LIMITED
Central Kitchen Next to S2 Police Sation

Chennai International Airport

GSTIN/UIN . 33AAECT8192M1ZS

State Name : Tamil Nadu, Code : 33

Buyer's Order I\Flo. Dated

Dispatch Doc No. Delivefy Note Date

Buyer (Bill to)

TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES CHENNAI PRIVATE LIMITED
Central Kitchen Next to S2 Police Station

Chennai International Airport

Dispatched thﬁ)ugh Destination

BY ROAD CHENNAI

Bill of Lading/LR-RR No. | Motor Vehicle No.
dt. 7-Oct-23 DL51GD6739

Terms of Delivery

GSTIN/UIN 33AAECT8192M1ZS
State Name : Tamil Nadu, Code : 33
Sl Description of Goods HSN/SAC | Quantity Rate per Amount
No
1 [TABLE 94031090 2 PC| 3.800.00| PC 7,600.00
2 | TABLE TOP 94031090 1PC| 1,600.00| PC 1,600.00
3 |1 AQUA CHAIR PLATINUM 94031090 6 PC| 2,400.00| PC 14,400.00
23,600.00
SALE IGST@18% 18| % 4,248.00
. Total 9 PC ¥ 27,848.00
Amount Chargeable (in words ) E. &O.E
INDIAN RUPEES Twenty Seven Thousand Elght Hundred Forty Eight Only
T HSN/SAC Taxable IGST Total -
: Value Rate Amount | Tax Amount
94031090 : 23,600.00) 18% 4,248.00 4,248.00
Total| 23,600.00 4,248.00] 4,248.00

Tax Amount (in words ) :
Company's PAN
Declaration

We declare that this invoice shows the actual price of the
goods described and that all particulars are true and

: ADNFST7869R

correct.

INDIAN RUPEES Four Thousand Two Hundred Forty Eight Only

for SHREE RADHEY KRISHNA INDUSTRIES LLP '

Authorised Signatory

This is a Computer Generated Invoice




‘_ 12/22/23, 7:10 PM Gmail - Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

wg Gmall Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>
Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeet

1 message

ha outlet — Chennai T2

gmail.com> Fri, Oct 13, 2023 at 5:42 PM
To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: "zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in" <zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in>, "zafarhashmi74@gmail.com” <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>, Binu Balachandran
<pinu.balachandran@k-corp.in>, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>, Shri Radhey Krishna Industries LLP
<mkt.shriradhey@gmail.com>, Chennai Stores <chennai.stores@travelfoodservices.com>, Chennai Purchase
<chennai.purchase@travelfoodservices.com>, PCS Express Delhi <pcscargo.delhi@gmail.com>

Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@

Shipment Delivered
AWB No. 1011171
Booking Date 07/10/2023
Consignee Name SHREE RADHEY KRISHNA TO TFS
Destination CHENNAI
Status OK DELIVERED
Delivery Date & Time 10/10/2023
Receiver Name SIGN & SEAL-MOHMAD
Forwarding No. 0

Regards,

Kiran k

EXPAESS

Every Time, On Time

Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com

On Mon, Oct 9, 2023 at 5:58 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir,
Shipment Picked up from Shree Radhey Krishna Industries Delhi
Being sent to / For TES Chennai :
Docket / LR Number & Date 1011171 Dt.07.10.2023
Declared Invoice Value Rs.27,848
' | vendor Invoice Number 1121
| Total Number of Parcels 5 Nos
' | Billing / in account of... TFS
| | PO Number (issued to vendor) if any -

https:llmail.google.comlmailluiof?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=aIl&permthid=lhreaduf:1778809835635373161%7Cmsg-a:r—447501 80994492... 1/5



12;’22.;23, 7:10 PM Gmail - Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2
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Regards,

| Pradnya
| ———

§ S
EXPRESS

Every Time, Cn Time.

Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com

| On Sat, Oct 7, 2023 at 1:00 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:
Today its being done. Mr. Piyush requested us to send vehicle after 4 pm

Regards,

} | Pradnya
! i"‘ I

&
T

| | Nipusmaperiaid
| | EXPRESS
Every Time, On Time.

Email 1 pes.courier@gmail.com

7 On Sat, Oct 7, 2023 at 11:49 AM Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> wrote:

| Hi PCS Team,
||
(.

| | please confirm if we are on track in having the items picked today.

|
| | Regards
|
‘ “Stephen

1
1.
1 \ From: Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>
‘I | | sent: 04 October 2023 13:32
| | | To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>
‘} | | cc: zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in; zafarhashmi74@gmail.com; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>;
" | sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>; Shri Radhey Krishna Industries LLP <mkt.shriradhey@gmail.com>
| | Subject: Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

https:/imail .google,comlmail!ul()l?ik=071 576355d&view=pt&search=a!|&permlhid=lhread-f: 1778809835635373161 %, 7Cmsg-a:r-44750 189904492... 2/5



12/22}’23, 7:10 PM Gmail - Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

' Noted

| Regards,

Pradnya

PCS
| EXPRESS

Every Time, On Time,

WIS S

| Email 1 pcs.courier@gmail.com

. On Wed, Oct 4, 2023 at 1:10 PM Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in> wrote:

| |
| | | +PCS Courier

Please arrange for pickup on Saturday (07-Oct)

Pickup Address.
QEDO

Ish Furniture
2120, WHS, Kirti Nagar, Delhi-110015

Contact Person : Priyanshu Tripathi : +91 8813942627

|
|
]
| ‘ ‘ || Delivery Address.
L CHN Sangeetha Outlet (TFS)
[ ] Ground Floor, Second Floor,

Anna International ,Chennai Airport,

| Tirusula Chennai, 600027

|
1 l Contact Details : Mr. Karthick K : +91 99411 86480

| | | Regards

i Stephen
|

|
. | From: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>
||| Sent: 27 September 2023 12:32
| To: Shri Radhey Krishna Industries LLP <mkt.shriradhey@gmail.com>

hltps:h‘mail.google.comlmaillu.'OI?ik=071576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=lhread-f:1778809835635373161%TCmsg-a:r-44750189994492... T35



12.’22}23, 7:10 PM Gmail - Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

Ce: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>
| Subject: RE: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

| Hi Priyanshu,

| Please enclosed purchase order.

| Thanks & Regards,

| | Sarvesh Patil

| From: Shri Radhey Krishna Industries LLP <mkt.shriradhey@gmail.com>
| | Sent: 25 September 2023 12:20
|| To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

} | Subject: Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

| | CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

| | !Dear Sarvesh,

i Please find the rate of Square table top white (650*650*750)@3400+Gst
only table top rate is @1200+GSt

|| Thanks & Regards

| ‘ | Priyanshu Tripathi

8813942627
QEDO & Crebal

1 \ | On Mon, 25 Sept 2023 at 11:47, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi Privanshu,
Please find enclosed purchase order.

| Thanks & Regards,

|| ' Sarvesh Patil

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&vlew=pt&search=ai|&per,mthid=thread-f:17788093356353731 61%7Cmsg-a:r-44750189994492...  4/5



12/22;'23, 710 PM Gmail - Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

Erom: Shri Radhey Krishna Industries LLP <mkt.shriradhey@gmail.com>
Sent: 15 September 2023 15:26

To: Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: NSO-Furniture BOQ for Sangeetha outlet — Chennai T2

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

| Sir,

| Ready stock @2400+gst
| Pick up Address

Ish Furniture

2/20, WHS, Kirti Nagar, Delhi-110015
| Thanks & Regads
Priyanshu Tripathi

|| QEDO & Crebal
| | | | 8813942627

| 1| | On Fri, 15 Sept 2023 at 14:54, Sarvesh Patil <sarvesh.patil@k-corp.in> wrote:
| Hi Priyanshu,

' We have a requirement for Chairs in Chennai. Request yol to look into it and quote for the same on priority.

. ‘ SL. NO. Name Quantity Model i ~ Sample photo Dimension Brand
RERRR
i
i
; | P 790mm (H) X
R Dining Chair 6 Ptﬁﬁmm 535mm (L)X | QEDO
RN 510(W)
| 1 |-
BRER ‘
L]
| ! || ]
BRRRR
RRREE
‘ . " Thanks & Regards,
Sarvesh Patil

+91 98208 36480

hups:h'maiI.google.com!maillu.’of?ik=071 576655d&view=pt&search=a|l&permthid=thread-f:1778809835635373161%70msg-a:r-447501 89994492... 5/5



