PCS EXPRESS CARGO Invoice Number. : | CR/1943/24-25

Shop No. 980 Ist Part, Riddhi Siddhi
CHSL, Adarsh Nagar, Jogeshwari West.
[ Oshiwara - 400102 Mumbai, Maharashtra CSTIN : 27AARPH3638J1ZA

’ i o Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com
MSME Reg : UDYAM-MH-18-0286806

Invoice Date : 26/08/2024

TAX INVOICE
To,
BLR LOUNGE SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED
Kempegaowda International Airport, KIAL Rd. Page No. . Page 10of 1
Devanhalli, Bengaluru Period From . 20/08/2024
BANGALORE Period To . 20/08/2024
Karnataka-560300 Customer Code : B-0006
GSTIN. : 28AAICB4881B1ZM Other Docket Ref. No. . PO/24-25/001213
SR Docket Date Destination Consignee From Reference Mode Dimension Invoice Qty Rale Weight Ch. Wt Total
LR Value
1 1023557 20.08.2024 BANGALORE  BLR LOUNGE MUMBAI- MR.RAVI SFC 3627221 5310 1 16.00 8590  10.000  180.00
SERVICES NIKI ARTS
PRIVATE
LIMITED
DOCKET / LR CHARGE 50.00
' Total Bill Amount = 210.00
FOV on declared invoice value 0.02% = 10.62
Fuel Surcharge = 22.06
SUB TOTAL = 242.68
IGST @ of 5.00 % = 1213
Rounding Off = 0.19
Grand Total = 255.00

INR Two Hundred Fifty Five Only

E.80.E.PAYMENTS
1. All Bills should normally be settled within one week of the date of the bill For PCS EXPRESS CARGO

unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge
interest at the rate of 24% p.a. on all outstanding accounts.

. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.

. PAN NO : AARPH3638J

SAC / HSN CODE : 996791 @5% for Transport Service

_SAC /HSN CODE : 996812 @18% for Courier Service
. All cheques should be drawn cross A/c. Payee in favour of "PCS EXPRESS CARGO"

. This is computer generated invoice, does not required signature.

w N

Accountant / Manager

Bank Details

Bank Name : ICICI BANK LTD

A/C No. : 643405054048

A/C Name PCS EXPRESS CARGO
Bank Branch : GOREGAON

IFSC Code ICIC0006434

MICR Code
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Triplicate for supplier.

TAX INVOICE #172

diki Arts
348, Ganesh Chowk Buwapada, Ambernath West 421505,
mbarnatn, MH (27) 421501, IN

- Amount Due:

919028911211 E Issue Date: 13- Aug - 2024

ikiartsss@gmail.com y Shbe 12apeR

STIN: 27AGLPGE516G1ZD Contact Name: Pravin Gupta - : o mber hia el 213

PO Date: 05 - Aug - 2024

Place of Supply: KA (29)

illo Ship To

LR Lounge Services Private Limited Ravi Kumar 74060 06091

vi Kumar 74060 06091 Kempegowda International Airport KIAL Rd. Devanhali, Bengaluru

empe)gowda International Airport KIAL Rd. Devanhali, Bengaluru (Bangalore) Urban, Karnataka Bangalore 560300, Banglore, KA (29)

ar:galore) Urban, Karnataka Bangalore 560300, Banglore, KA (29) 560300, IN : :

10300, IN :

vi.kumar@k-corp.in
STIN: 29AAICB4881B1ZM

l:N e

- Qty
i i /SAC
- Description et o e

Price TaxableValue = = [GST Amount
® @R PEal

v

1 Sticker : 4821 10,000 0.45 4,500.00 810.00 5,310.00
7.5 X 9 Date Sticker with TFS Logo Nos ' 18%

count Holder Napa: NiKI ARTS Total @18% 4,500.00 810.00 5,310.00

nk Name: AMBERNATH JAI-HIND CO-OF BANK

) Total Taxable value A %4,500.00

-ount Number: 1005014001162 - Total Value (in figure) ' 5310

anch Name: WIMCO BRANCH Total Value (in words) X Five Thousand Three Hundred Ten Only

C Code: AJHC0001005

‘ms & Conditions

nk Account Holder Name : NIKI ARTS
“ount No: 018963400002405

C Code: YESBOOOO189

nk Name: YES BANK

mnch: LAMINGTON ROAD, MUMBA/

tnvorice made with Sleefk Bifl.




8/26/24, 7:38 FM

1 message

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0

Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>
To: Ravi Kumar <ravi.kumar@k-corp.in>
Cc: "Zafar Hashmi (PCS Courier)" <zafar.hashmi@pcsexp.in>, Pcs
corp.in>, "bangalore.store” <bangalore.store@blrlounge.in>, Pravin Gupta <nikiartsss@gmail.com>, Zafar Hashmi

<zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>

Gmail - Re: FW: BLR-LOUNGE- STICKER REQUIREMENT 5 aug

v

Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>

Re: FW: BLR-LOUNGE- STICKER REQUIREMENT 5 éﬁg

Mon, Aug 26, 2024 at 5:56 PM

Customer Care <customercare@pcsexp.in>, Prathap R <prathap.r@k-

Dear Sir

Shipment delivered

PFA : POD

AWB No. 1023557
20/08/2024

Booking Date

Consignee Name

BLR LOUNGE SERVICES PRIVATE LIMITED

Delivery Date and Time

Origin MUMBAI

Destination BANGALORE

Status Delivered
24/08/2024

Receiver Name

Sign 7 Co Stamp_ Sandeep

Forwarding AWB No.

Shipment Progress for AWB No. 1023557

Regards

Wasim bhaldar

o T = =
FRESS
Fvery Tame. On Tima

pes.courier@ymail.com

Date Time Location Status
22/08/2024 1417 MUMBAI SHIPMENT SENT TO BANGALORE
20/08/2024 1324 MUMBAI SHIPMENT RECEIVED

Liquidity is the main substance to move anything faster.

On Wed, Aug 21, 2024 at 12:11 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear sir,

Shipment Picked up from

Niki Arts Mumbai

Being sent to / For

BLR Lounge Service Bangalore

Docket / LR Number & Date

1023557 Dt.20.08.2024

Declared Invoice Value

Rs.5,310/-

/2ik=071576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:180771 3838560913577%7Cmsg-a:r470813573675841916...

1/4



8/26/24, 7:38 PM Gmalil - Re: FW: BLR-LOUNGE- STICKER REQUIREMENT 5 aug

Vendor Invoice Number - .
Total Number of Parcels 1 No !
Billing / in account of... BLR LOUNGE SERVICE

PO Number (issued to vendor) if any PO/24-25/001213
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Regards,

Pradnya

(PRESS

Ewery hima, On Time.

qafl 1 pes.courier@gmail.com

Liquidity is the main substance to move anything faster.

On Mon, Aug 19, 2024 at 10:41 AM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:
Noted

EXFPRESS

Every Time, On Time

‘mnil s pes.courier@gmail.com

Liguidity is the main substance to move anything faster.

On Sun, Aug 18, 2024 at 2:07 PM Ravi Kumar <ravi.kumar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear Pcs Team,

Please pick up the materials from NIKI ARTS and deliver at terminal -1 Banglore.

NIKI ARTS

H.N.5348 Buwapada,
https://mail.goagle.com/mail/u/0/?ik=071 576a55d&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 180771 3838560913577%7Cmsg-a:r470813573675841916... 214

-



8/26/24, 7:38 PM Gmail - Re: FW: BLR-LOUNGE- STICKER REQUIREMENT 5 aug
Ganesh Chowk, Kalyan-Badlapur Road,

Ambarnath West Mob No - +919028911211/9272211241
GSTIN/UIN: 27AGLPG6516G1ZD

State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27

Contact : 9272211241,9028911211 E-Mail : nikiartsss@gmail.com

Niki Arts
Pravin Gupta
0028911211 / 9270491241

Thanks/Regards,

$. Ravi Kumar. | SCM-Bangalore. | 740 600 6091.

From: Pravin Gupta <nikiartsss@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, August 17, 2024 11:57 AM

To: Ravi Kumar <ravi.kumar@k-corp.in>

Cc: Prathap R <prathap.r@k-corp.in>; bangalore.store <bangalore.store@blrlounge.in>
Subject: Re: BLR-LOUNGE- STICKER REQUIREMENT 5 aug

Your Sticker is Ready pls collect your Delivery

On Mon, Aug 5, 2024 at 5:55 PM Ravi Kumar <ravi.kumar@k-corp.in> wrote:

Hi

:

Please arrange to send the materials as per PO attached.

| |

: | Unitof | Direct 3 —
No. Description | Quantity } Measure Unit Vendor No. :n ar Due Date
% | Code Cost | | ame
| R I
: 2000896 | STICKER DATE TFS LOGO NO 10,000.00 | NOS ‘ 0.45 | VEND0394 | Niki Arts | 10-08-24
Thanks/Regards,
https://mail.gcogle.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07" 576355d&view=pt&search=al!&permth’ld=thread-f:180771 3838560913577%7Cmsg-a:r470813573675841916... 3/4



