PCS EXPRESS CARGO

Shop No 980 1st Part, Riddhi Siddhi CHSL,
Jogeshwari West, Oshiwara,
Mumbai - 400102,

Email .: pcs.courier@gmail.com | Tel:+9122 6236 0112 .
GSTIN : 27AARPH3638J1ZA
To,
M/S. TFS (R & R WORKS) PVT LTD . HARAYANA Invoice No  : CR/156/24-24
133.5 KILOMETER STONE, Page No. : 1
NH-44 , VILLAGE , JHANJARI , Invoice Date  : 25.04.2024
KARNAL , KARNAL , HARYANA , Period From : 31-01-2024
KARNAL - 132001 Period To : 31-01-2024
Customer GSTIN : 06AADCT1597R1ZL Customer Code T-0010
SR. DOCKET ~ DATE.  DESTINATION  CONSIGNEE PICK-UP FROM REFERENCE  VECHILENO MODE INVO?CEEC:-/‘:\EEE Qry D/s  WT CHWT TOTAL
1 1015230 31.01.2024  KARNAL  TFS( R&R WORKS) JUB’:L::{':;;?D ABDUL RAHMAN DL;;AL:H FIL 7,96,500.00 2  SPX 11,500.00
DOCKET / LR CHARGE 50.00
Total Bill Amount = 11,550.00
FOV ON DECLARED INVOICE @0.2%= 1,593.00
Fuel Surcharge @10%= 1,314.30

SUB TOTAL=  14,457.30
IGST 5.00% = 722.87
Grand Total= 15,180.17

INR FIFTEEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY AND PAISE SEVENTEEN ONLY.
E.80.E.PAYMENTS

1. All Bills should normally be settled within one week of the date of the bill
unless otherwise arranged. The company reserves the right to charge interest
at the rate of 24% p.a. on all outstanding accounts.
2. All cheques should be drawn Cross "A/c Payee" in favour of "PCS Express Cargo"
. Receipt of official receipt duly signed will be considered valid.
. PAN NO : AARPH3638)
SAC / HSN CODE : 996791
BANK DETAILS
Bank Name : SAMATA SAHAKARI BANK LTD.
Account Number : *004300100003009
|IFSC CODE : SRCBOSAMO001
BRANCH : OSHIWA‘RA
Changes in the Invoice can be done only within 5 days.
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(Not Negotiable)
At Owner's Risk
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e-Way Bill

(=] ote

Nay Bill No: 3117 2251 3649

Nay Bill Date: 31/01/2024 03:01 PM

‘nerated By: 06AAB CD182 1C1ZF - JUBILANT FOODWORKS LIMITED
lid From: 31/01/2024 03:01 PM [173Kms]

lid Until: 01/02/2024

rt-A

STIN of Supplier

06AABCD1821C1ZF,JFL-Palwal 3PL

ace,of Dismatch

Gurugram,HARYANA-122506

STIN of Recipient

06AAD CT159 7R1ZL ,TFS R AND R WORKS PRIVATE LIMITED

ace of Delivery

Karnal,HARYANA-132001

scument No. HR2050001638
)cumept Date 30/01/2024
ansaction Type: Regular

lue of Goods 796500

SN Code

84198190 - NVA-R&M OVEI‘{ SMALL
%

2ason for Transportation

Outward - Supply

ansporter

27AARPH3638J1ZA & PSC EXPRESS

art-B

Vehicle / Trans
lode |
: Doc No & Dt.

i

From

Entered Date

Entered By

Road 1 DLO1LAH9749 & 1015230 & 30/01/2024

Gurugram

31/01/2024 03:01 PM

06AABCD1821C1ZF

TR

311722513649

: CEWB No.

- (If any)

Multi Veh.Info

(If any)



Gmail Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com>

Re: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

1 message

Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> Thu, Feb 1, 2024 at 6:24 PM
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

Cc: Zafar Hashmi <zafarhashmi74@gmail.com>, Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>, Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>, Manish Kumar-
New <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>, Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Kishor Singh Rawat <kishor.rawat@jublfood.com>, Aloke
Kumar Mallick <aloke.mallick@jublfood.com>, "Raj Singh. Rawat" <Raj.Rawat@jublfood.com>, Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@jublfood.com>, Dheeraj Yadav
<dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>, Vishal Gupta <Vishal.Gupta@)jublfood.com>

Shipment Delivered
AWB No. 1015230
Booking Date 31/01/2024
Consignee Name JUBILANT FOOD WORKS LTD HARYANA TO TFS R&R WORKS KARNAL
Destination KARNAL
Status OK DELIVERED
Delivery Date & Time 01/01/2024
Receiver Name SIGN & CO. STAMP _ SANDEEP
Forwarding No. 0
Regards,

MOHD SULEMAN

EXPRESS
Every Time, On Time.

Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com

On Thu, Feb 1, 2024 at 5:19 PM Pcs Courier <pcs.courier@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,
Shipment Picked up from JUBILANT FOOD WORKS LTD HARYANA
Being sent to / For TFS R&R WORKS KARNAL
Docket / LR Number & Date 1015230 Dt.31.01.2024
Declared Invoice Value 7,96,500
Vendor Invoice Number HR2050001638
Total Number of Parcels 2 NOS
Billing / in account of... TFS
PO Number (Issued To Vendor) if any | -

) KYC MANDATORY DOCKET /LR.
(ot Negtiabie)
At Ownser's Risk
ot Pump,
MMIN:JW“‘I.MKRM:;A“:L:':‘I;"::;”’ J q 1 5 2 3 O
EXPRESS Cufomercom@ipcieDin  Www/pCSOXDIn J 194
Every Time, On Tima. SUBJECT TO MUMBAI JURISDICTION
ACCOUNT NUMBER | SHIPPER'S REFERENCE ] ORIGIN | DESTINATION PIECES DATE WEIGHT

T v Ha dkg va] | 2PC [31[1]90%
] cfs‘H:Y IA%{JJ} I wtli‘_l 5 CONSIGNEE  scr.wr. VOL.WT.
Sendershame 3 Lt buq—[,?ﬂ@mwmmm Tﬁ DAL voerk( =

Company e

Address oo AL Lo R U ot Lol 4""“”] 3.5 Kiljo mﬂv“"?" NH'I/V

AR o uhlm AR
T g < MU-BG/K LR rda0l] Hou/(Y

Eom kN g 2T

NGBS LAY DIERAC) | TeNe: _
Oy L e oty o | by @ [om Kerrhg | conty Md/‘
GeomesTic Ooox  [C)mbox DAIR

me '}75:00// ] wreanaTioNAL | [] commencs swpwent | [ SURFACE

inen
LXWNXH

Freight
EXPi Received in good order & condifon
e g Tt P N e of s w2 PCS RESS Fosl
o et b g i . 4 gy
i o B k. 0 e 7 8 e il of Y s
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o s s .| e 4 W o W g ~
l-—z—i-‘-:-ﬁ-.:n"-!‘l
oo i et e g el
DATE : DATE : Affix Co. Stamp
SHIPPLRS CICMATURE DATE
Rail / Road Ehild | —

| Regards,



. MOHD SULEMAN

 EXPRESS

Every Time, On Time.

Email : pcs.courier@gmail.com

- On Tue, Jan 30, 2024 at 10:56 AM Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

Dear PCS team,
|| Request you to kindly align pickup of material. This is an Oven worth 10 Lacs.
We will require 8 to 10 ft vehicle for pickup and insurance for the same to be done.

Proper recording of loading to be shared here.

. Thanks & Regards,
' Abdul Rehman

H | & +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

| From: Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@jublfood.com>

| Sent: 29 January 2024 09:37
To: Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@jublfood.com>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-
corp.in>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal. Gupta@)jublfood.com>
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New

| <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Kishor Singh Rawat

- <kishor.rawat@jublfood.com>; Aloke Kumar Mallick <aloke.mallick@jublfood.com>

Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

| Hi Abdul,
| Pls. place the vehicle on tomorrow at our Farukh nagar, GGN, warehouse.
% Contact Person-Mr. Kishore-9999461566

. Thanks & Regards

‘ Raj Rawat

| From: Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@jublfood.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 12:18 PM

To: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>; Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@)jublfood.com>; Abdul Rehman
| <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal.Gupta@)jublfood.com>

| Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New

| <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

| Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

i




@Vishal Gupta@Raj Singh. Rawat- Please help handover of this small oven to TFS if all payments and documents are in place.

i

Rgds/ Jatin

From: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

' Sent: 25 January 2024 12:10

| To: Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@)jublfood.com>; Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>

- Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New

| <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal. Gupta@jublfood.com>;
Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@jublfood.com>

| Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

"CAUTION: This Email Originated outside the organization. Don't respond, Click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender name/email and know the content is safe."

This need to expedite and it’s been pending from last 2 months.

| @IJatin, Kindly intervene.

Thanks and Regards

Dheeraj Yadav

' Senior Manager Projects

| Travel Food Services

504, Regus, Level — 5
Caddie Commercial Tower,
Hospitality District Aerocity ,
' New Delhi - 110037

| 8920837882

| From: Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@jublfood.com>
| Sent: 24 January 2024 01:04 PM
To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New
- <manish.k@travelfoodservices.coms; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@
 travelfoodservices.coms; Vishal Gupta <Vishal.Gupta@)jublfood.com>; Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@jublfood.com>
' Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

| | CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the |



. | content is safe.

| Hi Abdul,
| will update you the schedule.

Thanks & Regards

Raj Rawat

| From: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>
Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 1:03 PM

' To: Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@jublfood.com>
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New
<manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@
travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal.Gupta@)jublfood.com>; Jatin Rai <jatin.rai@)jublfood.com>

| Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

"CAUTION: This Email Originated outside the organization. Don't respond, Click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender name/email and know the content is safe."

Dear Raj,

As discussed please take this up on priority.

' Thanks & Regards,
Abdul Rehman

€@ +91 9920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

From: Abdul Rehman
Sent: 19 January 2024 13:23
' To: Raj Singh. Rawat <Raj.Rawat@jublfood.com>
Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New
. <manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@
travelfoodservices.com>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal. Gupta@jublfood.com>; jatin.rai@jublfood.com
' Subject: RE: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery

Dear Raj,
| PFA Po copy. As discussed with you requesy you to kindly share the pick up details.

Our details are already available with you as we have already purchased Big oven at the same sight.

Location PO No Vendor Name Description |QTY|PO value without GST | PO value with GST




Karnal Haveli | PO/KRLH232400095 | Jubilant Food Works Limited | Oven XLT 1832 1 . 675,000/7,96,500.00

. Payment Details

. JUBILANT FOOD WORKS LIMITED G217000048360001 /00030330006398 HSBCN23217134528 2023/08/05 184047 VEN286507009

Thanks & Regards,
| Abdul Rehman

€& +91 9920292129

' Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

| From: Dheeraj Yadav <dheeraj.yadav@travelfoodservices.com>

| Sent: 12 January 2024 09:34

' To: Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in>; Vishal Gupta <Vishal.Gupta@jublfood.com>; jatin.rai@jublfood.com

| Cc: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Swapnil Sutar <swapnil.sutar@k-corp.in>; Manish Kumar-New
<manish.k@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

| Subject: Re: PO/KRLH232400095 Delivery )

Hi Vishal,
| Kindly share the plan by when we have the spare OVEN at the outlet.
- Kindly conclude it today.

Thanks

Dheeraj

Sent from Android device

' On 8 Jan 2024 17:42, Abdul Rehman <abdul.rehman@k-corp.in> wrote:

!

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know |
the content is safe. i

|

Dear Vishal,

PFA po copy for small oven to be delivered at Karnal Haveli. Payment details for the same is given below as well.

| Request you to kindly let us know by when can we pick up the equipment.



Location

PO No

Vendor Name

Description

QTY

PO value without GST

PO value with GST

Karnal Haveli |PO/KRLH232400095

Jubilant Food Works Limited

Oven XLT 1832

675,000

7,96,500.00

Payment Details

JUBILANT FOOD WORKS LIMITED G217000048360001 /00030330006398 HSBCN23217134528 2023/08/05 184047 VEN286507009

| Thanks & Regards,

Abdul Rehman

B| 8 +919920292129

Travel Food Services Pvt. Limited.

| DISCLAIMER This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and are solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is

. addressed. Any use, distribution, copying or disclosure by any other person is strictly prohibited. If you receive this transmission in error, please
notify the sender by reply email and then destroy the message. Opinions, conclusions and other information in this message that do not relate
to official business of the company shall be understood to be neither given nor endorsed by JUBILANT FOODWORKS LTD. Any information
contained in this email, when addressed to Clients is subject to the terms and conditions in governing client contract




