
From: Rahul Sharma <rahul.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>  

Sent: 06 December 2024 13:20 

To: Rohit Kadam <rohit.kadam@semolinakitchens.com> 

Cc: Amrit Kumar Bangur <amrit.bangur@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh 

<vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nayana Saha <nayana.saha@travelfoodservices.com>; 

Kumar Dhulap <kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com>; Muskan Somani 

<muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; Shrutej Sawant 

<shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet.Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com> 

Subject: Re: MALS-SKPL - liquor Invoicing - Nov 2024 

 

Dear Rohit 

 

We have checked the sales and raised the invoice attached for the same. 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

Rahul Sharma 

Semolina Kitchens Pvt. Ltd 

Accounts Receivable & Taxation 

 

 

From: Rohit Kadam <rohit.kadam@semolinakitchens.com> 

Sent: Friday, December 6, 2024 12:47 PM 

To: Rahul Sharma <rahul.sharma@semolinakitchens.com> 

Cc: Amrit Kumar Bangur <amrit.bangur@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh 

<vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nayana Saha <nayana.saha@travelfoodservices.com>; 

Kumar Dhulap <kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com>; Rahul Sharma 

<rahul.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Muskan Somani 

<muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com>; Shrutej Sawant 

<shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Ameet.Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com> 

Subject: RE: MALS-SKPL - liquor Invoicing - Nov 2024  

  

Hi Rahul, 

  

Please check the sales and Invoice raise it. 
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Regards, 

Rohit Kadam. 

  

From: Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com>  

Sent: 05 December 2024 11:19 

To: Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Muskan Somani 

<muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com> 

Cc: Amrit Kumar Bangur <amrit.bangur@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh 

<vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nayana Saha <nayana.saha@travelfoodservices.com>; 

Kumar Dhulap <kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com>; Rahul Sharma 

<rahul.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Rohit Kadam <rohit.kadam@semolinakitchens.com> 

Subject: Re: MALS-SKPL - liquor Invoicing - Nov 2024 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open 

attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe. 

  

Please loop Rohit  

  

Thanks and Regards  

  

Ameet Koomar  

 

From: Shrutej Sawant <shrutej.sawant@travelfoodservices.com> 

Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2024 10:58:35 AM 

To: Muskan Somani <muskan.somani@semolinakitchens.com> 

Cc: Amrit Kumar Bangur <amrit.bangur@travelfoodservices.com>; Vipul Parikh 

<vipul.parikh@travelfoodservices.com>; Nayana Saha <nayana.saha@travelfoodservices.com>; 

Kumar Dhulap <kumar.dhulap@travelfoodservices.com>; Rahul Sharma 

<rahul.sharma@semolinakitchens.com>; Ameet Koomar <Ameet.Koomar@adani.com> 

Subject: MALS-SKPL - liquor Invoicing - Nov 2024  

  

*CAUTION: This mail has originated from outside Adani. Please exercise caution with links and 

attachments.* 

  

Dear Muskan, 
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PFA Alcohol sales invoice working for Nov 2024. 

  

Pls raise invoice on MALS accordingly & share the invoice 

  

Thanks & Regards, 

Shrutej Sawant 

9029902538 

 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this electronic message and any other attachment to this 

message are intended solely for the addressee and may contain information that is confidential, 

privileged and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this e-mail, in whole or in 

part, is strictly prohibited. Please immediately notify the sender by return e-mail and delete all 

copies of this e-mail and any attachments from your system. Any views or opinions presented in this 

email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the company.  

 

WARNING: Computer viruses can be transmitted via email. The recipient should check this email and 

any attachments for the presence of viruses. Adani Group accepts no liability for any damage caused 

by any virus transmitted by this email.  

 


