Nimisha Jadhav

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Please proceed.

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Prakash Mistry

Saturday, April 13, 2024 9:03 AM

Nimisha Jadhav

Khushbu Verma; Stephen P; Irfan Sayed; Suraj Kumbhar; Urmila Jadhav

Re: Invoices - NSA design - SKPL projects

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2024 8:21:13 PM
To: Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Khushbu Verma <khushbu.dayal@travelfoodservices.com>; Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>; Irfan Sayed <irfan.sayed@travelfoodservices.com>; Suraj Kumbhar
<suraj.kumbhar@travelfoodservices.com>; Urmila Jadhav <urmila.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Invoices - NSA design - SKPL projects

Dear Prakash,

Please find attached invoice for your approval.

Lucknow Project

Basic Remark- Invoice L
Outlet . invoice
H#NAME? Amount Finance date

23-08- | PO/SKPL/23- 20-11-23 GST-23-2.

NSA Design 23 24/001104 306,990 55,258 362,248 CDH/ Mamagoto/Own Lucknowi concept Interior consultant | Approved 025
23-08- | PO/SKPL/23- 91-12-23 GST-23-2.

NSA Design 23 24/001104 - - - CDH/ Mamagoto/Own Lucknowi concept Interior consultant | Approved 028
23-08- | PO/SKPL/23- 12-04-24 GST-24-2.

NSA Design 23 24/001104 - - - CDH/ Mamagoto/Own Lucknowi concept Interior consultant | Approved 010
PO/SKPL/23- GST-23-2.

NSA Design 24/000997 164,139 29,545 193,684 | Flying bites Interior consultant | Approved | 20-11-23 020




PO/SKPL/23- GST-24-2!
NSA Design 24/000997 - - - Flying bites Interior consultant | Approved | 12-04-24 006
PO/SKPL/23- GST-23-2.
NSA Design 24/000999 115,797 20,843 136,640 | Low price point Interior consultant | Approved | 20-11-23 024
PO/SKPL/23- GST-23-2.
NSA Design 24/000999 - - - Low price point Interior consultant | Approved | 12-04-24 007
PO/SKPL/23- GST-24-2.
NSA Design 24/001008 788,844 141,992 930,836 | Good times bar Interior consultant | Approved | 12-04-24 008

Jaipur project .

Basic Amount PO Value Outlet R.emark- invoice
Finance date

NSA

Design 04-08- PO/SKPL/23- Interior

studio 23 24/001010 218,634 39,354 257,988 | KFC consultant Approved 12-Apr-24
NSA

Design 04-08- PO/SKPL/23- Masala Interior

studio 23 24/001012 77,760 13,997 91,757 | Kitchen consultant Approved 12-Apr-24
NSA

Design 04-08- PO/SKPL/23- Interior

studio 23 24/001013 343,440 61,819 405,259 | Seating consultant Approved 12-Apr-24

Mumbai Project.

Vendor Name

Month

PO No.

Basic Amount

PO Value

Outlet

NSA DESIGN STUDIO

06/03/2024

Semolina/P0O/23-

24/000665

303,432

54,618

358,050 | KFC

Thanks & Regards,
Nimisha Jadhav



From: Amit <bk.oipl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2024 6:40 PM

To: Stephen P <stephen.p@k-corp.in>

Cc: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>; Genesis Arch <navjot@genarch.in>; Prakash Mistry <prakash.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Invoices

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Stephen,
Attached herewith, please find the tax invoices for next stage payments.

e Flying Bytes, Lucknow Airport

e Low price point, Lucknow Airport
o Budweiser, Lucknow Airport

e KFC, Jaipur Airport

e Ultra Bar, Jaipur Airport

e Masala Kitchen, Jaipur Airport

« Seating, Jaipur Airport

o KFC Forecourt, Mumbai Airport

Kindly review and process these invoices for payment.
Regards,

Amit
NSA Design Studio



