Invoices TFS

Subject: FW: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

From: Kerrsi Mistry <kerrsirusi.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 12 April 2024 13:18

To: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo@k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Lounge Store2 <lounge.store2@mumbailounge.in>; Sanjay Pimenta <sanjay.pimenta@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

Approved

Kerrsi

From: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 11 April 2024 15:51

To: Kerrsi Mistry <kerrsirusi.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Chhabir Sahoo Kcorp <chhabir.sahoo @k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Lounge Store2 <Jounge.store2@mumbailounge.in>; Sanjay Pimenta <sanjay.pimenta@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>; Prasad Gurav <prasad.gurav@semolinakitchens.com>; Paresh Patil <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir,

Please Approve on coffee machine rental bill of Fresh & Honest coffee machine for months Jan & Mar 2024

Reference Number Location | Invoice Date | Invoice Number Bill Amount Vendor Name

MALSEXP20222302273 | MALS 29-Jan-24 | MUM/IN/436//0124 62,540.00 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited
MALSEXP20222302263 | MALS 28-Feb-24 | MUM/IN/526/0224 62,540.00 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited
MALSEXP20222302269 | MALS 26-Mar-24 | MUM/IN/529/0324 62,540.00 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited

Thanks & Regards,
Vishal Gandhi
Sr. Exe Pur - MALS| M: 9930216669

COLTRRATING
Crealing memanes and inspinng

happiness through food, since 1972

K - @

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 10 April 2024 11:07

To: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Kerrsi Mistry <kerrsirusi.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>; Chhabir Sahoo <chhabir.sahoo @k-corp.in>; Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Lounge Store2 <lounge.store2 @mumbailounge.in>; Sanjay Pimenta
<sanjay.pimenta@travelfoodservices.com>




Subject: FW: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd
Importance: High

HI Vishal,

Due to non-payment of the previous MALS bills, vendor not accepting new orders. Kindly arrange Approval on priority to avoid supply issue.

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 20 March 2024 20:48

To: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Kerrsi Mistry <kerrsirusi.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: RE: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

Hi Vishal,

Please arrange Approval on attached coffee machine Rent bill.

From: Invoices TFS

Sent: 11 March 2024 10:28

To: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Anil Nayak <anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>; Kerrsi Mistry <kerrsirusi.mistry@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: FW: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

Hi Vishal,

Please arrange Approval on attached coffee machine Rent bill.

Reference Number Location | Invoice Date | Invoice Number Bill Amount Vendor Name
MALSEXP20222302273 | MALS 29-Jan-24 | MUM/IN/436//0124 62,540.00 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited
MALSEXP20222302263 | MALS 28-Feb-24 | MUM/IN/526/0224 62,540.00 | Fresh & Honest Cafe Limited

From: creditcontrol mumbai <Mumbai.Creditcontrol@Freshandhonest.com>
Sent: 11 March 2024 10:17

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Aniket Suryakant Khedekar <Aniket.S@Freshandhonest.com>

Subject: Re: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

You don't often get email from mumbai.creditcontrol@freshandhonest.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Team,
As require PFA Rental invoice of Jan 2024 with digitally signed for your reference.

Kindly process the same for payment.

Regards,
Raju Arumugan



Executive - Credit Control,
Fresh and Honest Cafe Ltd .

From: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Sunday, March 10, 2024 11:28 AM

To: creditcontrol mumbai <Mumbai.Creditcontrol@Freshandhonest.com>

Cc: Aniket Suryakant Khedekar <Aniket.S@Freshandhonest.com>; Aniket Suryakant Khedekar <Aniket.S@Freshandhonest.com>
Subject: FW: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

Hi Sir,
Please share us rental bill copy of Jan-24...

From: creditcontrol mumbai <Mumbai.Creditcontrol@Freshandhonest.com>

Sent: 02 March 2024 16:05

To: Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Vishal Gandhi <vishal.gandhi@k-corp.in>; 'Paresh Patil' <paresh.patil@k-corp.in>; Tejas Mahesh Bagwe <Tejas.Bagwe@Freshandhonest.com>; Aniket Suryakant Khedekar <Aniket.S@Freshandhonest.com>
Subject: Machine rental invoice - Mumbai Airport Lounge Services Pvt. Ltd

You don't often get email from mumbai.creditcontrol@freshandhonest.com. Learn why this is important

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir/Madam,
Greetings From Lavazza - Fresh & Honest Café Ltd !!!
PFA rental invoice for the month of Feb 2024 with digital signature.

Request you to process the same for payment.

Thank You'!

Regards,
Raju Arumugan
Executive - Credit Control,

Fresh and Honest Cafe Ltd .
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