Tel.: +91 22 2201 2191
+91 22 2201 5499

(R decorators

(Government & Municipal Contractors)

50/60, sitaram poddar marg, on hire :
mumbai : 400 002.
manishkyal@hotmail.com
www.motidecorators.com

specialist in

tables, cocktail and bar tables, bar stools, chairs, sofas,
mattresses, pillows, air circulators & other event furnitures.
wedding mandaps, temporary illuminiation, intelligent
lightings & corpcrate events.

Tax Invoice

Invoice No: - Dec/95/2024 Date:- 24th December 2024
Delivery Challan No: - ccg - 4701 dtd:-  23-12-2024 [State:-  Maharashtra | code | 27
Hirer Consignee

Name: - TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES LIMITED

Name:-  TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES LIMITED

Unit: -

Add: - 1st Floor, Block A South Wing, Shiv Sagar Estate, Add: - 1st Floor, Block A South Wing, Shiv Sagar Esta
Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 400018 Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli, Mumbai - 4000I
GSTIN: -  27AADCB2762L1ZI GSTIN: - 27AADCB2762L12I
State:-  Maharashtra ICode l 27 State: - Maharashtra | Code I 27
Charges for Supply of Material to You On Hire at TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES LIMITED, Dr. Annie Besant Road, Worli,
Mumbai For 23rd December 2024 as under: - .
S. Oty Rate Nos of Dty Taxable CGST SGST Total
No Per Pc Value  |Rate | Amount |Rate |Amount
4 _|Chaffing Dish with Pan 350 Day 1,400 | 9% 126 | 9% 126 1,652
1 |Heating lamp 1500 Day 1,500 | 9% 135 | 9% 135 1,770
Shortage / Breakage . @ . -
Total 2,900 | 9% 261 | 9% 261 3,422
Total Amount in Words Total Amount Before Tax 2,900
Rupees: Three Thousand Four Hundred and Twenty Two Only Add: - CGST9 % 261
Add: - SGST9 % 261
Total Tax Amount 522
Total Amount After Tax 3,422
GST' N . 27AAH FM5939R12c Ceritified that the particulars given above are true & correct
SAC / HSN Code : 998599 For Moti Decorators
PAN : AAHFM5939R ‘W":( y
Bank A/C: 04 08 02 00 00 00 73 ng
Bank IFSC: BARBONEPEAN (Zero) \f/
Bank Name: Bank of Baroda, Nepeansea Rd Br Authorised Signatory




Delivery Challan

off.: +91 22 22 01 2191
workshop : +91 22 22 06 3454
mob : +91 93 21 27 2034

on hire : crockery, cutlery, glasswares & event furnitures

office  : 50/60 sitaram poddar marg, mumbai-400 002.

challan no.: €€9-

4701

mr./ms./m/s:.

add.:

—Jrravel Jood Qexvles fvhltd

supplied at : 1

sate 2 3] 1201
Y 150 P,

n Y

time :

cntc person: ~

tel : ALY ?qu'O&»
hire date : <2 3 I l—(] s (W

SI.

- quantity

particulars

quantity
recd

recd date
D) Ly el

breakage

balance
shortage

Ok
Ok

crate:

peti :

jaali :

| MYan mMuolly ve29
65566614

goods received in good condition.

receiver's signature

Material Supplied Are
On HIRING Basis Only.

-

P godownkeeper



manishkyal@hotmail.com

From: Manish Kyal

Sent: 23 December 2024 16:23

To: Royston Netto; KST Supervisor; manishkyal @hotgmail.com

Ce: prabhakar.sawant

Subject: RE: Require ¢ Chaffing dish with pan - 4 and Heating lamp - 1
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sir,

Greetings From Moti Decorators..!!

Please Find Below the Quote for the Materials required for 23" December 2024 @ TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES PRIVATE
LIMITED , Mumbai as under :-

Sr. no Qty Items No Of | Rate Amount Loss of
Days Material
1 4 Chaffing dish with pan : 1 350 1,400 7,500
2 il Heating lamp 1 1,500 1,500 13,500
Total Before Taxes 2,900
Add:- 18% GST 522
Total After Taxes 3,422

The above rates are as per the agreement with Ka:pco Collective.
Request You To Kindly Confirm the Same at the Earliest.

Do feel Free to call me on the Nos. mentioned below in case of any further assistance, I'll be glad to assist you.
Assuring you best of Our Services.!!

Thanks & Regards,

Team Moti Decorators

From: Royston Netto <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>

Sent: 23 December 2024 15:40

To: KST Supervisor <kst.supervisor@cateringcollective.in>; manishkyal@hotgmail.com; manishkyal@hotmail.com
Cc: prabhakar.sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Require » Chaffing dish with pan - 4 and Heating lamp - 1

FYI

From: Royston Netto

Sent: 23 December 2024 15:34

To: KST Supervisor <kst.supervisor@cateringcollective.in>; manishkyal@hotgmail.com
Cc: prabhakar.sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Require » Chaffing dish with pan - 4 and Heating lamp - 1

1



Dear Team,
We require below list billing in name of TFS attached GST

e Chaffing dish with pan -4
e Heatinglamp-1

Regards,
Royston Netto
9167473903



