11/27/24, 2:37 PM Mail - Senthil Raj P - Outlook

ﬁ Outlook

Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to
Travel Food Services

From Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Wed 11/27/2024 2:23 PM
To  Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc  Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar
<samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav
Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle
Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

0 2 attachments (324 KB)
PRI_Oct'24_3016042317_8066787373_old.pdf; Service Interruption;

Dear Parag,
| am uploading the attached invoice in the Safal , please account and process the invoice.

Note : | have enclosed the service interruption mail as too.
Regards,
Senthil Raj P.

Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : & bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:15 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
Please process the invoices and clear the outstanding payment.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:04 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso
<corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>
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Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Hi Prabhakar,
Yes, it's a time-consuming process , already 7 days overdue. How about move on with the pending invoice payment
clearance ? It may lead to link disconnection.

Appreciated if you could be able to manage with ISP service providers ( Tata and Airtel).
Regards,

Senthil Raj P.

Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | @ www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : & bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 1:56 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
Please wait because now company name has changed from TFSPL to TFSLtd.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27,2024 12:51 PM

To: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhakar Sawant
<prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Hi Rochelle,
Kindly requesting you to close it today please.

Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | © www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : & bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927
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From: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2024 2:01 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Hi sir,
The Authorisation letter is ready, however neither Varun or Karan is in the office today.
When either of come to head office will get it signed.

Thanks
Rochelle

Sent from Outlook for Android

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2024 7:44:50 pm

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in
<Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to
Travel Food Services

Dear Prabhakar Ji,
PFA - Attached Invoice

ILL
PRI

Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | @ www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk :# bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | @ +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2024 7:42 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in <ramanaiah.yv@tatatel.co.in>;
Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
Please share me the Tata Tele invoice which we wanted to transfer from BLR to TFSPL

Regards
Prabhakar
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From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2024 7:38 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in; Samrat Narvekar
<samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Fw: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Importance: High

Dear Prabhakar Ji,
As continue with the joint call PFA - reference mail which is shared by Rochelle to Tata. Here GST is not relate to
Bangalore.
The second attachment has the list of documents required for company switch including NOC format .
Please needful the same on priority, hope you can

Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : £ bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : £ sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Monday, November 25, 2024 4:46 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Ramanaiah YV <Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in>; Rochelle Alphonso
<corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nithya L1 <Nithya.L1@tatatel.co.in>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R
<manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mumbai Admin <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
All documents provided, please confirm what is pending.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2024 8:59 AM

To: Ramanaiah YV <Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhakar
Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nithya L1 <Nithya.L1@tatatel.co.in>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R
<manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey
<parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mumbai Admin <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Hi Rochelle,
Kindly expedite on this matter and close by EOD.
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(@Prabhakar Sawant@Samrat Narvekar High priority.

Regards,
SR

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Ramanaiah YV <Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in>

Sent: Wednesday, November 20, 2024 11:52:01 AM

To: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Nithya L1 <Nithya.L1@tatatel.co.in>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag
Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mumbai Admin <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender
and know the content is safe.

HI Rochelle,
Greetings from TATA.

As discussed earlier please share the NOC documents , Karnataka GST and authorised signatory Govt ID Proof.

Thanks & Regards,
T: (80).66689121 | M: (91) 9036099062

Ramanaiah YV A Block,30/1, Silicon Terraces, Hosur Road Koramangala, Bangalore, Karnataka, 560095

Deputy Manager - Indirect - Sales
SME Business

TATATeIe‘ @ @ 0 @

s T . Connectivity Cloud & 5aas Collaboration Security Marketing Solutions
Business Services

www.tatatelebusiness.com IR To accelerate adoption of digital technologies by businesses aspiring to Do Big

OURVALUES [ odatards m SIMPLER EJ cLoser

This email is governed by the Disclaimer Terms of Tata Teleservices which may be viewed at https://www.tatatelebusiness.com/edisclaimer

From: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 19 November 2024 16:13

To: Ramanaiah YV <Ramanaiah.YV@tatatel.co.in>

Cc: Nithya L1 <Nithya.L1@tatatel.co.in>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag
Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Mumbai Admin <mumbai.admin@copperchimney.in>

Subject: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel Food
Services

Some people who received this message don't often get email from corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com. Learn why this is important

Hi Ramanaiah,

As discussed I have attached the documents to process the transfer of ownership BLR Lounge Services Private
Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel Food Services.
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Let me know if anything else is required.

Thanks & Regards,
Rochelle Alphonso
Executive - Administration
Travel food services.
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