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E Outlook

RE: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

From Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>
Date Wed 12/18/2024 3:38 PM

To  Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Anil Nayak
<anil.nayak@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc  Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Senthil
Please upload invoices, accounts team will do the payment. Once upload please share screen shot to Anil Nayak or Parag.

@Parag
Please help to do the payment.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 18, 2024 3:20 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Re: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

Dear Prabhakar,
Please expedite to share the required documents. As Q4 invoice has generated it may lead to link disconnection due to non-payment.

121-100028903-BBL.292512B034803-BW- 1 6-Dec-2024.pdf
Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
@ +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : & bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | @ +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | @ +91 973 822 2927

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17,2024 1:33 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

Dear Prabhakar,
Please assist to share the listed document for Airtel ISP ownership switch over.

Please find the below list of documents required for Company name change or/LSI transfer

. COlI certificate (Both Old & New company name should be reflecting)---WITH SEAL AND SIGNATURE

. New GST certificate (seal and sign is mandatory for all the 3 pages of GST, if multiple Links required all location GST 3 Pages with seal and sign)
. Authorization Letter-if sighatory name is not reflecting on GST

. ID proof-signatory person Government id card with seal and sign

NOC on Old Company’s letter head (format attached for you reference)- Required with old company seal and sign

. NOC on New Company’s letter head (format attached for you reference)- Required with New company seal and sign

. Master CAF (Please refer below table to fill) Photo with cross seal and sign is Mandatory(attached both Pdf and word format)

. Company PAN with seal and sign

Note: Please share the above documents with Company authorized sign & stamp on each pages.

e N O N

Page No. 1

Form Serial
No.

Header Name Need to Fill

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKADNjOGJMYWMOLTZKZJEtNDM5MyThNTgxLTlyNGU 1MjA10TQOOQAQAEGAGVbX%2BMpCv3Cs9Lxfxy8%3D 1/5
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1 Existing No’s/IDs Mention LSI ID
2 New services opted tick on lease line
3 Fill organization Organization name, designation, billing address, city/village
details. name, landmark, pin code, mobile & telephone number
4 Contact details Contact person name, dgsi.gnation, faddress, city/village,
landmark, email id & mobile number
6 Others Tick on others
25 d:ilz(:;gsn Customer signature require (Authorized person)
26 Place & Date Fill the details
Page No. 2 Terms and Conditions
19 d:(celi::atgsn Customer signature require (Authorized person)
Applicant's name Fill the details
Designation Fill the details
Place & Date Fill the details

Note: Please make sure company authorized sign & stamp is mandatory over the photo in Master CAF

Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : & bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | @ +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : & sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | @ +91 973 822 2927

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>
Sent: Friday, November 8, 2024 2:59 PM
To: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@blrlounge.in>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@blrlounge.in>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Bangalore IT

<bangalore.it@blrlounge.in>
Subject: Fw: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

Dear Samrat,

As discussed, we would require similar documents for Airtel ISP ILL Service provider as well. Please refer to the trail mail for detail information,

Customer Account Number : 31-21116784

Circuit ID : 13212986

Note : Invoice attached for your records and reference

Please reach out to me in case of any support is required from my end.

Regards,

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKADNjOGJmMYWMOLTZKZJEtNDM5MyThNTgxLTlyNGU 1MjA10TQOOQAQAEGAGVbX%2BMpCv3Cs9Lxfxy8%3D
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SR
Get Outlook for Android

From: Anusha U <a_Anusha.U1@airtel.com>

Sent: Friday, November 8, 2024 2:41:42 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>

Cc: Manjunath N <a_manjunath.n@airtel.com>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Bangalore IT <pbangalore.it@blrlounge.in>
Subject: RE: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Customer,
Please find the below list of documents required for Company name change or/LSI transfer

1. COI certificate (Both Old & New company name should be reflecting)---WITH SEAL AND SIGNATURE
2. New GST certificate (seal and sign is mandatory for all the 3 pages of GST, if multiple Links required all location GST 3 Pages with seal and sign)
3. Authorization Letter-if signatory name is not reflecting on GST
4. 1D proof-signatory person Government id card with seal and sign
5. NOC on Old Company’s letter head (format attached for you reference)- Required with old company seal and sign
6. NOC on New Company’s letter head (format attached for you reference)- Required with New company seal and sign
7. Master CAF (Please refer below table to fill) Photo with cross seal and sign is Mandatory(attached both Pdf and word format)
8. Company PAN with seal and sign
Note: Please share the above documents with Company authorized sign & stamp on each pages.
Page No. 1
Form Serial No. Header Name Need to Fill
1 Existing No’s/IDs Mention LSI ID
2 New services opted tick on lease line
3 Fill organization details. | Organization name, designation, billing address, city/village name, landmark, pin code, mobile & telephone number
4 Contact details Contact person name, designation, address, city/village, landmark, email id & mobile number
6 Others Tick on others
25 Read the declaration Customer signature require (Authorized person)
26 Place & Date Fill the details

Page No. 2 Terms and Conditions

19 Read the declaration Customer signature require (Authorized person)
Applicant's name Fill the details
Designation Fill the details
Place & Date Fill the details

Note: Please make sure company authorized sign & stamp is mandatory over the photo in Master CAF

Regards

Anusha U

Relationship Manager

MOB - 8925903461
https://www.airtel.in/business/thanksforbusiness/login/

Airtel enterprise Hub Login : https://www.airtel.in/business/enterprise-hub/login/

Level-0 Level-1 Level-2 Level-3
Support Desk (24*7) Relationship Manager Team Leader Process Manager
Data support Anusha U Manjunath N Chidu H
datasupport@airtel.com | a_Anusha.Ul@airtel.com | a_manjunath.n@airtel.com | a_Chidu.H@airtel.com
1800102001 8925903461 8925901371 7418625558
https://www.airtel.in/business/thanksforbusiness/login/
Service
Assurance
Escalation Escalation Level 0 ( 7 x 24) Escalation Level 1 ( 7 x 24) Escalation Level 2 (7 x 24) Escalation Level 3 (7 x 24) | Escalation Level 4 (7 x 24)
Matrix (0-1 Hrs.) (0-2 Hrs.) (2-4 Hrs.) (4-8 Hrs.)
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Desk Support Desk Service Manager's Desk Operation Head's Desk Service Operation Center Network Operation Center
(SOC) Head's Desk (NOC) Head's Desk
For Unmanaged Services:
Mobile Toll Free: 1800 102 001 85278 12323 8448519145 70420 00229 73034 97037
Toll No: +91 124 460 9696 For Managed Services:
96677 98080
For Unmanaged Services:
. head.smb@airtel.com
Email se?\?itczsduei’ﬁg%m service.manager@airtel.com For Managed Services: b2b.sochead@airtel.com noc.head@airtel.com
dutymanager.mnoc@airtel.com
enoc.smb@airtel.com

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>

Sent: 08 November 2024 14:30

To: Anusha U <a_Anusha.Ul@airtel.com>
Cc: Manjunath N <a_manjunath.n@airtel.com>; Sunil V <sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com>; Bangalore IT <bangalore.it@blrlounge.in>
Subject: Re: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

[CAUTION: External Email] Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Anusha,

Any update on these changes, we will not accept any more invoice in the name of Blr Lounge services Pvt Ltd.

Customer Account Number 31-21116784
Circuit ID - 13212986

Best Regards,

Senthil Raj P.

Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Pvt Ltd.

© +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

*Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised*

T1 - Help Desk : 2 bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | @ +91 865 754 1674

T2 - Help Desk :# sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

For IT-related Support: Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.
Self Service : Asset Infinity

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@blrlounge.in>

Sent: Saturday, September 28, 2024 12:02 PM
To: Anusha U <a_Anusha.Ul@airtel.com>

Cc: Manjunath N <a_manjunath.n@airtel.com>

Subject: BLR Lounge - Merger with TFSPL (TRAVEL FOOD SERVICES P LTD)

Dear Sir / Madam,

The Amalgamation of BLR I.ounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge), Travel Food Services Chennai Private Limited (TFSCPL), and

Hon’ble National Company Law Tribunal, Mumbai Bench.

Dear Valued Partner,

1.

BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL had filed a composite scheme of arrangement with the National Company Law Tribunal, (“NCLT”)
in the year 2024 (“Scheme”) for the amalgamation of BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL with TFSPL.

We wish to inform you that the NCLT vide its order dated 28th August 2024 (“Order”) has approved the Scheme, and consequently, BLR
Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL shall stand amalgamated with TFSPL, with TFSPL being the surviving entity. BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and
TFSKPL are wholly owned subsidiaries of TFSPL.

In accordance with the Order, all contracts of BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL shall stand transferred to and vested in TFSPL and be
in full force and effect in favour of TFSPL and may be enforced by or against it as fully and effectually as if, instead of BLR Lounge,
TFSCPL, and TFSKPL had been a party or beneficiary or obliged thereto. Accordingly, all rights and obligations of the parties to the
Agreement continue unaffected post-merger.

As we move forward with this merger, we want to ensure that our partners are apprised of the changes, particularly concerning tax-related

matters. Please take note of the following key points to be undertaken by the business partner from 1st October 2024:

Update the master details including Goods and Services Tax Identification Number (“GSTIN”), Permanent Account Number
(“PAN”), TAN, and Address in your accounting software/system which the team shall communicate in a separate e-mail along with the
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required documents.
Migrate all the open purchase orders (PO) issued by/to BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL to TFSPL on 1st October 2024.
Advances, if any on 1st October 2024 would be settled by TFSPL against the future billing.

Ensure invoices from 1st October 2024 are raised in the name of TFSPL. In case invoices are issued after 1st October 2024 in the
name of BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL or have incorrect details of TFSPL then such invoices would be invalid.

Please note that from 1st October 2024, all the invoices which were earlier raised by BLR Lounge, TFSCPL, and TFSKPL shall be
raised by TFSPL with GST charged and booked accordingly.

Please note that from 1st October 2024, the payments will be made by TFSPL and accordingly, a Lower tax Deduction Certificate
(LTDC) (if any) should be made available, in the name of TFSPL. Accordingly, we request you to share the fresh or amended LTDC
Certificate in the name of TFSPL for the Financial Year 2024-25. In case LTDC is not provided, TFSPL would have to deduct taxes at
normal rates.

Kindly submit all the invoices pertaining to the supplies made to TFSPL till 31st August 2024 immediately and all invoices for
September 2024 within 3 days of rendering/delivering of service/goods.

In case of any concerns or if you require further information, please feel free to reach out to us.

We are committed to making this transition as smooth as possible. We are confident that this merger will enable us to offer even more value to our
partnerships and we look forward to your continued support. We appreciate your cooperation in this regard.

Best Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | BLR Lounge Services Pvt Ltd.
© +91 - 9789079708 | © www.travelfoodservices.com

*Minimal IT Support to be provided without incidents raised*

T1 - Help Desk :# bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

T2 - Help Desk :# sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

For IT-related Support: Please raise an incident/ticket using the links provided below.
Self Service : Asset Infinity

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKADNjOGJmMYWMOLTZKZJEtNDM5MyThNTgxLTlyNGU 1MjA10TQOOQAQAEGAGVbX%2BMpCv3Cs9Lxfxy8%3D

5/5



