12/4/24, 6:28 PM Mail - Senthil Raj P - Outlook

ﬁ Outlook

RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to
Travel Food Services

From Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Date Wed 11/27/2024 3:44 PM

To Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS
<invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc  Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath
R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

0 2 attachments (334 KB)
PRI_Oct'24_3016042317_8066787373_old.pdf; Service Interruption;

Dear Parag
Request you please help because again name changed from TFSPL to TFSLTD.

We will process the name change procedure once the agreement and other documents received from Legal team.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:24 PM

To: Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices TFS <invoices@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Samrat Narvekar
<samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury <rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav
Singaraju <venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso
<corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Parag,
I am uploading the attached invoice in the Safal , please account and process the invoice.

Note : I have enclosed the service interruption mail as too.
Regards,

Senthil Raj P.
Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | @ www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : £ bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : £ sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:15 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
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<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
Please process the invoices and clear the outstanding payment.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 2:04 PM

To: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso
<corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>; Venu Madhav Singaraju
<venu.singaraju@travelfoodservices.com>; Manjunath R <manjunath.r@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Hi Prabhakar,
Yes, it's a time-consuming process , already 7 days overdue. How about move on with the pending invoice payment
clearance ? It may lead to link disconnection.

Appreciated if you could be able to manage with ISP service providers ( Tata and Airtel).
Regards,

Senthil Raj P.

Sr.Manager - IT | Travel Food Services Limited
© +91 - 9789079708 | & www.travelfoodservices.com

BLR T1 - Help Desk : £ bangalore.it@blrlounge.in | © +91 865 754 1674

BLR T2 - Help Desk : £ sunil.v@travelfoodservices.com | © +91 973 822 2927

From: Prabhakar Sawant <prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 1:56 PM

To: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>; Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
<rohan.choudhury@travelfoodservices.com>; Parag Pandey <parag.pandey@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: TATA : Documents required for Transfer of ownership---BLR Lounge Services Private Limited (BLR Lounge) to Travel
Food Services

Dear Senthil,
Please wait because now company name has changed from TFSPL to TFSLtd.

Regards
Prabhakar

From: Senthil Raj P <senthilraj.p@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 12:51 PM

To: Rochelle Alphonso <corporate.admin@travelfoodservices.com>; Prabhakar Sawant
<prabhakar.sawant@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Samrat Narvekar <samrat.narvekar@travelfoodservices.com>; Rohan Choudhury
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