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nai Intern t
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PARTY -
v ST 21AADCB2762L1ZU VENDORCODE | |
PE - REGULAR
STATE CODE 21
YOUR PO. No - SATE [
TR — TO COST OF CALIBRATION ONLY . 2
| SL.NO | UANTITY RATE EACH ( AMOUNT (%)
SL.NO PARTICULARS Q ®) -
. Display Chiller 3.00 750.00 2250.00
2 Beverage Chiller 8.00 750.00 6000.00
® Under Counter Chiller 14.00 750.00 10500.00
4 Vertical Chiller 3.00 750.00 2250.00
B Vertical Freezer 3.00 750.00 2250.00
6 Deep Freezer 1.00 750.00 750.00
7 Digital Thermometer 14.00 550.00 7700.00
8 IR Thermometer 1.00 750.00 750.00
OUR GST NO 19AFPPP4437C127 SUB TOTAL 7 32,450.00
PAN NO AFPPP4437C DISCOUNT | %
SAC 998346 SUB TOTAL AFTER DISCOUNT % 32,450.00
[~ URC NO UDYAM-WB-10-0011181
TOTAL TAXABLE VALUE 7 32,450.00
BANK NAME PUNJAB NATIONAL BANK CGST %
W 01451010010330 SGST %
IFSC PUNB0014510 1GST 18 % 7 5,841.00
| IFSC |
TRAVELLING/COURIER CHARGES, % 3,000.00
(GST Exempted)
Mw) -X TOTAL INVOICE VALUE IN FIGURE L 03:1,291‘00
Rupees Forty oné thousand two hundred ninety one only MEA URE TECHNO LAB
| L A%
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32 h Chandra Avenue

8th Floor, Kolkata-700013



Re: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>
Wed 6/5/2024 11:55 AM

To:Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>;Invoices Kolkata
<invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc:Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>;Aparna Das Saha <aparna.saha@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Avirup,

Please process all invoices of Measure Techno Lab
Thanks & Regards

Shruti Shroff

Senior Manager-Finance
TFS Kolkata

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 5, 2024 11:53 AM

To: Shruti Shroff <shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>; Invoices Kolkata
<invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Aparna Das Saha
<aparna.saha@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Dear Mam & Abhi
Please don’t hold the payment .. fyip

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Sent: 05 June 2024 11:49

To: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Jigna Sosa
<jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Bhubaneswar QA <bhubaneswar.qa@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-
corp.in>

Subject: RE: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Aratrika

Vendor has confirm against the rate on date 1% of June for

@Sudipto sir
for the same we have created the contract of renewal and it will be share for the approval with management
today EOD



Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 5, 2024 11:46 AM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>
Cc: Bhubaneswar QA <bhubaneswar.qa@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Hi Heramb

This was communicated to you on 20t April, provided long time and expecting fast closure. The

Agreement is as expected already gets expired and finance is about to hold the payment henceforth. Hope you
understand that these all are statutory requisites and we cannot hold the work because of negotiation delays .
Please close this and share a timeline from your end .

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Sent: 01 June 2024 13:55

To: Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchasel_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Bhubaneswar QA <bhubaneswar.qga@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Subject: RE: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Jigna

We ask vendor for the share confirmation for renewal on same rate as per the last rate,
Once we received the same will send this with management for approval .

Thanks & Regards

Heramb

9702415737

From: Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Saturday, June 1, 2024 1:46 PM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane




<mumbai.purchasel_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Bhubaneswar QA <pbhubaneswar.qga@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>
Subject: Re: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Hi Heram,

Please update on this

Regards,
Jigna

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Sent: 07 May 2024 11:28

To: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchasel_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhubaneswar QA
<bhubaneswar.qa@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Aratrika
Will update you contract before renewal date 1-6-2024

regards
Herambraj

Get Outlook for i0S

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 7, 2024 10:52:28 AM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhubaneswar QA
<bhubaneswar.qa@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon <|ovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Hi Heramb
Gentle reminder to update

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya

Sent: 20 April 2024 15:14

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel_kcorp@travelfoodservices.onmicrosoft.com>
Cc: Jigna Sosa <jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>; Bhubaneswar QA




<bhubaneswar.ga@travelfoodservices.com>
Subject: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata & Bhubaneswar

Dear Heram
MTL agreement is near to expiry, kindly initiate to renew the same

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Sent: 22 May 2023 12:08

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Aratrika Roy
Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Jigna Sosa
<jigna.sosa@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment - Kolkata

Dear sir

Please approve Renewal of CALIBERATION OF INSTRUMENTS IN KOLKATA.

Service Provider : MEASURE TECHNO LAB,

Location : Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd. , 83 NSCBI Airport, Kolkata — 700052..

Note — No changes in rate, Quote consider same as per last agreement .

Tenure :01/06/2022-31/5/2024

SCOPE OF SERVICE CONTRACT
e (Calibration of Equipments once in a year l.e., For Refrigerated Equipments, Digital Thermometer,
Weighing scales
e  Equipments should be calibrated once in Year
Calibration parameters should be as per the National Accreditation Board for Testing and Calibration
Laboratories

Detailed Scope of Accreditation is Provided by MEASURE TECHNO LAB separately & should adhere to
these parameters

Commercial _Terms:

L Rate In Rs
Description (Per Unit) Remarks
Chiller: 0to 5°C 750 Calibration
Digital Thermometer 550 Calibration
Freezer. (-)18°C to o
(-)23°C 750 Calibration
I Calibration up to
Weighing Balance 1000 100 kg




Note : NABL Symbol to be provided as per our NABL Scope

GST extra would be applicable on above rates.

Service Frequency :

Equipments shall be Calibrated Once in a year, Schedule & Quantity of Equipments shall be shared by TFSPL QA
team.

Terms & Conditions

e Contract period 01/06/2022 — 31/5/2024
e The service cost is inclusive of the freightcharges for throughout the year for Bhubaneshwar
Location.
Payment to be remitted after submission of Approved Invoice, to be submitted along with the detail

Thanks & Regards
Heramb

9702415737



