(ORIGINAL FOR RECIPIENT)

@ Measure Techno Lab

ISO/IEC : 17025 : 2017 ACCREDITED CALIBRATION LABORATORY. Mobile : 98311 90974

REGD. OFFICE : 32A, GANESH CHANDRA AVENUE, (8TH FLOOR), KOLKATA-700 013 ~ Lab Ph : 8100143376 _
LAB : 2, B. T. ROAD (JAYANTI CINEMA COMPLEX), BARRACKPORE, KOLKATA - 700 120 E-ma" : measuretechno@yahoo.co.in

‘www.measuretechnolab.org -mail : info@measuretechnolab.org
Ref. NO. ..occoeenercsisnanesiaenns Date ........ceorvevsvnanenirenns
Invoice No- MTL/448/24-25 TAX INVOICE DATE 24.07.2024

To,

M/s. Travel Food Services Pvt.Ltd.
New Domestic Terminal Building
Biju Patnaik International Airport
Odisha -~ 751020

PARTY GST- 21AADCB2762L12U VENDOR CODE |

TYPE - REGULAR

STATE CODE___ |21

YOUR PO. No - DATE |

TO COST OF CALIBRATION ONLY
UANTITY TE EACH R MOUNT
SL.NO PARTICULARS QUAN RA © AMOUNT ()
1 Under Counter Chiller 8.00 750.00 6000.00
Y

'Y
ﬁ,@

OUR GST NO 19AFPPP4437C127 SUB TOTAL 6000.00
PAN NO AFPPP4437C DISCOUNT | | %
SAC 998346 SUB TOTAL AFTER DISCOUNT 6000.00
URC NO UDYAM-WB-10-0011181
TOTAL TAXABLE VALUE 6000.00
BANK NAME PUNJAB NATIONAL BANK CGST %
CURRENT A/C 01451010010330 SGST %
IFSC PUNB0014510 IGST 18 % 1080.00
TOTAL INVOICE VALUE (IN WORD) -X TOTAL INVOICE VALUE IN FIGURE 7080.00
E. &. O.E.
Rupees Seven thousand eighty only MEASDIRE T HNO\&

FEORNO LAB




FW: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment

Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>
Mon 4/24/2023 1:03 PM

To: Invoices Kolkata <invoices.kolkata@travelfoodservices.com>;Shruti Shroff
<shruti.shroff@travelfoodservices.com>;Aparna Das Saha <aparna.saha@travelfoodservices.com>;Sudesna
Mandal <sudesna.mandal@travelfoodservices.com>;Mukesh Mourya
<mukesh.mourya@travelfoodservices.com>

Dear Team
Please find the approval on calibration

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 24 April 2023 11:20

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>;
Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>; Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: Re: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment

Okay with me
Best,

Gaurav Dewan
+91 96655 15000

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Date: Friday, 21 April 2023 at 5:53 PM

To: Gaurav Dewan <gaurav.dewan@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <|ovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>, Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>, Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel @k-
corp.in>, Chandan Kumar Das <chandan.das@travelfoodservices.com>, Sudipto Bose
<sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: Renewal of Agreements of Calibration of Equipment

Dear sir,

Please approve Renewal of CALIBERATION OF INSTRUMENTS in Kolkata .

Service Provider : MEASURE TECHNO LAB,
Location : Travel Food Services Kolkata Pvt Ltd. , 83 NSCBI Airport, Kolkata — 700052.
Note — No changes in rate , Quote consider same as per last agreement .

Tenure :01/06/2022 -31/5/2024



SCOPE OF SERVICE CONTRACT

o Calibration of Equipments once in a year l.e., For Refrigerated Equipments, Digital Thermometer,
Weighing scales

¢ Equipments should be calibrated once in Year

o Calibration parameters should be as per the National Accreditation Board for Testing and Calibration
Laboratories

e Detailed Scope of Accreditation is Provided by MEASURE TECHNO LAB separately & should adhere to these
parameters

e Commercial Terms:

o Rate In Rs

Description (Per Unit) Remarks
Chiller: 0to5°C 750 Calibration
Digital Thermometer 550 Calibration
Freezer: (-)18°C to I
(-)23°C 750 Calibration

- Calibration up to
Weighing Balance 1000 100 kg

Note : NABL Symbol to be provided as per our NABL Scope

GST extrawould be applicable on above rates.

Service Frequency :

Equipments shall be Calibrated Once in a year, Schedule & Quantity of Equipments shall be shared by TFSKPL QA
team.

Terms & Conditions

¢ Contract period 01/06/2022 —31/5/2024
e The service cost is inclusive of the freight charges for throughout the year for Kolkata Location.

° Payment to be remitted after submission of Approved Invoice, to be submitted along with the
detail service report signed off by Maintenance Incharge & General Manager Business, IN WITNESS
WHEREOF, the parties have hereuntoset theirrespective hands to these presents on the day,

month and vyear first above written.

Regards

Herambraj



9702415737

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 9:50 AM

To: Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Lovejot Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya
<aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: Delayed responses on Renewal of Agreements

Please close this today

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 21 April 2023 09:48

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Delayed responses on Renewal of Agreements

Dear Sandeep
Calibration Agreement is still awaited

Rgrds Aratrika

From: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>

Sent: 12 April 2023 13:05

To: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>; Herambraj Sonawane
<mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>

Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: RE: Delayed responses on Renewal of Agreements

Dear Aratika,

Apologies for the delayed response , we were tied up with multiple projects , we will close this latest by Friday
14 April .

From: Aratrika Roy Bhattacharya <aratrika.roybhattacharya@travelfoodservices.com>

Sent: 12 April 2023 12:58

To: Sandeep Bhat <sandeep.bhat@k-corp.in>; Herambraj Sonawane <mumbai.purchasel@k-corp.in>
Cc: Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Sanjeev Mishra
<sanjeev.mishra@travelfoodservices.com>; Lovejot Sekhon <|lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>

Subject: Delayed responses on Renewal of Agreements

Importance: High

Dear Sandeep & Heram
Agreements and PRs are pending and some are pending from January . This is really getting delayed , any specific
reason and can we expedite the same?



Subject Sent To Sent On Status

RE: Agreement Required for FOOD TESTING LAB Sandeep 12.01.2023 Pending
(VIMTA )-Bhubaneswar / Kolkata

Agreement Renewal (Measure Techno Lab ) Sandeep 12.01.2023 Pending
Kolkata+BBI - Calibration

Purchase Requisition Form- Food Water Test- Heram 01.04.2023 Pending
Guwahati

Regards,
Aratrika| QA | 9831694109

CELEBRATING
Creating memories and inspiring
happiness through food, since 1972
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