Nimisha Jadhav

From: Nazrul Mondal <nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>

Sent: 20 September 2024 11:02

To: Nimisha Jadhav

Cc: Chandan Kumar Das; binu.balachandran; Sudipto Bose; Mrunal Joshi; Lovejot Sekhon Kcorp; Shama Nair
Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :TFSKPL/PO/24-25/000083

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Approved.

On Fri, 20 Sept, 2024, 10:08 am Nimisha Jadhav, <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com> wrote:

Dear Nazrul,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further .

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav.



From: Nimisha Jadhav

Sent: 18 September 2024 16:15

To: 'Nazrul Mondal' <nazrulmondal.84 @gmail.com>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>; Lovejot Sekhon
Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: RE: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :TFSKPL/PO/24-25/000083

Dear Nazrul ,

Kindly approve attached invoice to process further .

Thanks & Regards,

Nimisha Jadhav.

From: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Sent: 18 September 2024 16:09

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: binu.balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' <nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon Kcorp <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :TFSKPL/PO/24-25/000083




CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Nimisha Ji,

PFA the approved Invoice copy and challans from The Work Station which is approved by the site team for Sofa Chair Repair at Domestic Airport KOL.
Kindly take it further for final payment.
Note- Vendor did not get the advance payment for this yet.

Thanks.

Regards,

Mrunal.

From: Mrunal Joshi

Sent: 18 September 2024 13:42

To: Nimisha Jadhav <nimisha.jadhav@travelfoodservices.com>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>; Sudipto Bose <sudipto.bose@travelfoodservices.com>; 'Nazrul Mondal' <nazrulmondal.84@gmail.com>; Lovejot
Sekhon <lovejot.sekhon@k-corp.in>; Shama Nair <shama.nair@travelfoodservices.com>

Subject: FW: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :TFSKPL/PO/24-25/000083

Hi Nimisha Ji,



PFA the approved Invoice copy and challans from The Work Station which is approved by the site team for Sofa Chair Repair at Domestic Airport KOL.
Kindly take it further for final payment.
Note- Vendor did not get the advance payment for this yet.

Thanks.

Regards,

Mrunal.

From: THE WORK STATION INC <workstationevents@gmail.com>

Sent: 12 September 2024 12:33

To: Mrunal Joshi <mrunal.joshi@k-corp.in>

Cc: Binu Balachandran <binu.balachandran@k-corp.in>

Subject: Re: E-Sourcing : K Hospitality Corp :: Purchase Order is Confirmed for PO NO :TFSKPL/PO/24-25/000083

Respected Sir,

please check the attached bill with supportings.

B bill-018.pdf



On Wed, Jul 24, 2024 at 1:21 PM <procuresens@safalsoftcom.com> wrote:

M/S The Work Station Inc
Dear Sir / Madam,

Your Purchase Order is now Confirmed.Please Select Option..

PO Details as below
PO Number

PO Date
PO Value

Buyer Name

AccpetfRegret

Best Regards,

Procurement Department

K

HOSPI

ALl

TFSKPL/PO/24-
25/000083

18/07/2024
397081.80

Binu
Balachandran



K Hospitality Corp
1 Rashid Mansion, Worli Point, Mumbai - 400018, India

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply back to this email ID. You are advised to login to K Hospitality Corp for details. We
recommend making your Password confidential as confidentiality is completely supplier’s responsibility.

Thanks & Regards

The Work Station Inc.
Events & Media Studio.
Office no : 033-6555-5698/85

Email : workstationevents@gmail.com

Corporate Office - 130 Basanta Lal Saha Road, Kolkata 700-053

New Alipur (Near South City Garden)

Branch Office : 5, Russa Road South 2nd Lane, Kolkata - 700-033 .

(Near M R Bangur Hospital)






